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Abstract Social support is a key resource to predict job
satisfaction. Yet little research has examined learned ben-
efits in the process of receiving social support from work
domain. Drawing from the role conflict and accumulation
framework, we propose social support from domain can
increase job satisfaction by (1) providing resources that
can attenuate work-to-family conflict and (2) activating
employees to learn from received support that can enhance
work-to-family facilitation. To test the proposed theoretical
model, we collected empirical data from 171 full-time em-
ployees in China. The empirical results partially supported
our two mediator model. As predicted, social support in-
creases job satisfaction through enhancing work-to-family
facilitation. However, work-to-family conflict can not me-
diate the relationships between social support and job sat-
isfaction. Contrasting effect analysis indicated the mediat-
ing effect of work-to-family conflict is significantly weaker
than that of work-to-family facilitation between social sup-
port and job satisfaction. We discuss the implications for
designing support systems in organizations.
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Introduction

With the growing numbers of dissatisfied employees towards
work in the past decades, scholars and managers are seeking
effective ways to really help organizations (Kossek et al.
2011). In the review of work–family research, social support,
defined as the perception that one is cared for, esteemed, and
part of a mutually supportive social network (Taylor 2011), is
seen as a pivot factor in organizations to improve employees’
job satisfaction (Adams et al. 1996; Ferguson et al. 2012).

One of prevalent perspectives is that organizations should
provide sufficient family care (i.e., work–family policies). The
organizational programs designed to assist employees’ family
roles (e.g., parenting, elder care, education, and self-care) can
greatly increase their commitments to organizations (Ryan
and Kossek 2008). However, recent surveys report a signifi-
cant decrease in the implementation of work–family policies
(Shellenbarger 2008; Society for Human Resource
Management 2010), meaning that organizational policies can
not reach the expected outcomes. The major reason is the
difficulties to effectively implement these support systems in
organizations (Kossek et al. 2011).

In addition to the perspectives that focus on family
care, we have noticed that social support associated with
work-related affairs can also effectively increase em-
ployees’ job satisfaction. For instance, many studies show
social support can stimulate employees to learn from re-
ceived support and transfer learned skills and perspectives
into family domain, thereby enhancing employees’ appre-
ciation of their jobs (Greenhaus and Powell 2006; Haas
1999; McCauley et al. 1994). Therefore, reexamining the
beneficial effects of social support from work domain and
investigating the potential mechanisms on how this sup-
port improves job satisfaction can provide a novel and
useful lens to better help organizations.
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Drawing on the role conflict and accumulation framework
(Greenhaus and Beutell 1985; Greenhaus and Powell 2006),
we conclude that there are two beneficial effects of social
support fromwork domain which can increase job satisfaction
via work-to-family conflict and facilitation respectively.
Work-to-family conflict represents the role conflict arising
from the difficulty in participation in the family domain due
to the demands of participation in the work domain
(Greenhaus and Beutell 1985). While work-to-family facilita-
tion describes the degree to which family role is made easier
by the experience, skills, and opportunities employees gained
or developed at work (Frone 2003).

To note, work–family interface is bidirectional and its di-
mensions have distinct impacts on the outcomes (Frone et al.
1997; Shockley and Singla 2011). According tosource attribu-
tion theory (Shockley and Singla 2011), work-to-family con-
flict and facilitation are expected more related to job satisfac-
tion than family-to-work constructs be, because employees are
more likely to blame the work role which causes work-to-
family conflict and appreciate the sending role who produces
benefits that enhance work-to-family facilitation. Meta-
analysis also suggests affective consequences like job satis-
faction are particularly consistent with source attribution the-
ory (Amstad et al. 2011; Shockley and Singla 2011). We thus
adopt work-to-family conflict and facilitation as two underly-
ing mechanisms to investigate how social support from work
domain affects job satisfaction.

We contribute to work–family research by providing new
and useful lens to look at job satisfaction. Compared with
adding extra resources which are costly to implement (e.g.,
work–family policies), we shed light on the necessity to opti-
mize social support per se. We argue that utilizing support
from work domain can reduce work-to-family conflict
(Cheuk and Wong 1995; Cohen and Wills 1985; Eng et al.
2010). Importantly, we suggest that activating employees’ in-
trinsic motivation to learn from received support for work-to-
family facilitation can also strenthen employees’ positive eval-
uation towards organizations.

Cultural norm plays a key role in the work–family relation-
ships. We develop a culture-based hypothesis to compare dif-
ferent mediating effects of work-to-family conflict and facili-
tation and test the hypothesis with data from China, an area
that has been understudied as a collectivist country. China in
recent years has been the world’s most dynamic economy and
is now undergoing an unprecedented economic transforma-
tion. This shift from a planned economy to a market-
oriented economy accelerates the eradication of lifelong em-
ployment contracts which dominated in the past few decades
(Joplin et al. 2003). On the one hand, the emerging job inse-
curity motivates men to get more involved in the work times
and more social activities after work, leading to increased
complaints from their spouses. On the other hand, women
begin to seek job opportunities to earn more money for their

extended families, resulting in more incompatibility between
work and family roles. Unlike western countries, the culture
factor such as Confucianism in China produces significantly
different work–family perception and responses. Therefore,
testing theories based onWestern samples in Eastern countries
can provide an excellent opportunity to add knowledge of the
present theories1.

Theory and Hypotheses

Mediating Effects of Work-to-Family Conflict

The role conflict and accumulation framework helps explain
why social support from work domain increase job satisfac-
tion via work-to-family conflict and facilitation. Role conflict
assumes that individuals who participate in multiple roles
(e.g., work and family) inevitably experience conflicts be-
cause of the limited resources (Greenhaus and Beutell 1985).
While role accumulation states individuals experience in one
role can produce positive outcomes in the other role
(Greenhaus and Powell 2006).

We argue social support from work domain can reduce
work-to-family conflict in the following ways. First, social
support from work domain can provide the instrumental sup-
port that directly mitigates limited resources in coping with
overly work demands. Because employees have limited re-
sources to deal with work and family demands, role pressure
arises when employees perceive insufficient time and energies
to meet work demands. As a key resource, social support from
work domain makes it easier for employees to fulfill work
requirements by providing instrumental aids to attenuate the
threat of work-to-family conflict. For example, social support
related to work-related duties makes job responsibility clearer
and allows employees to focus on effectively accomplishing
organizational goals. Information assistance such as perfor-
mance feedback and job experience facilitate communication
between leaders and subordinates and strengthen problem-
solving abilities in the work domain.

Second, emotional care as a form of social support from
work domain cultivates employees’ positive affect (e.g., pa-
tience and confidence). Strain-based work-to-family conflict
is a major type of pressure (Greenhaus and Beutell 1985). We
demonstrate that supervisors’ emotional support such as en-
couragement and appreciation can fulfil the need for belong-
ingness and attenuates the strain from work domain (Cohen
and Wills 1985; Crawford et al. 2010). In addition, supervi-
sors’ listening and discussing work-related problems suppress
emotion-focused forms of coping and activate problem-
focused coping strategies to deal with work demands
(Lazarus and Folkman 1984). Emotional care mitigates the

1 The authors thank anonymous reviewers for this suggestion.
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feeling of tension, anxiety and fatigue and stimulates em-
ployees’ commitments to their organizations, thereby transfer-
ring less strain to family domain. Strong evidence from meta-
analysis indicates social support from work domain has a neg-
ative relationship with work-to-family conflict (Byron 2005;
Michel et al. 2011).

With reduced work-to-family conflict, social support from
work domain increases job satisfaction, which represents over-
all evaluation on their jobs (Judge and Kammeyer-Mueller
2012). Due to fixed resources to manage multiple roles, work-
to-family conflict occurs when work demands make family
requirements difficult to be met. As described above, social
support fromwork domain provides instrumental aids and emo-
tional care to attenuate the time-based and strain-based conflict
between work and family roles. When employees perceive or-
ganizational support can mitigate work pressure, they lessen
their feelings of resentment and produce positive attitudes to-
wards their jobs (Buonocore and Russo 2013). In line with this
perspective, three meta-analyses on work–family interface sup-
ported the negative relationships between work-to-family con-
flict and job satisfaction (Allen et al. 2000; Shockley and Singla
2011; Amstad et al. 2011). We therefore hypothesize:

Hypothesis 1. Work-to-family conflict mediates the pos-
itive relationship between social support from work do-
main and job satisfaction.

Mediating Effects of Work-to-Family Facilitation

The role accumulation perspective supposes that multiple
roles can achieve positive outcomes in both work and family
domains (Powell and Greenhaus 2010; Lazarova et al. 2010).
That is, the useful social support employees have acquired in
work domain (i.e., skills, behaviors, attitudes or positive
mood) can increase the performance in family domain. Social
support from work domain can strengthen work-to-family fa-
cilitation through two paths. First, support is expected to di-
rectly enhance the work-to-family facilitation. When em-
ployees learn skills and perspectives from supervisors’ guid-
ance and apply them into family domain, they can use these
resources to better balance work–family relationships and en-
hance managerial effectiveness in family domain. For exam-
ple, the ability in dealing with complex jobs stimulate leader-
ship skills development and thus enhance parenting at home
(Haas 1999; McCauley et al. 1994).

Second, social support from work domain can stimulate
positive affect that indirectly enhances work-to-family facili-
tation. When employees receive organizational resources,
they generate positive affect which is supposed to be trans-
ferred into family domain, because employees perceive orga-
nizational support as an indication of the organization’s intent,
viewing favorable or unfavorable treatment as a judgment of
whether the organization values their contributions and cares

about their well-being (Aselage and Eisenberger 2003). The
caring, approval, and respect induced by social support from
work domain fulfill employees’ socioemotional needs, leading
to heightened positive mood in their work roles (Rhoades and
Eisenberger 2002). A positive mood thus can suppress self-
focused orientation, expand level of energy andmotivate more
proactive behaviors in the family domain (Rothbard 2001). In
addition, the resilience and confidence learned from work en-
able employees to effective tackle with family chores.

Work-to-family facilitation can explain why social support
from work domain increase job satisfaction. When skills and
positive affect learned from work domain are applied into
family domain, employees will attribute their increased effi-
ciency in the family domain to the work domain which leads
to job satisfaction (Baral and Bhargava 2010). This is consis-
tent with reciprocity norm, employees who perceive organi-
zational support benefits their family life will feel obligated to
reciprocate toward the organization in the form of more favor-
able attitudes (Rhoades and Eisenberger 2002; Allen and
Shanock 2013). In addition, meta-analysis showed work-to-
family facilitation can positively predict job satisfaction
(McNall et al. 2010). Formally, we hypothesize:

Hypothesis 2. Work-to-family facilitation mediates the
positive relationship between social support from work
domain and job satisfaction.

Comparing the Mediating Effects of Work-to-Family
Conflict and Facilitation

We argue the mediating effect of work-to-family conflict is
weaker than work-to-family facilitation in Chinese context2.
As mental programming which represents the patterns of
thinking, feeling and acting, culture affects people’s percep-
tion and responses to work-to-family interface (Hofstede et al.
2010). We draw on the individualism-collectivism dimension
to develop our hypothesis, because it plays an important role
in treating work–family relationships (Yang et al. 2000). As
defined by Hofstede et al. (2010), individualism pertains to
societies where everyone is expected to care themselves, while
collectivism pertains to societies in which people care and
keep loyalty to their groups they belong to. Contrasting the
Western countries, China is a collectivist country, whose Indi-
vidualism Index Values ranked 58 among 76 Countries and
Regions in Hofstede’s research (Hofstede et al. 2010). We
suppose the mediating effect work-to-family conflict between
social support from work domain and job satisfaction de-
creases, whereas the mediating effect of work-to-family facil-
itation increases in Chinese context.

First, we argue that employees less attribute work-to-family
conflict to their jobs. Although job demands exacerbate work-

2 The authors thank anonymous reviewers for this suggestion.
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to-family conflict, but they can meet their obligations for fam-
ily requirements. The work in China is seen as self-sacrifices
for the welfare of the family (Yang et al. 2000). Many Chinese
employees even actively spend additional work hours to strive
for family honor and prosperity (Redding and Wong 1986).
Meanwhile, staying loyal to their organizations makes Chinese
employees accept the reality of overly job demands (Hofstede
et al. 2010). For example, Buonocore and Russo (2013) find
that the affective commitment attenuates the negative relation-
ship between work–family conflict and job satisfaction. There-
fore, although social support from work domain reduces the
conflict between work and family roles, employees will not
increase expected changes of job satisfaction. We also find
work in China is used for developing and maintaining inter-
personal relationships (Hofstede et al. 2010). For example,.
Chinese people tend to use guanxi to develop business and
facilitate their family life. The benefits of expanding interper-
sonal relationships counteract the negative effect of work-to-
family conflict, thereby decreasing the impact of work-to-
family conflict on job satisfaction.

However, job satisfaction can greatly increase when re-
ceived social support from work domain enhances work-to-
family facilitation. As the resources learned from work do-
main, work-to-family facilitation can be seen as organizational
benefits which can be used to increase family performance
and stimulate employees’ feelings of appreciation by organi-
zations. These recognition meets the needs of belongingness
and strengthen employees’ identity as organizational mem-
bers, which play key roles in collectivist countries (Hofstede
et al. 2010). Thus, employees with increased work-to-family
facilitation have stronger positive attitudes towards their job
jobs. We therefore hypothesize:

Hypothesis 3. the mediating effect of work-to-family con-
flict is weaker than that of work-to-family facilitation be-
tween social support fromwork domain and job satisfaction.

We conducted a multiple mediator model to examine the
mediating roles of work-to-family conflict and facilitation be-
tween social support from domain and job satisfaction.
Figure 1 presented our proposed theoretical model of the
key theoretical relationships.

Methods

Research Design and Data Collection

Our study sample was derived from employees of 7 firms in
China. Respondents are married or having a partner living
together, with at least one child under the age of 21 living with
them. We contacted the human resource departments of each
firm to seek their participation, discussed the purposes of the
study, and explained the procedures for implementing the sur-
vey. We coded the questionnaires with preassigned identifica-
tion numbers and administered the pencil-and-paper question-
naires to employees by human resource departments. Com-
pleted questionnaires were returned to us via mail.

Out of 250 questionnaires distributed, 171 usable question-
naires were returned, with a response rate of 68.4 %. For this
sample, 46.8 % of the respondents are male. Job type is la-
beled by “0” (non-managerial, e.g., production workers whose
responsibilities are to process products such as assembling,
testing or packaging) and “1” (managerial). 49.7 % of the
respondents’ job type is managerial. The mean age of respon-
dents is 38.95 years old (standard deviation = 5.16), and the
average education year is 13.43 (standard deviation = 2.92).
Ownership type is labeled by “0” (state-owned firm) and “1”
(private firm) and 76 % of respondents work in state-owned
firms.

Measures

Translation of Measurement Items The measures were sub-
jected to a double translation procedure. The questionnaire
was translated to Chinese through double -translation to verify
that the translation had a high degree of accuracy. A bilingual
professor translated the original version of the questionnaire
into Chinese and another professor and two doctoral students
(all bilingual) translated the Chinese versions into English.
The translated versions were compared for any possible inac-
curacies. Minor translation issues were resolved among the
four translators.

Social Support from Work Domain We adopted four items
developed by Antani and Ayman (2003) to measure social

Social Support from 

Work Domain

Work-to-Family 

Conflict

Work-to-Family 

Facilitation

Job 

Satisfaction

Fig. 1 Proposed theoretical
framework
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support from work domain (1 = never, 4 = frequently). In line
with our proposed model which focused on how social sup-
port in the work domain could affect job satisfaction, this scale
explicitly divided the social support into instrumental and
emotional parts to access the work-related support. Two items
assessed the instrumental support including “How often you
receive support with respect to your work-related
duties”;“How often you receive support with respect to help-
ful work-related information”. The other two items assessed
the emotional support. These items were “How often you
receive support in the form of listening to and discussing
work-related problems”; “How often you receive support with
respect to encouragement/appreciation regarding events in
your work life”. The Cronbach’s alpha reliability coefficient
is 0.88.

Work-to-Family Conflict We used six items developed by
Carlson et al. (2000) to measure work-to-family conflict with
a six-point Likert scale anchored by “1” being “strongly dis-
agree” and “6” being “strongly agree.” For example, the items
include “My work keeps me from my family activities more
than I would like,”; “When I get home from work I am often
too physically tired to participate in family activities/respon-
sibilities”; “I have to miss family activities due to the amount
of time I must spend on work responsibilities”; “Due to all the
pressures at work, sometimes when I come home I am too
stressed to do the things I enjoy”; “The time I must devote
to my job keeps me from participating in household responsi-
bilities and activities”; and “I am often so emotionally drained
when I get home from work that it prevents me from contrib-
uting to my family”. The Cronbach’s alpha reliability coeffi-
cient is 0.73.

Work-to-Family Facilitation We adopted three items from
Grzywacz and Marks (2000) to measure work-to-family facil-
itation. The items were composed of: “The things you do at
workmake you a more interesting person at home”; “Having a
good day on your job makes you a better companion when
you get home.” and “The skills you use on your job are useful
for things you have to do at home”. Five-point Likert scale
was used, anchored by “1” being “never” and “5” being “all of
the time.” The Cronbach's alpha reliability coefficient is 0.89.

Job Satisfaction Two items from Hackman and Oldham
(1975) were used. Respondents were asked to indicate their
agreement to the items: “I am generally satisfied with the kind
of work I do in my present job” and “Generally speaking, I am
very satisfied with my present job” with a six point Likert
scale anchored by “1” being “strongly disagree” and “6” being
“strongly agree”. The Cronbach’s alpha reliability coefficient
is 0.86.

Control Variables We included gender, age, education, job
type and ownership type as control variables. These variables
are correlated with work and family demands and relate to
work-to-family conflict and work-to-family facilitation, and
have been used in other studies as control variables (Hoobler
et al. 2009).

Results

Confirmatory Factor Analyses (CFA)

Before testing the hypotheses, we conducted a confirmatory
factor analysis (CFA) to demonstrate discriminant validity
among our four theoretical variables: social support from
work domain, work-to-family conflict, work-to-family facili-
tation and job satisfaction. We used the commonly accepted
cutoff values (comparative fit index [CFI] > 0.90, root mean
square error of approximation [RMSEA] < 0.08, standardized
root mean squared residual [SRMR] < 0.09) for determining
good fit (Kraimer et al. 2012). We then compared our hypoth-
esized four-factor model to alternative nested models using
the chi-square difference test to determine the best-fitting
model. The CFA results suggested that the hypothesized
four-factor model (CFI = 0.94, RMSEA = 0.07, SRMR =
0.05) yielded a better fit than all models in which one or more
covariances was set equal to one (Δdf=1 to 3; Δχ2=137.27
to 210.11, p<0.001 in all cases), providing support for the
measurement model (see Table 1).

To assess the extent to which common method variance
(CMV) was a concern, we used Harman’s single-factor test,
which combines all items from all of the constructs into one
factor analysis to determine whether the majority of the vari-
ance can be accounted for by a general factor (Podsakoff et al.
2003). The results show that the methods factor explained
23.20 percent of the variance, a level well below the 0.50
cutoff that was suggested as indicating the presence of a single
substantive factor (Hair et al. 1998). These results therefore
suggest that CMV was not a significant biasing source of the
variability in our theoretical variables. Table 2 presents de-
scriptive statistics.

Hypothesis Testing

We followed procedures suggested by Baron and Kenny
(1986) to test the multiple mediator model. As recommended
by Preacher and Hayes (2008), we performed bootstrapping
method to test the indirect and contrasting effects of work-to-
family conflict and facilitation between social support from
work domain and job satisfaction.

Following Baron and Kenny (1986), we first regressed job
satisfaction on social support from work domain and the con-
trol variables. The results presented in Table 3 (Model 4)
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indicated that there was a significant and positive relationship
between social support fromwork domain and job satisfaction
(β=0.17, p<0.05). In the second step, work-to-family conflict
and facilitation were respectively regressed on the control var-
iables and social support from work domain (Model 1 and
Model 2). The results showed that social support from work
domain was significantly and negatively related to work-to-
family conflict (β=−0.17, p<0.05) and significantly and pos-
itively related to work-to-family facilitation (β=0.22,
p<0.01).

To reduce parameter bias owing to omitted variables (Judd
and Kenny 1981), we simultaneously entered work-to-family
conflict and facilitation in a single regression in the third step.
The results (Model 5) indicated that work-to-family facilita-
tion had a significant and positive relationship with job satis-
faction (β=0.30, p<0.01). However, the impact of work-to-

family conflict on job satisfaction was not significant (β=−
0.04, p>0.1). Then job satisfaction was regressed on social
support from work domain, work-to-family conflict and facil-
itation and the control variables in the last step. The results
(Model 6) indicated that the significant relationship between
social support from work domain and job satisfaction became
nonsignificant when the work-to-family conflict and facilita-
tion were entered into the equation (β=0.10, p>0.1). Work-
to-family conflict was not significantly related to job satisfac-
tion (β=− 0.03, p>0.1), whereas work-to-family facilitation
was significantly related to job satisfaction (β=0.28, p<0.01).

To test indirect effect of work-to-family conflict and facil-
itation between social support from work domain and job
satisfaction, we followed bootstrap sampling method recom-
mended by Preacher and Hayes (2008), which avoid problems
of nonnormal sampling distributions that arise when

Table 1 Comparison of
measurement models Factors χ2 df Δχ2 RMSEA CFI SRMR

1 Four factors: social support from work
domain, work-to-family conflict, work-to-
family facilitation and job satisfaction

156.90 85 0.07 0.94 0.05

2 Three factors: work-to-family conflict and
work-to-family facilitation combined into
one factor

294.17 86 137.27** 0.12 0.81 0.09

3 Two factors: social support from work
domain, work-to-family conflict and work-
to-family facilitation combined into one
factor

350.16 87 193.26** 0.13 0.76 0.15

5 Single factor: social support from work
domain, work-to-family conflict, work-to-
family facilitation and job satisfaction into
one factor

367.01 88 210.11** 0.14 0.75 0.05

** p<0.01

Table 2 Means, standard deviations and correlations

Means S.D. 1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8 9

1 Age 38.95 5.16

2 Gendera 0.52 0.50 0.04

3 Educationb 13.43 2.92 −0.14 0.05

4 Job typec 0.49 0.50 0.06 0.06 0.01

5 Ownership typed 0.23 0.42 0.17* 0.13 0.03 0.19*

6 Social support from work domain 2.83 0.79 −0.01 −0.13 0.02 0.23** 0.14 (0.88)

7 Work-to-family conflict 3.31 1.03 −0.09 −0.06 0.05 −0.07 −0.09 −0.16* (0.73)

8 Work-to-family facilitation 2.94 0.76 0.08 −0.02 −0.02 0.04 0.17* 0.23** −0.35** (0.89)

9 Job satisfaction 4.15 1.09 0.25** 0.03 −0.10 0.03 0.19* 0.17* −0.18* 0.35** (0.86)

n=171
aGender (0-male, 1-female)
b Education (year)
c Job type (0-non-managerial, 1 -managerial)
d Ownership type (0 - state-owned firm, 1 - private firm)
* p<0.05; ** p<0.01; Two-tail tests

Numbers in diagonal entries are Cronbach’s alpha reliabilities
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computing products of coefficient tests (MacKinnon et al.
2004). We performed the bootstrap sampling method (boot-
strap sample size =5000) to generate asymmetric confidence
intervals for the product of coefficients and obtain a more
accurate estimation of the indirect relationship. If the 95 %
confidence interval for the parameter estimate do not contain
zero, then the effect is statistically significant. The results re-
ported in Table 4 indicated the indirect effect of work-to-
family conflict between social support from work domain
and job satisfaction was not significant, with the 95 % confi-
dence intervals being (−0.03, 0.07), containing zero. Thus
Hypothesis 1 was not supported. The bootstrapping test
showed the indirect of social support from work domain on
job satisfaction is significant through work-to-family facilita-
tion. The 95 % confidence intervals were (0.02, 0.20), exclud-
ing zero. Therefore, Hypothesis 2 was supported.

Hypothesis 3 proposes the mediating effect of work-
to-family conflict is weaker than the mediating effect
work-to-family facilitation between social support from
work domain. We also performed bootstrapping to gen-
erate asymmetric confidence intervals for difference be-
tween these two indirect effects by using the macro for
SPSS recommended by Preacher and Hayes (2008). In
this case, the difference was estimated by using the
indirect effect through work-to-family conflict minus
specific indirect effect through work-to-family facilita-
tion. The results indicated the difference was significant
with the 95 % confidence intervals being (−0.20,
−0.01), excluding zero. Meanwhile, the results showed
the indirect effects through work-to-family conflict and
facilitation were of the same sign, thus Hypothesis 3
was supported.

Table 3 Results of the
standardized regression analysis
for the mediation of work-to-
family conflict and facilitation
between social support fromwork
domain, job satisfaction

Independent variables Mediator Job satisfaction

WFCa (Model
1)

WFFb (Model
2)

Model
3

Model
4

Model
5

Model
6

Age −0.07 0.06 0.21** 0.22** 0.20** 0.20**

Gender −0.08 −0.01 0.01 0.03 0.02 0.03

Education 0.05 −0.02 −0.08 −0.08 −0.07 −0.07
Job type −0.01 −0.05 −0.02 −0.05 −0.02 −0.04
Ownership type −0.04 0.14 0.16* 0.14 0.18 0.10

Social support from work
domain

−0.17* 0.22** 0.17* 0.10

Work-to-family conflict −0.04 −0.03
Work-to-family facilitation 0.30** 0.28**

R2 0.05 0.08 0.09 0.12 0.19 0.20

Adjusted-R2 0.01 0.05 0.06 0.08 0.15 0.16

F-statistic 1.33 2.32* 3.31** 3.61** 5.40** 5.00**

* p<0.05; ** p<0.01
aWork-to-family conflict
bWork-to-family facilitation

Table 4 Bootstrapped results for
indirect effects of social support
on job satisfaction

Indirect effect BC 95 % CIa

Estimate S.E. Lower Upper

Total indirect effect of social support from work domain 0.10 0.05 0.02 0.22

Unique effect through:

1. Work-to-family conflict 0.01 0.02 −0.03 0.07

2. Work-to-family facilitation 0.09 0.04 0.02 0.20

Contrasting effect:

Work-to-family conflict – Work-to-family facilitation −0.08 0.05 −0.20 −0.01

Estimate refers to the effect estimate using 5000 bootstrap samples
a BC 95 % CI refers to the bias-corrected 95 % confidence interval
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Discussion

This study extends work–family research by examining the
impacts of social support from work domain on job satisfac-
tion via work-to-family interface. In line with the stress relief
view (Viswesvaran et al. 1999; Hauck et al. 2008; Cheuk and
Wong 1995; Michel et al. 2010), our study shows social sup-
port from work domain can directly attenuate work-to-family
conflict. As defined by Lazarus and Folkman (1984), a stress
experience occurs when there is a discrepancy between de-
mands and the availability of resources. Social support as
key resources can eliminate the discrepancy by providing in-
strumental and emotional aids to reduce role pressure incom-
patibility between work and family domain, thereby reducing
stress experience and burnout. However, the nonsignificant
indirect effect of work-to-family conflict between social sup-
port from work domain and job satisfaction indicated that
decreased work-to-family conflict can not increase job satis-
faction. Although this is counter-intuitive, it is consistent with
Spector et al. (2007), whose cross-cultural research showed
the similar weak relationships between work-to-family con-
flict and job satisfaction. They demonstrate that employees in
the collectivistic society might be more likely to keep loyalty
to their organizations and respond this work demands with
greater affiliation.

Our empirical results give evidences that social support
from work domain increase job satisfaction through work-
to-family facilitation. That is, employees who use learned
skills and positive affect to facilitate family performance
can enhance their appreciation on jobs. For instance, pos-
itive affect arising from accomplishment and gratification
in the work domain can transfer to family dynamics, con-
tributing to a more satisfying performance in family do-
main. Guided by norm of reciprocity, perceiving organiza-
tion’s help in managing work and family roles, will pro-
duce positive feelings on their organizations (Wayne et al.
2006; McNall et al. 2009).

Although previous studies have showed that work–family
balance is a potential mechanism to predict outcomes (Jeffrey
H. Greenhaus et al. 2003; Ferguson et al. 2012), our study can
strengthen our understanding of work–family relationships in
the cultural context. Because different culture engenders dif-
ferent work and family identities which produce different
evaluations of work–family balance (Kossek et al. 2011).
For example, some employees work 80 h a week perceive
work–family balance, but others feel work–family balance
only when their work time limits to 40 h per week (Kossek
et al. 2011). Our comparison between the mediating effects of
work-to-family conflict and facilitation indicates that work-to-
family facilitation plays major mediating role between social
support from work domain and job satisfaction in Chinese
context, i.e., the nature of collectivism stimulates Chinese em-
ployees less attribute work-to-family conflict.

From the practical standpoint, our study provides new per-
spectives on support systems in organizations. We recom-
mend that organizations should provide the supports which
focus on teaching someone to do something than to do it for
them. Our findings indicate employees will appreciate their
jobs if support from domain benefits their family life. If skills
and perspectives are learned and applied to strengthen their
family performance, job satisfaction can greatly increase.
Thus, organization should provide sufficient support pro-
grams (e.g., training programs) which can facilitate employees
to learn from receiving support. This is consistent with Chi-
nese proverbs which state, “give a man a fish and you feed
him for a day; teach a man to fish and you feed him for a
lifetime.” We also suggest organizations in China to offer
more emotional care. Due to the strong needs of belonging-
ness in organizations, emotional support thus is particularly
effective to active employees’ positive affect. When the pos-
itive affect results from caring, approval, and respect is trans-
ferred into family domain, Chinese employees will increase
their tendency to reciprocate their organizations.

This research has several limitations that can be addressed
in future research. First, we cannot draw firm conclusions
about causation in this study by using cross-sectional data.
We heavily rely on the assumptions of the role conflict and
accumulation framework in hypothesizing the causal relation-
ships and interpreting the empirical findings. Accordingly, we
cannot rule out the possibility of reverse causation. That is, it
is possible that job satisfaction might affect work-to-family
conflict and facilitation. Conducting longitudinal research
can provide more conclusive evidence of causality concerning
the directionality of the hypothesized relationships in our
model. Second, we only investigated the effects of social sup-
port from work domain. Based on source attribution hypoth-
esis (Shockley and Singla 2011), stating individuals are prone
to attribute benefits and blame to the domain that produces the
conflict and facilitation, we explained how support from work
affects on job attitudes through work-to-family facilitation.
However, recent research has indicated support from family
domain is also an important source of work–family balance
(Ferguson et al. 2012). Future research can integrate both
work and family support to investigate its beneficial effects
and outcomes in multicultural context.
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