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Abstract Building on social capital theory, we view the mar-
keting and sales interface as a set of inter-group ties and
investigate how cross-functional relationships may facilitate
the development of social capital associated with value crea-
tion. Our findings suggest that social capital embedded in
marketing and sales relationships can inhibit a firm’s perfor-
mance depending on the characteristics of its customers. Our
results also demonstrate that managing the marketing and
sales interface at different levels of customer concentration is
critical to the success of a firm’s performance.
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The idea that cross-functional interactions have a strong im-
pact on the successful implementation of strategies is widely
recognized (e.g.,Wind and Robertson 1983). Given that many
cross-functional interactions are informal (Ruekert and
Walker 1987), the lack of research attention to networks of
social relationships between marketing and sales is surprising.
Indeed, work to date has focused on typologies of marketing
and sales organizational forms (Homburg et al. 2008;
Workman et al. 1998), the respective influence of marketing
and sales groups within a firm (Homburg et al. 1999), their
cross-functional dispersion (Krohmer et al. 2002), their inter-
face with other functional areas (Hughes et al. 2012), the
planning of their activities (Strahle et al. 1996), their mindsets

(Homburg and Jensen 2007), and the influence of organiza-
tional justice on their relationship effectiveness (Hulland et al.
2012).

This study expands upon the above work by taking mar-
keting and sales research beyond formal organizational charts,
considering explicitly the social networks existing between
marketing and sales and their associated assets (i.e., social
capital). Our primary contribution is to critically assess the
utilization of organizational mechanisms (e.g., reward poli-
cies) through the lens of how they impact the development
and deployment of marketing and sales social capital.
Building on the idea that cognitive, structural, and relational
constituents of social capital have unique effects on firm
performance (Moran 2005; Nahapiet and Ghoshal 1998), we
combine both antecedents and consequences of those social
capital constituents.

Based on a sample of marketing and sales executives
drawn from companies in the consumer goods industry, we
propose that sales and marketing integration may not always
pay off. More specifically, we present evidence indicating that
organizational mechanisms affect the dynamics of firms’ so-
cial capital and performance depending on their customers’
characteristics.

The marketing and sales interface: a conceptual
framework

Numerous authors have studied social capital at various
levels, including the individual (Burt 1997), group (Burt
2000), national (Fukuyama 1995), organizational (Leana and
Van Buren 1999), interorganizational (Chung et al. 2000), and
industry network levels (Walker et al. 1997). For example,
Leana and Van Buren (1999) define “organizational social
capital as a resource reflecting the character of social relations
within the organization, realized through members’ levels of
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collective goal orientation and shared trust” (p. 540, emphasis
added). Further, Oh et al. (2006) introduce the concept of
“group social capital—the set of resources made available to
a group through members’ social relationships within the
social structure of the group and in the broader formal and
informal structure of the organization” (p. 569, emphasis
added). Given that functional units (e.g., marketing, sales)
can be conceptualized as a nexus of relationships, we intro-
duce the concept of marketing and sales social capital in this
same spirit.

Our model includes three key sets of relationships. The first
set of relationships describes the effect of social capital on
performance. The importance of this dimension is based on
growing evidence that social capital can enhance firm perfor-
mance by providing access to information and resources (e.g.,
Adler and Kwon 2002; Ahearne et al. 2013; Birley 1985;
McEvily and Zaheer 1999; Powell et al. 1996).

The second set of relationships examines the moderating
effect of customer account concentration on the links between
social capital and firm performance. We are guided here by a
number of studies investigating moderating factors in the
context of marketing organization (e.g., Aldrich 1979;
Pfeffer 1994; Rouziès et al. 2005; Workman et al. 1998).

The third set of relationships examines how firms manage
social capital residing in marketing and sales relationships
through use of bridging and closure mechanisms (Leana and
Van Buren 1999; Oh et al. 2006; Zou and Ingram 2013).
Bridging mechanisms help firms develop social capital by
encouraging connections (i.e., “bridges”) between previously
disconnected individuals, providing them with access to new
information and ideas (Burt 2000; Granovetter 1973). Closure
mechanisms can also help firms improve social capital by
enriching the interactions between people who are already
connected, thereby facilitating greater cooperation and effi-
ciency (Coleman 1988; Gargiulo et al. 2009).

In addition to these three key sets of relationships, we
control for the effects of three potentially important environ-
mental variables that have been used in past strategic market-
ing research—market turbulence, technological turbulence,
and competitive intensity. We discuss each part of the model
next and present our formal hypotheses (Fig. 1).

Social capital impact on performance

Various models of social capital have been advanced, but one
of the most widely accepted frameworks is that of Nahapiet
and Ghoshal (1998). Their framework draws important dis-
tinctions between the structural, relational, and cognitive di-
mensions of social capital. The structural dimension refers to
the configuration of linkages between groups. The relational
dimension involves other assets that derive from interactions
such as trust, norms, and reciprocity. Finally, the cognitive
dimension of social capital deals with shared languages,

codes, or meanings by network members. We examine each
of these dimensions in greater detail below.

Structural dimension of social capital Homburg et al. (2008)
empirically demonstrate that the most successful relationships
between sales and marketing groups are the result of intense
usage of structural linkages between the two. Marketing and
sales personnel sharing strong ties can support each other
while carrying out coordinated and congruent activities. In
such networks, more information is shared, a stronger agree-
ment on expectations develops, and a greater mutual interde-
pendence forms (Sparrowe et al. 2001). This allows marketers
to more accurately address the needs of potential clients using
inputs from salespeople, and marketing research enables more
confident selling through dissemination of market insights
(e.g., see Hughes et al. 2013; Steward et al. 2010; Üstüner
and Iacobucci 2012). Previous research confirms that dense,
highly connected networks enhance communication efficien-
cy (Rowley 1997; Walker et al. 1997) and firm performance
(Zou and Ingram 2013). Thus, the structural dimension of
social capital, manifesting as tie strength (Tsai and Ghoshal
1998), facilitates superior firm performance.

Relational dimension of social capital A salesperson’s visit to
a customer to introduce a new product is all the more efficient
when it is coordinated with marketing’s launch of an associ-
ated advertising campaign. Both activities are consistent in
that they have the same goal, and they support each other in
that each activity makes the other one more effective. In this
example, salespeople have been given access to the right
information, and that enables them to do a better sales job
(Üstuner and Godes 2006). Trust facilitates this kind of re-
source exchange as it increases people’s willingness to coop-
erate, building a reputation of trustworthiness and attracting
other members into the network (Tsai and Ghoshal 1998). In
turn, it has been well documented that trust and cooperation
increase relationship performance (e.g., Crosby et al. 1990;
Doney and Cannon 1997; Fang et al. 2008; Morgan and Hunt
1994; Nahapiet and Ghoshal 1998). Against this background,
we argue that trust and cooperation, two key facets of rela-
tional social capital, lead to organizational success. This prop-
osition is consistent with extant literature looking at the effect
of relationship quality on firm performance (Crosby et al.
1990; DeWulf et al. 2001; Palmatier 2008; Palmatier et al.
2006; Sigaw et al. 1998).

Cognitive dimension of social capital When marketing and
sales personnel are on the same wavelength, they should
improve firm performance (Homburg and Jensen 2007). In
such cases they understand the other function’s point of view
and can better handle conflicts. Such an understanding is
important, because many marketing and sales decisions can
be made on the basis of very different grounds. For example,
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the sales team may feel it is necessary to increase the level of
satisfaction of a large account and request some product
improvement, which, from the marketers’ point of view, might
not make economic sense for only one account. Typically,
both points of view need to be considered. As Dougherty
(1992) points out: “Departments can develop different per-
spectives through which they might separate rather than com-
bine information, including cognitive orientations such as
goals, time frames, and formality (Lawrence and Lorsch
1967), languages (Tushman 1978), perceptions (Dearborn
and Simon 1958), occupational cultures (Van Maanen and
Barley 1984), or power (Riley 1983)” (p. 181). In other words,
people need to invest in learning and understanding, and
shared understandings and cognitive schemes enable them to
better understand and use information and other resources
held by members in their social networks (Maurer and Ebers
2006). This conjecture is further supported by the work of
Gulati (1995) and Tsai and Ghoshal (1998), who show how
shared visions enhance organizational performance. All of the
above observations imply that there is a positive effect of the
cognitive dimension of social capital, manifesting as shared
vision on organizational performance.

Summarizing the above:

H1: Organizational performance is positively associated
with the (a) tie strength; (b) trust and cooperation; and

(c) shared vision characterizing the marketing and sales
interface within an organization.

The moderating effect of customer concentration

Customer relationships are crucial to business success, and
their dependence structure has significant outcomes for a firm.
Indeed, when firms have dominant customers, previous re-
search has documented a number of risks, including customer
opportunistic behavior, reduced survival likelihood for young
supplier firms, and constrained innovation strategy for suppli-
er firms (e.g., Fischer and Reuber 2004; Jap and Anderson
2003; Venkataraman et al. 1990; Yli-Renko and Janakiraman
2008). The extent to which a small number of customer firms
account for a large proportion of a supplier firm’s revenue is
an important variable to take into account when investigating
the impact of the marketing and sales interface (two key
functions for customer relationships) on a firm’s performance
(Homburg et al. 2008). (Throughout the balance of this paper
we refer to the phenomenon of customers concentrating their
business in the hands of a small number of suppliers as
customer concentration, representing supplier account ratio-
nalization on the part of the customer.) Thus, we address the
moderating effects of customer concentration and argue that
the influence of a firm’s marketing and sales social capital on
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J. of the Acad. Mark. Sci. (2014) 42:511–527 513



its performance depends on its customer portfolio
concentration.

Structural dimension of social capital Tie strength is likely to
matter more to firm performance when customer concentra-
tion is high. In essence, the necessity to meet a key customer’s
needs and objectives will become pressing, since the supplier
depends heavily on its significant share of revenue. Because a
dominant customer can influence a firm’s decisions (Yli-
Renko and Janakiraman 2008) and can therefore exert its
power over marketing and sales policies, marketing and sales
executives are likely to face increased demands from and
develop a strong feeling of responsibility toward such cus-
tomers. Consequently, they will intensify the use of their
interactional processes (e.g., sharing and coordinating infor-
mation and resources) to meet their key customer’s objectives,
thereby placing a premium on tie strength since stronger ties
enable these new patterns of interactions. Thus, higher cus-
tomer concentration will require more intense forms of inter-
action between marketing and sales executives, and it will
heighten the effects of tie strength on firm performance.

Relational dimension of social capital In dealing with a small
number of large, powerful customers, marketing and sales
groups’ trust and cooperation are likely to become more
salient. This is because the necessity to understand those
customers’ needs, objectives, and routines is likely to become
acute as the supplier cannot afford to lose such a big share of
revenue. Since trust and cooperation have been found to
increase relationship performance (e.g., Fang et al. 2008;
Morgan and Hunt 1994; Nahapiet and Ghoshal 1998), we
expect sales and marketing managers to mandate all possible
resources and information sources in order to anticipate and
meet their dominant customers’ needs. Trust and cooperation
developed between sales and marketing managers will thus
become crucial to improving a firm’s knowledge and under-
standing of its dominant customers in order to provide them
with unique benefits and better services, thereby increasing
their level of performance. This implies that greater customer
concentration should moderate the positive relationship be-
tween trust and cooperation (key facets of relational social
capital) and firm performance.

Cognitive dimension of social capital Prior research has
shown that firms often become dependent on their dominant
customers and consequently need to take them into account in
all their major decisions (e.g., Venkataraman et al. 1990; Yli-
Renko and Janakiraman 2008). More specifically, when cus-
tomers are very powerful, employees face pressure to adopt their
dominant viewpoint. In general, powerful customers yield im-
plicit knowledge that represents how things “ought to be.” This
is partly because a powerful customer threatens the judgment of
marketing and sales teams, dampens their independent efforts,

and exerts its will and preferences. Indeed sales and marketing
managers are likely to develop visions that are influenced by
those of their powerful customers (e.g., Gargiulo and Benassi
2000), thereby decreasing the likelihood of contradicting cus-
tomers’ expectations or pursuing marketing opportunities and
innovation policies that are not in line with customers’ policies
(e.g., Fang et al. 2008; Maurer and Ebers 2006).

When marketing and sales executive attention are tied up
by a powerful customer (Yli-Renko and Janakiraman 2008),
they will be more likely to neglect other valuable sources of
information or downplay information cues contradicting their
key customer’s situational analysis. As a result, the very
reason why marketing and sales executives’ shared visions
have a positive effect on firm performance (i.e., shared under-
standings and cognitive schemes allowing the choice of the
best strategies to reach the firm’s goals) turns out to be
detrimental when customer concentration is high because
marketing and sales executives’ shared visions will then es-
pouse that of their key customer (i.e., shared understandings
and cognitive schemes allowing the choice of the best strate-
gies to reach the key customer’s goals). Taken together, these
arguments imply that visions shared by sales and marketing
are more likely to impede organizational performance when
customer concentration is high than when it is low. This
conclusion is consistent with Li and Calantone (1998) and
Morgan et al. (2005), who point to a firm’s risk of opportu-
nistic behavior depending on its customers’ concentration.
Summarizing the above:

H2: A higher degree of customer concentration will be as-
sociated with (a) a strengthening of the tie strength–firm
performance relationship; (b) a strengthening of the trust
and cooperation–firm performance relationship; and (c)
a weakening of the shared vision–firm performance
relationship.

Bridging and closure mechanisms

Given the importance of social capital for firm success (e.g.,
Adler and Kwon 2002), a key question that arises is what steps
managers should take to foster marketing–sales social capital
within their firms. Bridging and closure relationships are the
main conduits of social capital (Burt 2000). They emphasize
(respectively) mechanisms that either bridge gaps between
disconnected people or encourage denser connection net-
works between people (Oh et al. 2004, 2006). In the following
subsections, we discuss two types of mechanisms that can
facilitate either bridging or closure: (1) human resource poli-
cies and (2) political mechanisms.

Human resource policies: rewards Leana and Van Buren
(1999) theorize that human resource policies strongly affect
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organizational social capital. By way of analogy, we argue that
reward policies support marketing and sales social capital.
According to social interdependence theory (Deutsch 1949),
people’s beliefs about how their goals are related determine
how they interact and ultimately how they perform (Johnson
et al. 2006). A central tenet of this theory is that reward
structure (e.g., cooperative) is a driver of group interactions.
In organizations using non-cooperative rewards, employees
place their own goals above those of the organization. The
reverse is true for cooperative rewards (Beersma et al. 2003).
In the context of our study, non-cooperative rewards are likely
to (1) prevent managers from cooperating with their functional
counterparts and (2) engage into the pursuit of local goals,
ignoring company goals or the other departments. Such be-
haviors will weaken ties between functions (Ketokivi and
Castaner 2004), a core facet of structural capital. Relatedly,
the willingness to subordinate individual goals to company
goals will also be associated with lower trust and cooperation
levels, central to cognitive capital. This is because the lack of
connectivity between the functions will impede the develop-
ment of trust and cooperation between marketing and sales
over time. Finally, managers responding to non-cooperative
reward structures tend to keep information proprietary, and
they potentially try to gain personal advantages at the expense
of the superordinate group (Beersma et al. 2003), it is unlikely
that their behaviors will foster information exchange and
resource sharing. Instead, such behaviors are likely to enhance
misunderstandings through an absence of communication
resulting from their lack of solidarity. Consequently, by em-
phasizing the salience of individual goals, non-cooperative
rewards will hinder shared understandings, representations,
and interpretations or shared vision (a crucial dimension of
cognitive capital). Thus:

H3: Non-cooperative rewards have a negative association
with the (a) tie strength; (b) trust and cooperation; and
(c) shared vision characterizing the marketing and sales
interface within an organization.

When these rewards are contingent upon attainment of
company goals, employees are motivated to expand effort to
realize those goals (Menon et al. 1997). This suggests that
they will engage in mutually supportive behaviors and team-
work, thereby resulting in stronger ties between individuals.
For this reason, cooperative rewards are positively associated
with structural social capital. They are also positively associ-
ated with relational social capital since trust and coopera-
tion—core facets of relational social capital (Leana and Van
Buren 1999)—are likely to develop from this increased num-
ber of interactions. In addition to teamwork and helping,
cooperative rewards promote information sharing (Beersma
et al. 2003). This virtuous activity then adds to the stock of
cognitive social capital since a shared vision is likely to

develop through information sharing. Consequently, we posit
that a cooperative rewards positively drive social capital levels
(all three dimensions).

H4: Cooperative rewards have a positive association with
the (a) tie strength; (b) trust and cooperation; and (c)
shared vision characterizing the marketing and sales
interface within an organization.

Political mechanisms: functional power imbalance Given
that cross-functional relationships occur within the context
of the power relations among functions, we examine how
the distribution of functional power affects the development
of social capital. As functional power hierarchies vary across
firms and change over time (Homburg et al. 2008; Pfeffer
1994; Workman et al. 1998), this issue appears to be central in
understanding how firms manage social capital.

Functional organizational structures are examples of
group-based hierarchies described by Sidanius and Pratto
(1999) as being driven by a number of intergroup processes
characterized in part by distrust and lack of cooperation
(Rosenblatt 2012). This is because power, manifesting as
coercion, does not trigger trust and voluntary cooperation
(key facets of relational capital). Consequently, interaction
frequency between functions is likely to decrease, thereby
weakening ties. Moreover, when power is clearly tipped in
favor of one function over another (versus a situation where
power is more equitably distributed), functional managers are
not likely to share information since their level of trust is low.
Therefore, they are not likely to develop common understand-
ings and shared vision. Thus:

H5: Functional power imbalance has a negative association
with the (a) tie strength; (b) trust and cooperation; and
(c) shared vision characterizing the marketing and sales
interface within an organization.

Political mechanisms: justice Hulland et al. (2012) theorize
that perceptions of organizational justice play a key role in
building interdepartmental relationships. In our study, sales
and marketing managers’ perceptions about the fairness of
organizational decisions represent distributive justice, while
perceptions of the fairness of organizational policies and pro-
cedures represent procedural justice.

These notions support the view that marketing and sales
social capital will be engendered when functional members
perceive that both the process through which allocations of
resources are made to their functional unit (i.e., procedural
justice) and the outcomes of these allocations (i.e., distributive
justice) are fair. Thus, perceptions of procedural justice will
strengthen sales and marketing ties, enhancing structural
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social capital. This is because when managers perceive that
they have some input into decision-making processes and that
decision processes are consistent, unbiased, adaptable, ethical,
accessible—that is, when they perceive organizational proce-
dural justice (e.g., Colquitt et al. 2001; Tax et al. 1998)—they
are likely to behave reciprocally by rewarding the organiza-
tion they deem fair (Bosse et al. 2009). In other words, we
expect stronger links to develop between sales and marketing
when managers perceive procedural fairness.

Similarly, a procedural justice climate will increase a core
element of relational capital, trust, and cooperation (Leana and
Van Buren 1999). Prior research has demonstrated that per-
ceived procedural justice tends to create climates of cohesive-
ness, harmony, and loyalty (Thibaut and Walker 1975; Tyler
et al. 1996), typically related to trust and resulting in
cooperation.

Finally, since procedural justice is associated with greater
interconnectedness as explained above, perceptual agreement
will rise (Klein et al. 2001), and values, norms, and knowledge
will diffuse more easily (Rulke and Galaskiewicz 2000). In
other words, a shared vision bymarketing and sales is likely to
develop, resulting in enhanced cognitive social capital.
Consequently:

H6: Procedural justice has a positive association with the (a)
tie strength; (b) trust and cooperation; and (c) shared
vision characterizing the marketing and sales interface
within an organization.

Extending this logic to distributive justice, we argue that
perceptions of distributive justice (which is focused on out-
comes) will trigger higher levels of structural capital. It has
been positively associated with higher levels of happiness,
pride, and effort (Cohen-Charash and Spector 2001;
Greenberg 1988), and reciprocal behavior (Bosse et al.
2009). In other words, distributive fairness is consistent with
the development of mutually supportive behaviors, positive
interactions resulting in stronger agreements on expectations
and interdependence (i.e., the development of stronger ties
within organizational units). Further, distributive justice also
enhances trust and cooperation (Cohen-Charash and Spector
2001). Given that trust and cooperation have been linked to
willingness to engage in social exchange (Nahapiet and
Ghoshal 1998), we argue there is a positive relationship be-
tween distributive justice and relational capital. Finally, given
that distributive justice has been positively associated with
reciprocal behavior (Bosse et al. 2009), we surmise that shared
cognitions will develop because more information will be
shared, better understandings of the other function’s point of
view will emerge and stronger agreements on expectations
will appear. The resulting shared cognitions will facilitate
access to information and people. Therefore, marketing (or
sales) managers who perceive outcome fairness will develop

capabilities to understand and communicate with sales (or
marketing) managers. As a result, distributive justice will
promote cognitive capital. Consequently:

H7: Distributive justice has a positive association with the
(a) tie strength; (b) trust and cooperation; and (c) shared
vision characterizing the marketing and sales interface
within an organization.

Baseline influences on firm performance

Our premise is that cross-functional relationships may facili-
tate the development of social capital associated with value
creation. To control for the effects of exogenous factors, we
initially included three of the most frequently studied market-
level covariates that have been found to influence firm perfor-
mance in similar research contexts: market turbulence, tech-
nological turbulence, and competitive intensity (e.g.,
Homburg and Jensen 2007; Jaworski and Kohli 1993;
Vorhies et al. 2009). All three controls were measured empir-
ically in our study. However, only technological turbulence
was found to have a significant impact on the relationships
studied here. Thus, in the interests of clarity and parsimony we
subsequently discuss only the technological turbulence con-
trol variable in our empirical section.

Empirical study and model estimation

Design: survey context and data collection

We surveyed multiple key informants within both sales and
marketing departments of the same firms, asking them about
their perceptions of how their department as a whole was
treated, as well as questions relating to their business unit.
More specifically, we surveyed employees of supplier firms in
the consumer packaged goods (CPG) industry. Typical cus-
tomers in this industry (i.e., the intermediaries who buy sup-
pliers’ products and then sell them to end consumers) are large
food retailers, franchised restaurant chains, and contract ca-
terers that expect their suppliers to develop unique offers and
tailored packaging (Dewsnap and Jobber 2000). Cespedes
(1995) suggests that such expectations can be met only
through effective interdepartmental relationships within a sup-
plier. Social capital can play a large role in facilitating or
inhibiting effective interactions.

Initially, senior managers (i.e., VPs of sales) in the business
units of organizations that were members of a North American
CPG trade association were sent covering letters soliciting
cooperation for the study. Thirty eight companies agreed to
participate, including Kraft, Procter & Gamble, and Quaker.
The senior managers then identified key contacts in both their
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marketing and sales departments (e.g., regional sales man-
agers), who were in turn called and asked for the names of
potential informants in each department. Survey packages
were sent via mail to these informants (n=292), with an
average of 7.1 surveys sent to each organization. Separate
questionnaires were created for sales and marketing infor-
mants. The same measurement items were used in both ver-
sions, but appropriate wording changes were made. Senior
managers with each firm mentioned our survey to their sub-
ordinates, and encouraged them to participate in the study.
Two follow-up waves were employed (one by letter, one by e-
mail or telephone) to encourage maximum response (Dillman
2000).

Ultimately, 203 usable surveys were received, for an over-
all response rate of 70% (203/292). Four percent of the infor-
mants withdrew during survey completion, and the remaining
26% did not reply. No significant differences were noted in the
responses from early versus late informants. On average, 5.34
responses were received from the 38 participating firms, rang-
ing from three to twelve. Roughly half of these responses were
from marketing personnel (mean=2.68) and half from sales
personnel (mean=2.66). Thus, for a typical firm, multiple
responses from both marketing and sales were received.

Measures

Business unit performance was assessed using eight items.
(Appendix lists all measurement items employed in our
study.) Informants were asked to indicate the extent to which
various business unit outcomes had occurred over the past six
months, based on 7-point scales (anchors: “none”, “a lot”).
The eight items show high convergence (alpha=.90).

Non-cooperative rewardswas assessed using four items
(α = 0.76) measuring the dimension of an organization’s
reward system that encourages departments to focus on their
own goals, compete with other departments, and optimize
local performance (Walton et al. 1969; Litwin and Stringer
1968). These measures (drawn from Walton et al. 1969)
capture the degree to which a functional orientation has been
fostered by the responding organization through a functional
reward emphasis within the firm.

Cooperative rewards was measured by the extent to which
employees achieve outcomes that benefit their organizations,
while avoiding activities that “game the system,” as suggested
by Jaworski and Kohli (1993). These measures assess the
extent to which rewards are based on external variables such
as customer relations or customer satisfaction (α = 0.71). The
four measures we employ reflect the firm’s support for a
market-based reward orientation, and should be closely relat-
ed to common goals.

Functional power imbalance was measured using three
items that assess the relative power of marketing and sales
(α = 0.72). The three items (adopted from Smith and Barclay

1997) were averaged, and the absolute deviation of this aver-
age from 3 (equal power) was then calculated. We use a linear
measure for functional power imbalance in our models. We
also examined the effects using a quadratic measure; the
results were very similar.

Distributive and procedural justice were both assessed
using a subset of the justice items developed by Tax et al.
(1998).Distributive justicewas measured with four items (α =
0.85) reflecting the fairness of decision outcomes and the
allocation of benefits and costs among departments. For pro-
cedural justice we used six items (α = 0.79) designed to
measure the perceived fairness of policies and procedures
used to allocate costs and benefits across departments.
(Subsets of items for both constructs were used because
preliminary factor analyses revealed multi-dimensional struc-
tures when the original full sets were employed.)

Customer concentration (moderator) was measured using
three items reflecting customers’ greater emphasis on supplier
rationalization, consolidation, and supply chain management
(α = 0.67). This scale is new to our study.

Measures for all three controls were drawn from Jaworski
and Kohli (1993). Technological turbulence, representing the
rate of technological change, was assessed using five items
(α = 0.75). Market turbulence—the rate of change in the
composition of customers and their preferences—was evalu-
ated using four measures (α = 0.53). Finally, competitive
intensity was measured using five items (α = 0.63).

Structural dimension of social capital Given that the market-
ing and sales interface is characterized here by tie strength
relationships between the two groups, the structural dimension
of social capital is operationally defined as perceived extent of
integration (since the dense networks that result from integra-
tion facilitate the exchange of information). A total of four
items drawn from Cespedes (1995) that capture the firm’s use
of structural integrating mechanisms between marketing and
sales were used to measure this dimension of social
capital (α = 0.70).

Relational dimension of social capital In keeping with
Nahapiet and Ghoshal (1998), we focus on two important
facets of the relational dimension of social capital: trust and
cooperation. Eight measures of mutual trust and seven mea-
sures of cooperation proposed by Smith and Barclay (1997)
were used for the relational dimension (α = 0.94).

Cognitive dimension of social capital Operationally, we focus
on shared vision as a proxy for the cognitive dimension of
social capital, following Tsai and Ghoshal (1998). To assess
the extent to which shared thought vision exists within the
firm, we used a total of 17 items (α = 0.72). Four measures of
shared organizational identity were used from the work of
Mael and Ashforth (1992). Organizational identification
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reflects a common perspective on the importance of organi-
zational goals and activities (Maurer and Ebers 2006). Further,
13 items demonstrating diversity in the perspectives of mar-
keting and sales groups (reverse coded) drawn from Cespedes
(1995) were employed. Because marketing and sales feature
different thought worlds (Cespedes 1995; Homburg and
Jensen 2007; Ruekert and Walker 1987; Smith et al. 2006),
diversity in perspectives exist and signal the absence of shared
understandings and cognitive schemes (i.e., lack of a shared
vision).

Analysis and results

Table 1 reports means and standard deviations, by construct. It
also shows the correlations between constructs. Coefficient
alphas are reported in the diagonal of the correlation matrix.
Nunnally (1978) suggested 0.7 as a benchmark for internal
consistency for reflective constructs. Virtually all of our mea-
sures of Cronbach’s alpha are above 0.7, with a few falling
slightly below this threshold, indicating reasonable composite
reliability for our constructs. Further, the constructs appear to
be adequately discriminated from one another. A few of the
correlations in Table 1 are somewhat high, indicating that
there may be issues with multicollinearity. However, all var-
iance inflation factors were below 2.3, suggesting
multicollinearity is not a problem (Hair et al. 2010).

Analysis and model development

Our study uses responses frommultiple individuals within the
same firm, so it is necessary to account for a correlated error
structure across individual respondents. Since individuals are

nested in firms, use of a hierarchical linear modelling (HLM)
approach is appropriate here (Raudenbush and Bryk 2002).
The unit of analysis we employ to test our hypotheses (which
are specified at the firm level) are individual perceptions of
organizational constructs. Thus, these individual measures
must be aggregated to firm-level equivalents. HLM allows
for this type of aggregation while also retaining individual-
level information; the second level of an HLM model ac-
counts for firm-specific heterogeneity, whereas the first level
accounts for individual-specific heterogeneity. Preliminary
analysis using HLM indicated that marketing and sales man-
agers’ perceptions of the constructs in our study are consistent
once firm (and individual) differences are accounted for (i.e.,
addition of a third level in the HLM model to account for
departmental differences was not significantly better than a
two-level model).

Two sets of analyses were conducted to test the hypotheses
advanced earlier. The first set examines the relationships
between the three dimensions of social capital and perceived
business unit performance, while the second examines the
effects of the various organizational bridging and closure
mechanisms on all three social capital facets.

Social capital impact on business unit performance To test
Hypotheses 1 and 2, we estimated the following HLMmodel.
Note that while all of the construct measures are perceptions
collected at the individual level (and are subscripted ij to
indicate that the measure is from individual i who works in
firm j), the β coefficients themselves are firm-specific (i.e.,
they only have a j subscript). However, as will be seen below,
aside from the intercept term (which varies by firm), wemodel
the other coefficients as fixed effects. (Thus, the HLM model
does not include random slopes, reducing it to a variance

Table 1 Descriptive statistics, by construct, and construct correlation matrix

Constructs # Items M SD 1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8 9 10 11

1. Cooperative rewards 4 3.47 1.05 .71

2. Procedural justice 6 4.52 0.86 .20 .75

3. Distributive justice 4 4.31 0.81 .39 .41 .84

4. Non-cooperative rewards 4 3.45 1.06 −.35 −.41 −.44 .76

5. Functional power imbalance 3 0.81 0.68 .02 −.09 −.11 .15 .72

6. Tie strength 4 3.68 1.18 .15 .19 .37 −.42 −.18 .70

7. Trust/cooperation 15 4.85 0.67 .28 .19 .28 −.38 −.20 .47 .94

8. Shared vision 17 4.96 0.67 .17 .39 .44 −.48 −.21 .33 .59 .72

9. Customer concentration 3 6.07 0.66 .01 −.06 −.03 .03 .01 −.09 .00 −.10 .70

10. Technological turbulence 5 4.80 0.91 .22 .08 .20 −.18 −.03 .10 .17 .08 .25 .75

11. Business unit performance 8 4.91 1.01 .40 .22 .43 −.45 −.06 .31 .30 .35 .23 .27 .90

Diagonal entries represent Cronbach’s alphas

All correlations equal to or greater than .14 in absolute value are p<.05; and all correlations equal to or greater than .18 in absolute value are p<.01.
n=203
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components model.) We use the estimated β values to test our
hypotheses.

Level 1 (Individual)

BUPerf ij ¼ β0 j þ β1 j StructCapij þ β2 j RelCapij þ β3 j CogCapij

þβ4 j CustConcij þ β5 j StructCapij � CustConcij
� �

þ β6 j RelCapij � CustConcij
� �

þ β7 j CogCapij � CustConjij
� �

þ β8 j TechTurbij þ rij ð1Þ

Level 2 (Firm)

β0 j ¼ γ00 þ u0 j ð2Þ

βqj ¼ γq0 for q ¼ 2; 3;…8 ð3a–3gÞ

Equation 2 describes the coefficientβ0j as a function of γ00

(the average conditional value of BUPerf across all infor-
mants, conditional on all of the independent variables), and
a firm-specific random error component. This means that the
mean value of BUPerf varies by firm, allowing us to control
for the effects of firm heterogeneity. Equations 3a–3g indicate
that the slopes for the effects of the remaining variables are the
same for all individuals and firms. (HLM can accommodate
differences in slopes across firms by adding a random error
term to any or all of these equations, but we found empirically
that such additions were not significant.)

Combining the above equations results in an estimation
model that includes both an individual-specific variance term
(rij) and a firm-specific variance term (u0j). An individual’s
perception of firm performance (BUPerf) is influenced by
both an idiosyncratic personal error component and a firm-
specific variance component. Thus, the effects of the three
social capital dimensions, customer concentration, the three
interactions, and the control variable on BUPerf are estimated
while taking into account both individual- and firm-specific
differences.

Because all of our measures are perceptual and collected
from the same informants, there may be a concern that our
findings can be attributed to single-source bias. To address this
concern, we approached the senior contacts within each firm,
and asked them to complete a second questionnaire that fo-
cused on marketing/sales performance and eight organization-
al outcomes (new product success, market share growth, sales
growth, increased profits, greater customer focus, customer
satisfaction, customer relations, and customer value) over the
preceding six-month period. (These individuals did not par-
ticipate in the original survey.)

A total of 28 senior managers completed this second sur-
vey, one respondent per firm. We examined the new data by

comparing them to an aggregated measure of business unit
success (calculated using the average across all participants in
the original survey from that company). First, we separated
the eight new items into two groups using factor analysis
(variance explained=78%; eigenvalues 4.7, 1.6), with the first
three items listed above belonging to one factor (“growth”;
alpha=.90) and the remaining five items to the second (“cus-
tomer success”; alpha=.89). These factors were then used in
two separate regression analyses, with aggregate business unit
success as the independent variable in both models and the
two factor scores as the dependent measures (one in each
model). The effect of business unit success on the “growth”
factor is significant (F(1,27)=11.48, p<.01), while its effect
on “customer success” is not (F(1, 27)=0.81, n.s.). These
results indicate that the individual respondents’ (averaged)
perceptions of business unit success are significantly related
to positive business outcomes (as judged by a different set of
senior managers) and suggest that single-source bias is not a
major issue in our data.

Bridging and closure mechanisms impact on social capital To
test Hypotheses 3 through 7, we estimated a second set of
HLM models. The equations below describe the HLM model
for the structural dimension of social capital. In the interests of
space, we do not specify the other two social capital models,
but they are identical in form. These three HLM models are
estimated independently, and we assume that the errors across
equations are independent. To test this assumption, we esti-
mated corresponding regression models, calculated the resid-
uals, and then looked at their correlations. None of these
correlations were greater than 0.3.

Level 1 (Individual)

StructCapij ¼ β9 j þ β10 jNon−CoopRewij þ β11 jCoopRewij

þβ12 jFunctPowerImbij þ β13 jProcJustij

þβ14 jDistJustij þ rij

ð4Þ

Level 2 (Firm)

β9 j ¼ γ90 þ u9 j ð5Þ

βkj ¼ γk0 for k ¼ 10; 11;…14 ð6a–6eÞ

Tests of hypotheses

Social capital impact on business unit performance The
HLM-estimated effects of structural (tie strength), relationship
(trust/cooperation), and cognitive (shared vision) capital on
business unit performance, in conjunction with customer con-
centration and technological turbulence, are reported in
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Table 2. In addition to the path coefficients (and the degree to
which they are significant), this table also reports deviance (−2
times the value of the log-likelihood function), σ2 (the within-
firm variability), and τ (the between-firm variability). The
results for this model are compared to those obtained by
estimating a corresponding null model (equivalent to a one-
way ANOVAwith random effects), with the improvement in
the proportion of variance explained for both the first and
second levels indicated at the bottom of the table (individual
and firm, respectively). “Full Model” reports results for the
fully specified model. This model represents a significantly
better fit to the data than the null model (χ2=27.04; df=8;
p<.001), leading to a 15.0% improvement in within-firm
explained variance, and a 36.7% improvement in the expla-
nation of between-firm variance versus the null model. Note
that this means that nearly 40% of the original variance across
firms is now accounted for by the model variables. All of these
effects are at the firm (and not individual respondent) level,
consistent with the level stated in our hypotheses.

As shown in Table 2 (“Full Model”), both tie strength
(β=.089, p<.05) and shared vision (β=.214, p<.01) have a
significant, positive effect on performance, while the effect of
trust/cooperation is non-significant (β=.025, ns) (H1a, H1c
and H1b respectively). Technological turbulence (β=.123,
p<.05) and customer concentration (β=.239, p<.01) also
have significant, positive effects. The interaction between
trust/cooperation and customer concentration (β=.479,
p<.01) is significant and positive, as predicted (H2b), and
the interaction between shared vision and customer concen-
tration (β=−.268, p<.05) is significant and negative, also as
predicted (H2c). However, the interaction between tie strength

and customer concentration (β=−.019, n.s.) is not signif-
icant, counter to H2a. (Both the hypotheses and the
results of our tests are summarized in the final columns
of Table 2.)

Bridging and closure mechanisms impact on social
capital Results for three HLM models are reported in
Table 3. (For the sake of brevity, the null model results are
not separately reported in this table. However, following
Raudenbush and Bryk (2002), all model fit comparisons are
made to these null models.)

For tie strength, the model reported in Table 3 represents a
significantly better fit to the data than the null model (Δ
deviance=25.32; this is χ 2 distributed with 5 df; p<.001).
This results in an 18.7% reduction in the within-firm variance,
and a 52.9% reduction in between-firm variance (as noted at
the bottom of Table 3). As hypothesized, distributive justice
(β=.168, p<.05) has a significant and positive effect on tie
strength (H7a), while non-cooperative rewards (β=−.213,
p<.01) and functional power imbalance (β=−.169, p<.05)
have a significant, negative effect (H3a and H5a respectively).
However, neither cooperative rewards (H4a) nor procedural
justice (H6a) have a significant effect.

The model for trust/cooperation reported in Table 3 again
represents a significantly better fit to the data than the null
model (χ2=23.46; df=5; p<.001), resulting in a 12.2%
reduction in within-firm variance and a 68.0% reduction
in between-firm variance. Both non-cooperative rewards
(β=−.154, p< .01) and functional power imbalance
(β=−.175, p<.01) have a significant and negative effect on
trust/cooperation (supporting H3b and H5b), while cooperative

Table 2 Effects of social capital, customer concentration, and technological turbulence on business unit performance

Variables Null model Full model Hypotheses; empirical support?

Intercept 4.814*** 4.846***

Social capital

Tie strength – 0.089* H1a Yes

Trust/cooperation – 0.025 H1b No

Shared vision – 0.214** H1c Yes

Customer concentration 0. 239**

Tie strength * customer concentration – −.019 H2a No

Trust/cooperation * customer concentration – 0.479** H2b Yes

Shared vision * customer concentration – −0.268* H2c Yes

Technological turbulence 0.123* Control

σ2 (within-firm variability) 0.501 0.426

τ (between-firm variability) 0.611 0.387

Model deviance 510.19 483.15

Proportion of variance explained (vs. null) : Level 1 – .150

Proportion of variance explained (vs. null) : Level 2 – .367

Significance levels, calculated using bootstrapping procedure, for two-tailed t-tests:

* p<.05; ** p<.01; *** p<.001
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rewards (β=.095, p<.05) has a significant, positive effect
(H4b). However, neither procedural justice nor distributive
justice has a significant effect (H6b and H7b).

Finally, the shared vision model shown in Table 3 is sig-
nificantly better than its corresponding null model (χ2=
35.41;df=5; p<.001), yielding a 29.3% reduction in within-
firm variance and a 48.5% reduction in between-firm vari-
ance. Both procedural justice (β=.129, p<.05) and distribu-
tive justice (β=.187, p<.01) have a significant and positive
effect on shared vision (H6c and H7c respectively), while
non-cooperative rewards (β=−.176, p<.01) and functional
power imbalance (β=−.112, p<.05) have a significant, nega-
tive effect (H3c and H5c respectively). The effect of cooper-
ative rewards (H4c) is not significant.

Discussion and managerial implications

This study focuses on marketing and sales because these two
functions have the most direct contact with customers. They
play a central role in managing the firm–client interface.
Therefore, social relationships between sales managers and
marketing managers are key features of this environment. Our
results show that a firm’s performance reflects an apparent
balancing of two conflicting pressures: the integration imper-
ative (to better serve customers) and the differentiation pres-
sure (to exploit the learning and cooperation benefits that have
been shown to exist in cohesive groups). Because firms si-
multaneously pursue these seemingly contradictory goals, we
posit that they use specific organizational mechanisms to
influence relationships between marketing and sales groups.

A fundamental and related issue is how firms can generate
value from the social capital embedded in these relationships.
Our findings suggest that social capital enhances but also
limits a firm’s performance depending on customers’ charac-
teristics. More specifically, we observe that marketing and
sales integration can become a liability to a firm’s perfor-
mance when customer concentration is high.

First, we find that social capital embedded in the relation-
ships between marketing and sales managers is nurtured by
firms through organizational mechanisms. These include how
employees are rewarded and who is assigned power.
Independent, specialized functional units can develop a high
level of competence, but because of their narrow focus they
often become highly interdependent on other specialized units
(March and Simon 1958). Too much specialization among
independent functional units therefore becomes potentially
problematic for the firm if there are not enough relationships
tying units together to maintain effective and useful commu-
nication flows. In our study, we show that one way to encour-
age inter-unit linkages resulting in the development of social
capital is to use bridging mechanisms. These mechanisms
might be as simple as adapting the compensation structure to
reward cooperation. In extremely competitive internal envi-
ronments, it may be necessary to modify the reward allocation
process so that it is more transparent and procedurally fair. If a
firm is able to create an environment where rewards are
equitably distributed, managers from specialized units will
develop social networks, building more social capital in the
process. Similarly, if a firm is able to balance power between
the marketing and sales functions, managers will trust their
functional counterparts more and cooperate more with them,

Table 3 The effects of bridging and closure mechanisms on social capital

Variables Tie strength Hypotheses;
empirical
support?

Trust/Cooperation Hypotheses;
empirical
support?

Shared vision Hypotheses;
empirical
support?

Intercept 3.701*** 4.848*** 5.024***

Bridging mechanisms

Cooperative rewards 0.041 H4a No 0.095* H4b Yes −0.021 H4c No

Procedural justice 0.053 H6a No −0.002 H6b No 0.129* H6c Yes

Distributive justice 0.168* H7a Yes 0.068 H7b No 0.187** H7c Yes

Closure mechanisms

Non-cooperative rewards −0.213** H3a Yes −0.154** H3b Yes −0.176** H3c Yes

Functional power imbalance −0.169* H5a Yes −0.175** H5b Yes −0.112* H5c Yes

σ2 (within-firm variability) 0.323 0.347 0.193

τ (between-firm variability) 0.037 0.016 0.044

Model deviance 264.11 386.18 279.31

Proportion of variance explained (vs. null) : Level 1 .187 .122 .293

Proportion of variance explained (vs. null) : Level 2 .529 .680 .485

Significance levels, calculated using bootstrapping procedure, for two-tailed t-tests:

* p<.05; ** p<.01; *** p<.001
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thereby developing stronger social capital. This is reflected in
consumer goods industries where powerful brand managers
interact with sales and key account managers whose power is
rising as customer business development, efficient con-
sumer response, and category management are imple-
mented (Cespedes 1995; Homburg et al. 2002, 2008).

Second, we find a condition that turns social capital into a
potential liability for the firm. This occurs when a firm has a
small number of clients who make up the bulk of its sales.
When a firm’s customer concentration reaches high levels, we
show that marketing and sales teams focus more on each other
in a way that can potentially hinder organizational perfor-
mance. Indeed, when firms manage powerful customers, re-
lational assets of social capital (i.e., trust/cooperation) help
managers to mobilize more resources, maintain a tight cus-
tomer focus, and ultimately increase performance. However,
we find that while customer concentration enhances the im-
pact of the relational dimension of social capital on perfor-
mance (i.e., they are more likely to trust and cooperate with
one another), it also hinders the impact of the cognitive di-
mension of social capital on performance (i.e., an over-
emphasis on shared vision). Simply put, our results provide
evidence for the notion that marketing and sales managers
adopt cognitive schemes that tend to espouse those of their
powerful customers. This can stifle innovation and inhibit
rapid responses to changing market conditions because man-
agers cannot access knowledge necessary to identify market
opportunities (as their attention is tied up by key customers).
Serving the needs of the most critical accounts may drive
managers to ignore outside information and hinder a firm’s
monitoring of the business environment. Further, the devel-
opment of social ties with other groups may be delayed or
ignored. Consequently, marketing opportunities may be lost
and the adaptability to environmental changes may diminish
(Fang et al. 2008; Van Knippenberg et al. 2004). In the same
vein, Homburg and Jensen (2007) conclude that what is good
for harmony between marketing and sales may not necessarily
be good for firm performance. Thus, they encourage firms to
install internal role structures to ensure that more relevant
information and more arguments enter into market-related
decisions.

This finding is also consistent with earlier accounts of
cognitive lock-in experienced by managers embedded in
dense networks (e.g., Gargiulo and Benassi 2000; Maurer
and Ebers 2006). This raises a new and interesting issue
related to key account management. Customers with a power
advantage often demand higher levels of service. As a re-
sponse, firms focus on developing partnering relationships
with their key customers (Jones et al. 2005; Weitz and
Bradford 1999) and strive to set up an appropriate key account
management structure. Issues related to key account manage-
ment are highly pertinent for marketing and sales managers
(Homburg et al. 2002).

Thus, contrary to conventional wisdom, we do not advise
marketing and sales managers to stay excessively focused on
improving their relationships with powerful key accounts. Our
analysis shows that when customers have a power advantage,
they are likely to have a negative impact on social capital
cognitive assets performance. Marketing and sales manager
think alike, operate in a vacuum, and fail to sense changes in
the market because they remain too focused on serving their
key accounts. They experience cognitive lock-in. Overall,
without a broader perspective on the evolution of the market,
suppliers may lose track of what is commercially acceptable
and eventually put their firm in jeopardy.

Limitations and avenues for further research

As with all research, the present study has certain limitations
that provide avenues for future research. First, because our
analysis rests on survey data provided by firms operating in
the consumer goods industry, the applicability of our findings
to other industries needs to be assessed. We found that cus-
tomer concentration enhanced the magnitude of the effect of
relational social capital assets on organizational performance
and simultaneously lowered the impact of cognitive social
capital assets. Future studies, using better measures of cus-
tomer power, might yield more nuanced insights into why
these differences exist. Further, all of our data are survey
responses, leading to potential concern about methods bias.
Use of alternative methodological approaches could help
eliminate this concern.

Second, given that firms frequently use account teams
(including functional specialists) to better serve their key
customers, understanding the mechanisms that give rise to
social capital in those teams will be particularly important.
For example, Murtha et al. (2011) provided evidence for
internal blocking of team members by their own account
manager. In this way, the phenomenon they have identified
at the level of the account team is in line with the one we find
for the market ing and sa les group in terac t ion .
Correspondingly, future research could explore how firms
serve their powerful customers.

Third, we selected only two dimensions of justice. In the
justice arena, researchers have often done so (e.g., Erdogan
et al. 2006; Roberson 2006; Roberson and Williamson 2012;
Tekleab et al. 2005; Wiesenfeld et al. 2007). Furthermore, we
primarily focused on firm-level phenomena in this paper, and
both distributive and procedural justice are defined at this
level. In contrast, international justice—the interpersonal
treatment received from other employees in the organization
(e.g., Bies 1986; Tax et al. 1998; Tyler and Bies 1990)—is
more relevant at the individual employee level. As a result, we
did not include it in our study. However, a more complete
conceptualization of justice might include its effects. For
example, Hulland et al. (2012) found that interactional justice
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played an important role in affecting the effectiveness of
working relationships between marketing and sales
employees.

Fourth, future research could examine other moderators.
For example, Xiao and Tsui (2007) call for more research on
the way mechanisms of social capital operate with different
cultural norms and market mechanisms. Multilevel models
could also be considered in this context, as suggested by Oh
et al. (2006). Relatedly, it may be worth examining whether
the antecedents to social capital that we use here have a direct
impact on business performance. In our models we assume
only indirect effects through the three social capital dimen-
sions; however, both direct and direct effects may exist.

A fifth limitation stemming from the measurement scales
used in the survey is our inability to validate the existence of a
relationship between relational capital (trust/cooperation) and
firm performance (i.e., H1b), and between procedural and
distributive justice and relational capital (i.e., H6b and H7b
respectively). Better measures of relational capital may need
to be identified in future work.

Despite these limitations, our study is the first to apply the
social capital lens to the marketing and sales interface. This
novel theoretical perspective provides insights on a very in-
teresting issue: that of marketing and sales interactions in the
presence of powerful customers. In this context, our findings
suggest that the chief challenge for senior executives manag-
ing the value of social capital is to make sure—by using both
bridging and closure mechanisms—that marketing and sales
teams do not get “locked in” when dealing with these
customers.
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Appendix

Study measures

Business unit performance

& Market share growth.
& Sales growth.
& Increased customer satisfaction.
& Increased customer value.
& Increased profits.
& A greater focus on customers.
& Success compared to competition.
& Stronger relationships with its customers.

(7-point Likert scale; “In the past 6 months, our business
has had …”; 1=“None”, 7=“A lot”)

Non-cooperative rewards

& Evidence of cooperation between departments is acknowl-
edged by superiors in my business unit. (reverse-coded)

& There is little recognition given for considering another
department’s problems.

& People pretty well look out for their own interests.
& My business unit blames departments for errors rather

than seeking the causes of the errors.

(7-point Likert scale; 1=“Strongly disagree”, 7=“strongly
agree”)

Cooperative rewards

& No matter which department they are in, people in this
business unit get recognized for being sensitive to com-
petitive moves.

& Customer satisfaction assessments influence senior man-
agers’ pay in this business unit.

& Formal rewards (i.e., pay raises, promotions) are forth-
coming to anyone who consistently provides good market
intelligence.

& Salespeople’s performance in this business unit is mea-
sured by the strength of the relationships they build with
customers.

(7-point Likert scale; 1=“Strongly disagree”, 7=“strongly
agree”)

Functional power

& Power within the business unit.
& Influence within the business unit.
& Leadership within the business unit.

(7-point scale; “Who has …”; 1=“Marketing is much
stronger”, 4=“Both are equal”, 7=“Sales is much stronger”)

Distributive justice

& Marketing and Sales both get what they deserve in this
business unit.

& Resources are allocated fairly across Marketing and Sales.
& Sales and Marketing are equitably rewarded and recog-

nized for their successes.
& Sales andMarketing equally share the glory if good things

happen.
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(7-point Likert scale; 1=“Strongly disagree”, 7=“strongly
agree”)

Procedural justice

& Our department has little say in how resources are allocat-
ed. (reverse-coded)

& Resource allocation decisions are determined entirely out-
side our department. (reverse-coded)

& Resource allocations are made in a timely fashion in this
company.

& Many of the budget decisions that are made here seem
arbitrary. (reverse-coded)

& We are often not given much of a chance to explain our
resource needs. (reverse-coded)

& The business unit’s resource allocation process is very
flexible.

(7-point Likert scale; 1=“Strongly disagree”, 7=“strongly
agree”)

Customer concentration

& Our customers are committed to rationalizing their suppli-
er base over time.

& Customers in our business are gaining power through
consolidation.

& Our customers are placing more emphasis on supply chain
management.

(7-point Likert scale; 1=“Strongly disagree”, 7=“strongly
agree”)

Technological turbulence

& Our direct customers (accounts) are placing more empha-
sis on technology as they deal with suppliers.

& The technology in our industry is changing rapidly.
& Technology changes provide big opportunities in our

industry.
& A large number of new product ideas have been made

possible through technological breakthroughs in our
industry.

& Technological developments in our industry are relatively
minor. (reverse-coded)

(7-point Likert scale; 1=“Strongly disagree”, 7=“strongly
agree”)

Market turbulence

& Our customers’ preferences change quite a bit over time.
& Our customers tend to look for new products all the time.

& We are witnessing demand for our products and services
from customers who have never bought them before.

& New customers tend to have product-related needs that are
different from those of our existing customers

(7-point Likert scale; 1=“Strongly disagree”, 7=“strongly
agree”)

Competitive intensity

& Competition in this category is cutthroat.
& Anything that one competitor can offer, others can match

readily.
& Price competition is a hallmark of this category.
& One hears of a new competitive move almost every day.
& Our primary competitors are relatively weak. (reverse-

coded)

(7-point Likert scale; 1=“Strongly disagree”, 7=“strongly
agree”)

Tie strength: structural social capital

& Formal liaison people are used between Sales and
Marketing.

& We use field marketing specialists.
& Cross-functional account teams are formally established.
& Cross-functional project teams are formally established.

(7-point Likert scale; “To what extent are the following
used in your firm?”; 1=“Not at all”, 7=“Extensively”)

Trust and cooperation: relational social capital

& We always keep our promises to one another.
& Sales and Marketing are not always honest with one

another. (reverse-coded)
& We are genuinely concerned that both departments

succeed.
& We trust Sales [Marketing] to keep our best interests in

mind.
& Sales [Marketing] is trustworthy.
& We are very cautious in our dealings with one another.

(reverse-coded)
& Sales and Marketing both have high integrity.
& Sales [Marketing] trusts us to do the right thing.
& We always act in the spirit of cooperation.
& We try to accommodate each other when making deci-

sions that affect both Sales and Marketing.
& We frequently discuss business issues that affect both

departments.
& If we have a problem with Sales [Marketing], we will tell

them about it.
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& Sometimes we engage in opportunistic behavior at each
other’s expense. (reverse-coded).

& A healthy “give and take” relationship exists between
Sales and Marketing.

& Both departments volunteer information and ideas that
they believe affect each other.

(7-point Likert scale; 1=“Strongly disagree”, 7=“strongly
agree”)

Shared vision: cognitive social capital

& Our department does not really feel a part of this business
unit. (reverse-coded)

& The business unit’s successes are our department’s
successes.

& This business unit deserves our department’s loyalty.
& Our department is a key “part of the family” in this

business unit.

(7-point Likert scale; 1=“Strongly disagree”, 7=“strongly
agree”)

& Focus on different time horizons.
& Are responsible for different results (e.g., profits versus

revenue).
& Have different views of the world.
& Stay in the organization for different lengths of time.
& Stay in their department for different lengths of time.
& Have different goals and priorities.
& Have different motivations.
& Pay attention to different information.
& Are rewarded for achieving different things.
& Look to the organization for different “things”.
& Have different tolerances for ambiguity.
& Speak a different “language”.
& Have different levels of competence.

(7-point Likert scale; “Comparing people in our Sales and
Marketing departments, on average they are…”; 1=“Strongly
disagree”, 7=“strongly agree”)
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