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require shifts in cultural norms which define the onset of 
pregnancy as the appropriate starting point for attention 
to infant health. Conclusions for Practice This commen-
tary reviews the case for preconceptional care, presents the 
rationale for One Key Question as a strategy for linking pri-
mary care to preconceptional and/or contraceptive care for 
women, outlines what is entailed in implementation of One 
Key Question in a health care setting, and suggests ways to 
build community support for preconceptional health.

Keywords  One Key Question© · Preconceptional health · 
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Significance

Policy makers, advocates and provider and public health 
organizations increasingly recognize the importance of 
access to preconceptional care or optimal contraceptive 
care for sexually active, reproductive age women. Emerg-
ing consensus on these points confronts current practice in 
health care, which divides reproductive care from primary 
health care for women. It also confronts prevailing culture, 
which defines the point at which pregnancy is established 
as the starting point for attention to infant health. This com-
mentary suggests that universal, standardized screening for 
pregnancy intent using a non-judgmental approach offers a 
means to address both of these challenges to emerging best 
practice.

Introduction

The view that prenatal care is helpful, if not essential, to 
healthy birth outcomes for both woman and child is of 

Abstract  Objectives Preconceptional health care is 
increasingly recognized as important to promotion of 
healthy birth outcomes. Preconceptional care offers an 
opportunity to influence pregnancy timing and intent and 
mother’s health status prior to conception, all predic-
tors of individual outcomes and of inequality in birth out-
comes based on race, ethnicity and class. Methods One 
Key Question, a promising practice developed in Oregon 
which is now attracting national interest, provides an entry 
point into preconceptional care by calling on providers to 
screen for pregnancy intent in well woman and chronic 
disease care for women of reproductive age. For women 
who choose not to become pregnant or are not definitive 
in their pregnancy intent, One Key Question provides an 
opportunity for provision of or referral to counseling and 
contraceptive care. Results Adoption of One Key Ques-
tion and preconceptional care as standard practices will 
require important shifts in medical practice challenging 
the longstanding schism between well woman care gener-
ally and reproductive care in particular. Adoption will also 
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relatively recent origin (Ballantyne 1901). The concept of 
prenatal medical care was first introduced before 1900, but 
got full traction and was incorporated into federal policy 
only in 1985, with publication of research findings link-
ing prenatal care to reduced incidence of low birth weight 
(Alexander and Kotelchuck 2001). Despite its limited ante-
cedents and despite continued controversy about whether 
and how prenatal care improves outcomes, it has become a 
tenet of both clinical and popular culture.

The strongest case can be made for prenatal care in the 
presence of specific conditions that compromise pregnancy 
health either directly (as in the case of diabetes) or indi-
rectly (as in the case of certain medications or treatments 
for cancers, mental illness) (Centers for Disease Con-
trol and Prevention 2014). Recently, the terms medical 
and health home have been used to define a broader view 
of health care as a hub for services that address patients’ 
social circumstances (Patient-Centered Primary Care Col-
laborative 2015). These models align with emerging life 
course research that suggests a pathway from adverse social 
conditions to adverse health outcomes with stress as the 
mediating link (Collins et  al. 2011; Hudson et  al. 2016). 
New models of prenatal care delivery, including group care 
(notably Centering Pregnancy) and an enhanced maternity 
medical home offer a broader view of the potential of pre-
natal care to improve birth outcomes (Bello et  al. 2015; 
Handler and Johnson 2016).

An article by Verbiest et  al. in a previous issue of this 
journal, argued that even that broadened version of prenatal 
care is not enough (Verbiest et al. 2016). The article called 
for a reproductive justice movement in social, political and 
cultural, as well as health domains to improve birth out-
comes. As Verbiest et al. and other commentators suggest, 
an important component of new thinking about reproduc-
tive health is new thinking about reproductive health care. 
In this commentary, we focus on that aspect of the move-
ment called for by Verbiest et  al., reflecting an emerging 
strategy that moves the center of gravity in relation to 
health care intervention to improve birth outcomes back-
wards from conception and places it in the health status of 
the woman prior to pregnancy. This new strategy calls for 
changes in clinical care and in the broader society. In the 
former, it implies a paradigm shift away from the bifurca-
tion of women’s health care to integrate preconceptional 
health into the “normal” non-reproductive side of the 
women’s health divide. In the latter, it implies building a 
culture among the population and women that recognizes 
the importance of the health of the woman in advance of a 
potential pregnancy for both mother and child.

This is no small change, given the traction of prenatal 
care as currently configured in the structure of medical 
practice and in our culture. In terms of medical practice, 
the emphasis on prenatal care has led to a system that 

institutionalizes the moment pregnancy is confirmed as 
the starting point for concern about reproductive health. 
Thus, a study based on data from the National Ambula-
tory Care Survey found that among women of reproductive 
age receiving primary care in 2009–10, only 14% reported 
receiving reproductive health care from their primary care 
providers while another 30% reported receiving reproduc-
tive care from a separate reproductive health specialist 
(Bello et al. 2015). This means that 56% of women receiv-
ing primary care that year received no reproductive care 
at all. In terms of culture, the image of prenatal care as a 
rite of passage identifying the woman’s transition to mater-
nal status has become iconic. Hundreds of movies and 
TV shows memorialize the obstetrician’s office (or more 
recently, the ultrasonographer’s cubicle) as the locus in 
which motherhood commences.

There is abundant evidence that the prenatal care para-
digm has not lived up to its early promise. Twenty-first cen-
tury public health is faced with rising maternal death rates, 
stagnant progress in reducing fetal and infant mortality and 
growing inequality between women of different race, eth-
nicity and income groups (MacDorman et  al. 2016; Mac-
Dorman and Gregory 2015).

Two bodies of data highlight the inadequacy of our cur-
rent focus. The first is data from PRAMS and other client 
survey data systems which indicate the prevalence of unin-
tended pregnancy among childbearing women in the U.S. 
generally, and among women of color and women with low 
income (Centers for Disease Control and Prevention 2016). 
Given the range of studies revealing associations between 
unintended pregnancy and a spectrum of adverse pregnancy 
outcomes even after controlling race, class and other poten-
tial confounders, these prevalence findings are of concern. 
The second body of relevant data is a set of PPOR (Peri-
natal Periods of Risk) studies conducted around the coun-
try (Demont-Heinrich et al. 2013; Besculides and Laraque 
2005). Taken together, these analyses suggest that the chal-
lenges faced by U.S. women, and especially women who 
experience social marginalization based on race/ethnicity, 
income or both, arise prior to pregnancy, and the failure of 
our system to invest in improved women’s health prior to 
pregnancy precludes opportunities to address those chal-
lenges. The logical conclusion we draw from these findings 
is that we need a cohesive approach to health that, as Ver-
biest et al. suggest, engages women (and men) in care that 
seeks to optimize health and minimize exposures that com-
promise health as far in advance of a possible pregnancy as 
possibility. That implies a health care system with capacity 
(and commitment) to address reproductive aspirations and 
challenges prior to pregnancy and a social awareness of and 
commitment to the importance of preconceptional health.

ONE KEY QUESTION (OKQ)® was developed by the 
Oregon Foundation for Reproductive Health as a means 
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of operationalizing the paradigm shift from prenatal to 
prepregnancy care. OKQ calls for routine integration of 
proactive screening for pregnancy intention by asking 
“Would you like to become pregnant in the next year?” 
during all clinic visits. Novel in its approach, this question 
asks the woman to consider and respond based on what she 
wants, rather than what she plans, in order to more accu-
rately identify the preventive reproductive health services 
she needs.

Unlike previously developed dichotomous screening 
approaches, this offers women the option to respond based 
on a continuum between yes and no, with “I’m Unsure,” 
or “I’m Okay Either Way,” as meaningful choices distinct 
from the two extremes. It ties each of these responses to 
patient-centered follow-up protocols that focus on contra-
ception and/or preconception care and that may be imple-
mented in a variety of care settings (Oregon Health Author-
ity 2014).

OKQ advances the aim of reproductive life planning 
while differing from the typical framing of interventions in 
that domain by focusing on what women want rather than 
what they plan. The change in emphasis is significant. It 
can avoid off-putting dissonance for those women whose 
religious or cultural beliefs are antithetical to any version of 
reproductive self-determination: those who see pregnancy 
as the result of God’s will or fate, rather than a woman’s 
choice. It also obviates the need for a woman to admit to 
actively “planning” a pregnancy that may incur social dis-
approbation. Current cultural norms in the United States 
have eased considerably in relation to what used to be 
termed “unwed pregnancy.” Taboos against “planning preg-
nancy while poor,” however, are still going strong. Framing 
the discussion in terms of wanting, rather than planning, 
may ease women’s concerns about risking provider disap-
proval. More generally, research suggests that among low 
income women, women, for whom each day, in fact each 
meal, may be a matter of insecurity and anxiety:

“Planning was not a particularly salient concept often 
because the context in which women felt planning 
should take place (marital relationship and stable 
finances) was elusive. As women did not acknowl-
edge the health benefits to either mother or infant of 
a planned pregnancy, the inherent value of planning 
and preparing for a pregnancy was seemingly not evi-
dent (Borrero et al. 2015).”

The logic of OKQ aims at optimizing access to repro-
ductive care by building standardized screening into 
“regular” women’s health care; at the same time, OKQ 
is designed to improve the quality of reproductive care, 
by increasing the probability of a forthright conversation 
between patient and provider starting with acknowledge-
ment and support for the patient’s true aspirations.

Implementation: In the Clinic Setting

Successful implementation of OKQ requires (a) a plan for 
systematic incorporation of screening into standard health 
care that incorporates privacy and (b) a set of site-specific 
protocols guiding the course of care for each woman based 
on her response to screening, minimizing barriers. In fact, 
these elements are fundamental to any successful screening 
program. In regard to the former, women may be asked to 
consider and respond to the question on paper or via email 
prior to a visit or through material given out at the front 
desk upon arrival. The question can be posed during check 
in or once the patient is roomed, or built into the process 
for obtaining a health history, ascertaining vital signs or 
recording a problem list to inform the visit, assuming pri-
vacy can be assured. It can be asked by a nurse or physi-
cian or by a medical assistant or other paraprofessional on 
the clinic team if appropriate. How the question gets posed 
will vary from site to site; the key points are to promote 
consistency and effectiveness of screening while avoiding 
distraction from the primary aim of the medical appoint-
ment. Incorporation of OKQ into a site’s electronic medi-
cal records is one strategy to promote this kind of consist-
ency, regardless of the flow of the screening process at a 
particular site. Based on the women’s response, services 
are offered by the clinician or someone else on the care 
team (RN, health educator) during the same appointment 
or a return appointment, a warm hand-off to another team 
member or referral to an outside clinic. Here the critical 
elements are a set of well planned, clearly described proto-
cols that define next steps while minimizing barriers, based 
on each woman’s response.

When a Woman Responds “Yes”

When a woman indicates that she would like to become 
pregnant within the year, follow-up should include assess-
ment and treatment based on the core preconception care 
factors recommended by the American Congress on 
Obstetrics and Gynecology (ACOG) and other national and 
international guidelines. These factors are:

•	 Undiagnosed, untreated or poorly controlled medical 
conditions

•	 Immunization history
•	 Medication and radiation exposure in early pregnancy
•	 Nutritional issues—including folic acid supplementa-

tion
•	 Family history and genetic risk
•	 Tobacco and substance use and other high-risk behav-

iors
•	 Occupational and environmental exposures
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•	 Social issues
•	 Mental health (American Congress of Obstetricians and 

Gynecologists 2005)

While action around most of these factors can wait until 
it is possible to set up or refer for a full preconceptional 
visit, others, notably folic acid supplementation or social 
issues that place a woman at immediate risk, should be 
addressed at the point of screening to assure timely preven-
tion and avert immediate danger. It also makes sense for 
sites to offer basic anticipatory guidance, whether through 
direct interaction with a provider or team member or 
through handouts or other media.

When a Woman Responds “No”

Follow up for women who respond to OKQ with a clear 
“no,” who are of reproductive age, are sexually active (or 
may in the foreseeable future become sexually-active) and 
are at risk for pregnancy calls for a discussion about cur-
rent use of a contraceptive method. A recent study of low-
income women receiving health care at federally qualified 
health centers found that nearly 30% of women who did not 
answer “yes” to OKQ reported no contraceptive use (Wood 
et al. 2015). Thus, ascertaining whether a woman is using 
contraception, is satisfied with her method choice, and is 
using it consistently and accurately is critical. Furthermore, 
providers should discuss all contraceptive options with 
women, including long-acting reversible contraceptives 
(LARCs) which offer the highest continuation rates among 
methods (Hatcher 2011; American College of Obstetri-
cians and Gynecologists 2015). This process of contracep-
tive counseling and education should be delivered with a 
focus not only on effectiveness of the method, but also on 
the values, needs and preferences of the woman, and, at the 
woman’s discretion, her partner (Dehlendorf et  al. 2016). 
Here again, sites may use different approaches to schedul-
ing this conversation and providing the range of contracep-
tive services. It may be incorporated into well women visits 
but scheduled separately for visits focused on other health 
issues. In some cases, it may require referral to a different 
department in a medical center or to a different clinical set-
ting altogether, however timeliness and removal of barriers 
to care are essential. The critical point is that each site have 
protocols that makes the process as easy as possible for 
both patient and provider.

When a Woman Response, “I Don’t Know” 
or “I’m Okay Either Way”

Follow-up for a woman who expresses ambivalence about 
pregnancy calls for particular sensitivity to the individual 

woman’s needs. It may mean that a woman is simply unsure 
about her wish for another child and has to sort out her own 
feelings in relation to individual or family aspirations. It 
may reflect the conflicted feelings of a women who wants 
another child but faces financial hardship that constrains 
her options. It may reflect a chronic condition that requires 
appropriate management before the woman can feel confi-
dent about embarking on pregnancy. Ambivalence may also 
indicate a religious objection to the notion that childbear-
ing is under individual control or worries about pregnancy 
in the context of an unsafe relationship. The complexity of 
pregnancy ambivalence, and the lack of any research in this 
area that could guide provider behavior, may make these 
responses to OKQ the most challenging to navigate for 
providers in any setting. This complexity cannot stand in 
the way of follow-up, however. Women who are uncertain 
about their pregnancy intention are more likely not to be 
using any form of contraception, or to discontinue contra-
ceptive use for an extended period of time, putting them at 
a higher risk for unintended pregnancy.

Whatever the cause of ambivalence, providers should 
make time available to work with the woman to determine 
what that intervention should be, and whether continuation 
or initiation of her choice of contraceptive method is appro-
priate. Given the complexity of responses in this domain, it 
is likely, however, that follow up may require a further visit 
whether in house or via referral. Some of the issues that 
drive ambivalence are particularly sensitive, so there is spe-
cial value to follow up with a known provider or via a warm 
hand-off in these cases (Tindall 2009). Whoever the sub-
sequent provider is, though, it is critical that s/he be well 
trained to support reproductive decision-making. Between 
the screening visit and whatever follow-up approach is 
chosen, it may be appropriate for the provider to offer the 
women both folic acid supplementation if pregnancy is not 
precluded by the woman’s current contraceptive method 
and access to a short-term contraceptive option.

Implementation: Beyond the Clinic Walls

Widespread adoption of OKQ is unlikely to succeed if 
implementation efforts are limited to the clinic setting. A 
clinic-only approach, even if universally implemented, 
will only reach women of reproductive age who seek out 
or require clinical care prior to pregnancy. Literature sug-
gests that this would exclude 23% of U.S. women in any 
given year (Ranji and Salganico 2011). That 23% is likely 
to include disproportionately high numbers of women at 
elevated risk for unintended pregnancy under current cir-
cumstances: women who are young, poor, have low paying 
jobs with limited benefits, and women of color (Ranji and 
Salganico 2011). And the reality is, of course, that we are 
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unlikely to come anywhere close to universal implementa-
tion of OKQ in the clinic setting without creating outside 
support for change.

Experience with other health issues that call for changes 
in clinical practice and in cultural norms suggest two criti-
cal areas for effort outside the clinic. The first involves 
creation of funding and policy environments that encour-
age uptake of this question through policy advocacy. Strate-
gies in this domain could include incorporation of screen-
ing for pregnancy intent into a panel of screening activities 
required for third party reimbursement in well-woman 
visits, building the existence of protocols for both contra-
ceptive counseling (already incorporated into the ACA) 
and preconceptional counseling into requirements for new 
ACOs at the state level, and mandatory coverage for a pre-
conceptional visit as part of the bundled rate for pregnancy 
care.

An additional set of strategies could target attitudes and 
beliefs among women and their communities, introducing 
the idea of preconceptional care as a topic of health edu-
cation and a focus of community organizing. One Healthy 
Start program experimented with an outreach campaign 
around OKQ, using bus stop ads, posters and fliers to 
be distributed by community organizations, and tabling 
at local community and 4  year colleges to reach out to 
women with the message (Boston Public Health Commis-
sion 2015). While the scope of the effort was too small for 
meaningful outcome evaluation, the effort did demonstrate 
the feasibility of consumer outreach around OKQ.

Beyond Implementation

Beyond the steps required to achieve implementation of 
OKQ are steps required for full realization of its poten-
tial to improve women’s health and birth outcomes. Once 
asked, OKQ will shine a light on deficits in access to or 
quality of care in any of the areas that arise in a precon-
ceptional health visit (chronic disease management, smok-
ing cessation, weight loss or nutrition services, etc.). OKQ 
raises the same questions in relation to contraceptive care: 
women who say they do not wish to become pregnant must 
have access to informed counseling and a full range of con-
traceptive options. Where access is constrained by lack of 
facilities, workforce shortages or inadequate funding, OKQ 
offers an opportunity to highlight and address those gaps 
through program change and advocacy.

Conclusion

Verbiest et  al. identify three interrelated “core constructs 
for change” that underlie their call for a new movement 

around reproductive health: (1) the insights offered by life 
course theory, which links each woman’s reproductive 
health experience to all aspects of her life history, including 
biological and environmental factors affecting her health 
from gestation through adulthood; (2) the emerging recog-
nition that the role of health care in promoting optimal birth 
outcomes for both woman and child must start prior to con-
ception and (3) the emphasis—implicit in life course theory 
but worthy of mention in its own right—on social factors, 
and particularly racism and poverty which so strongly pre-
dict health resource access and health outcomes in our soci-
ety. To these three forces we would add a fourth, the con-
tinuing battle to assure reproductive choices for all women, 
as critical for optimal outcomes for individual women and 
for public health at community and national levels.

One Key Question has its roots in the fourth factor. It 
was developed by the Oregon Foundation for Reproductive 
Health in recognition that choice means not only the right 
to avert an unintended, ill-timed or unwanted pregnancy, 
but also the right of a woman to receive clinical support for 
a healthy pregnancy even if she is single, poor, or vulner-
able to social marginalization based on race, ethnicity, class 
or all three.

OKQ equally reflects the spirit of the three constructs 
identified by Verbiest et al. It calls for full embrace of the 
life course experience of each woman by the health care 
system. It is designed explicitly as an entry point to pre-
conceptional health for women who choose or are open to 
pregnancy. And it calls on providers to embrace and sup-
port the reproductive aspirations of every woman, regard-
less of social status, and provide a pathway for each woman 
to the supports she needs to optimize pregnancy outcomes.

Like Verbiest et  al. in their prior paper, we challenge 
health care providers—individuals and agencies—and 
those who work for health equity, social justice and wom-
en’s rights—to adopt the practice and embrace the spirit of 
aligning maternal and child health and the women’s health 
movement in the effort to improve women’s health and 
well-being and the health and well-being of their children.
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