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Zinc is an essential micronutrient for several physiological 
and biochemical processes. To investigate its transport in 
rice, we characterized OsZIP8, a rice ZIP (Zrt, Irt-like Pro-
tein) gene that is strongly up-regulated in shoots and roots 
under Zn deficiency. OsZIP8 could complement the growth 
defect of Zn-uptake yeast mutant. The OsZIP8-GFP fusion 
proteins were localized to the plasma membrane, suggest-
ing that OsZIP8 is a plasma membrane zinc transporter in 
rice. Activation and overexpression of this gene disturbed 
the zinc distribution in rice plants, resulting in lower levels 
in shoots and mature seeds, but an increase in the roots. 
Field-grown transgenic plants were shorter than the WT. 
Under treatment with excess zinc, transgenics contained 
less zinc in their shoots but accumulated more in the roots. 
Altogether, these results demonstrate that OsZIP8 is a zinc 
transporter that functions in Zn uptake and distribution. 
Furthermore, zinc homeostasis is important to the proper 
growth and development of rice.  
 
 
INTRODUCTION 
 
Zinc is an essential element that serves as a structural or cata-
lytic cofactor for many proteins, including RNA polymerase, 
superoxide dismutase, alcohol dehydrogenase, carbonic anhy-
drase, and the Zn finger family of transcription factors (Palmer 
and Guerinot, 2009). Thus, cells need mechanisms for main-
taining zinc homeostasis when available supplies decrease 
(Eide, 2009). In plants, Zn deficiency reduces growth, tolerance 
to stress, and chlorophyll synthesis. Approximately 30% of the 
world’s cultivated soil is Zn-deficient. Nevertheless, excessive 
Zn in soil that is caused by pollution and fertilizers is also a 
serious problem (Kawachi et al., 2009). 

Plants deliver minerals absorbed from the root to the shoot, 
and also re-mobilize them from senescing leaves to young 
developing tissues via long-distance transport systems (Park et 
al., 2008). For the successful maintenance of zinc homeostasis, 
plants greatly rely on the coordinated regulation of multiplicity 
by Zn transporters, including uptake transporters such as mem-

bers of the zinc-regulated transporter (ZRT), iron-regulated 
transporter (IRT)-like proteins (ZIP), natural resistance-asso-
ciated macrophage protein (NRAMP), and plant-specific Yel-
low-Stripe1-Like (YSL) families, as well as efflux transporters, 
such as those in the cation diffusion facilitator (CDF) and P1B-
ATPase families (Colangelo and Guerinot, 2006). 

Members of the ZIP transporters are involved in transporting 
Zn2+, Fe2+, Mn2+, and Cd2+, and they contribute to metal-ion 
homeostasis by shifting these metals into the cytoplasm 
(Colangelo and Guerinot, 2006; Guerinot, 2000). ZIP proteins 
generally act at the plasma membrane either to move metals or 
remobilize them from intracellular compartments into the cyto-
plasm (Colangelo and Guerinot, 2006). Most ZIP proteins are 
predicted to have eight transmembrane domains but some 
members may have as few as five; the majority share a similar 
predicted topology where the amino- and carboxy termini are 
located on the outside surface of the plasma membrane 
(Gaither and Eide, 2001). 

Two ZIP proteins are present in yeast: ZRT1 (a high-affinity 
zinc transporter) and ZRT2 (a low-affinity zinc transporter) 
(Zhao and Eide, 1996a; 1996b). Among the 16 ZIP proteins 
present in Arabidopsis (Maser et al., 2001), AtIRT1 was first 
identified through functional complementation of a yeast mutant 
defective in iron uptake (Eide et al., 1996). AtIRT1, a major Fe 
transporter at the root surface, is manifested by the lethal 
chlorotic phenotypes of the irt1 mutant (Henriques et al., 2002; 
Varotto et al., 2002; Vert et al., 2002). AtIRT2, a close homolog, 
is located at the intracellular vesicle and, in cooperation with 
AtIRT1, maintains iron homeostasis in root epidermal cells 
(Vert et al., 2009). AtIRT3 is a zinc and iron transporter (Lin et 
al., 2009). Expression of several ZIP genes, including AtZIP1 to 
AtZIP5, AtZIP9 to AtZIP12, and AtIRT3, is up-regulated under 
zinc-limiting conditions (Krämer et al., 2007).  

Homologues of the ZIP genes have been characterized from 
several species. The soybean GmZIP1 encodes a symbiosis-
specific zinc transporter (Moreau et al., 2002). When expressed 
in yeast cells, GmZIP1 is highly selective for zinc, whereas Cd 
is the only other tested metal that is able to inhibit zinc uptake. 
In Medicago truncatula, MtZIP1 is the Zn transporter, MtZIP3 is 
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the Fe transporter, MtZIP4 and MtZIP7 are Mn transporters, 
and MtZIP5 and MtZIP6 are Fe and Zn dual transporters 
(López-Millán et al., 2004). TcZNT1 from the Zn/Cd hyperac-
cumulator Thlaspi caerulescens has been cloned through func-
tional complementation in yeast and has been shown to medi-
ate high-affinity Zn2+ uptake as well as low-affinity Cd2+ uptake. 
Overexpression of TcZNT1 increases Zn influx in roots (Pence 
et al., 2000). Yeast that expresses two ZIP genes, either 
TjZNT1 or TjZNT2 from the Ni2+ hyperaccumulator T. japoni-
cum, shows a marked increase in Ni2+ tolerance (Mizuno et al., 
2005). 

ZIP proteins have also been studied in rice (Bughio et al., 
2002; Ishimaru et al., 2005; 2006; 2007; Lee and An, 2009; 
Ramesh et al., 2003; Yang et al., 2009). OsIRT1 and OsIRT2 
are expressed predominantly in the roots under low-iron condi-
tions. When expressed in yeast cells, OsIRT1 and OsIRT2 can 
reverse the growth defects of a yeast Fe-uptake mutant but not 
of Zn-, Mn-, or Cu-uptake mutants (Bughio et al., 2002; Ishi-
maru et al., 2006). Yeast expressing OsIRT1 and OsIRT2 are 
more sensitive to Cd, suggesting that it is absorbed by those 
proteins (Nakanishi et al., 2006). When OsIRT1 is over-expres-
sed via the maize ubiquitin promoter, Fe and Zn concentrations 
increase in the shoots, roots, and mature seeds, and those 
transgenics have greater sensitivity to elevated levels of Zn and 
Cd, thus demonstrating that OsIRT1 transports those metals 
(Lee and An, 2009). OsZIP1, OsZIP3, and OsZIP4 have al-
ready been characterized as functional Zn transporters (Ishi-
maru et al., 2005; Ramesh et al., 2003). Expression of OsZIP4 
is induced by Zn deficiency, especially in phloem cells and 
meristems (Ishimaru et al., 2005). Overexpression of OsZIP4 
under the control of the CAMV 35S promoter results in re-
distribution of zinc within rice plants (Ishimaru et al., 2007). 
OsZIP3 is broadly expressed under normal conditions and is 
also slightly induced in shoots after 96 h of zinc deprivation. 
OsZIP1 is induced in both roots and shoots by zinc deficiency 
and OsZIP2 is also up-regulated by zinc, albeit only in the roots 
(Ramesh et al., 2003). Finally, the expression of OsZIP7a is 
significantly induced in roots by Fe deficiency, while that of 
OsZIP8 is induced in both roots and shoots by zinc deficiency 
(Yang et al., 2009). When expressed in yeast cells, OsZIP7a 
and OsZIP8 can complement an iron uptake-deficient mutant 
and a zinc uptake-deficient mutant, respectively (Yang et al., 
2009). 

This present study examined the functioning of OsZIP8 as a 
plasma membrane-localized zinc transporter. We used an 
activation-tagging mutant and OsZIP8-overexpressing trans-
genic plants to evaluate its physiological roles in metal 
homeostasis.  
 
MATERIALS AND METHODS 

 
Plant growth 
Rice seeds were surface-sterilized for 15 min in 50% (v/v) 
commercial bleach containing 5.25% sodium hypochlorite 
(NaOCl). This was followed by three washings with sterilized 
distilled water. The seeds were then placed on an MS agar 
medium containing 30 μM ZnSO4, 100 μM Fe (III)-EDTA, 0.1 
μM CuSO4, and 10 μM MnSO4 as micronutrients. For defi-
ciency tests, seeds were germinated and grown on MS media 
lacking ZnSO4 (Zn-deficient), Fe (III)-EDTA (Fe-deficient), 
CuSO4 (Cu-deficient), or MnSO4 (Mn-deficient). To analyze 
OsZIP8 under different zinc concentrations, we grew seedlings 
for 7 days on MS media containing 0.0, 0.3, 3.0, 30.0, or 300.0 
μM ZnSO4. For time-course analyses of OsZIP8 expression 
upon recovery, plants were grown under a zinc deficiency for 7 

days, then transferred to a zinc-sufficient MS medium (30 μM 
ZnSO4). Shoots and roots were harvested at 0, 0.5, 3, 4.5, 6, 
12, 18, 24, 48, and 72 h after transfer. In 2007 and 2008, trans-
genic plants were installed and grown to maturity on paddy 
fields in Korea at Pohang University of Science and Technol-
ogy (36°N). 
 
RNA preparation and mRNA quantification 
Shoots or roots were collected and frozen in liquid nitrogen. 
Total RNA was isolated with RNAiso Plus (Takara, Japan). 
First-strand cDNA was synthesized from 2 μg of total RNA in a 
25-μl reaction mixture with M-MLV reverse transcriptase 
(Promega, USA). Synthesized cDNAs were used for RT-PCR 
and real-time PCR. Quantitative PCR analysis was performed 
on a Rotor-Gene 6000 real-time rotary analyzer (Corbett Life 
Science, Australia), using a SYBR premix Ex.Taq kit (Takara 
Bio).The levels of actin1 mRNA served to normalize the ex-
pression ratio for each gene. Changes in expression were cal-
culated via the ΔΔCt method. Gene-specific primers included 
OsZIP8-Fw, 5′-CTCCAGCTCGGCATCAACCT-3′; OsZIP8-Rv, 
5′-TAGGCAGGTGCACCCTCGAT-3′; OsAct1-Fw, 5′-GTATC-
CATGAGACTACATACAACT-3′; and OsAct1-Rv, 5′-TACTCA-
GCCTTGGCAATCCACA-3′. 
 
Cellular localization of OsZIP8 
A cDNA fragment spanning the entire ORF of OsZIP8 was 
amplified with two primers -Z8-pgf (5′-AAAGATCTGACGAA-
CACCACCGCCACCG-3′) and Z8-pgr (5′-AAACTAGTGGC-
CCATTTGGCGAGCATGG-3′) - that contained BglII and SpeI 
(underlined sequences) sites for cloning. After digestion with 
both sites, the fragment was inserted into the BglII/SpeI-
linearized pCAMBIA1302 vector (CAMBIA). The resulting con-
struct, pGA3560, contained the fusion of OsZIP8-GFP under a 
CaMV 35S promoter. After confirmation by sequencing, the 
construct was transferred to Agrobacterium tumefaciens strain 
LBA4404 by the freeze-thaw method. Transgenic rice plants 
were generated via Agrobacterium-mediated co-cultivation (Lee 
et al., 1999). These plants were grown on a sterile solid MS 
and collected at 5 days after germination. Roots from plants 
transformed with the GFP fusion construct were examined by 
laser-scanning confocal microscopy (LSM 510 META; Carl 
Zeiss, Germany). GFP signals were detected by excitation with 
the 488 nm line of the argon laser and a capturing emission at 
522 nm. 
 
Isolation of T-DNA tagging mutant 
Putative OsZIP8 T-DNA tagging mutants were isolated from 
our rice flanking sequence-tag database (http:://www.postech. 
ac.kr/life/pfg). The T2 progeny of the primary mutants were 
grown to maturity for seed amplification. Genotypes were de-
termined by PCR, with a set of three primers for OsZIP8-D1 
(Line 4A03374): two specific primers (F1, 5′-TGATCCCACC-
ATTCGGTAAT-3′ and R1, 5′-GGGTACGCGTGTGAGAATTT-
3′) and one T-DNA-specific primer (LB, 5′-CTAGAGTCGAGA-
ATTCAGTACA-3′). Afterward, transcript levels for OsZIP8 were 
determined by quantitative PCR analysis, using cDNA pre-
pared from the shoots and roots of 10-day-old seedlings grown 
on an MS medium. 
 
Generation of OsZIP8-overexpressing transgenic plants 
The full-length cDNA sequence of OsZIP8 was amplified by 
primers 5′-AAAAGCTTGATAGCAGCAGGAGCAGAAGA-3′ (OxF) 
and 5′-AAGGTACCTAGTCCCTGAGTGACGCTTGT-3′ (OxR), 
which contained SacI and KpnI sites (underlined sequences) 
for cloning, respectively. The PCR product was cloned into
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those sites between the maize ubiquitin promoter and the T7 
terminator of binary vector pGA1611 (Lee et al., 1999), thereby 
producing pGA2872. After the seedlings were transplanted to 
soil, we extracted and prepared their cDNA to assess OsZIP8 
transcript levels via northern blot analysis. 
 
Determination of metal contents in plant tissues 
Samples were dried for 2 days at 70°C before being weighed. 
Afterward, they were digested in 1 ml of 11 N HNO3 for 3 days. 
Following dilution, their metal contents were determined by AAS 
(SpectrAA-800; Varian, USA). 
 
RESULTS 

 
Expression of OsZIP8 is up-regulated by a zinc deficiency 
OsZIP8 (LOC_Os07g12890) has now been isolated as a zinc 
transporter that reverses the growth defect of Zn-uptake mu-
tants of yeast (Yang et al., 2009). This gene, induced in both 
roots and shoots by zinc deficiency, can complement that zinc-
uptake yeast mutant (Yang et al., 2009). To confirm these ob-
servations and further investigate its functioning, we examined 
the expression pattern of OsZIP8 under various metal-deficient 
statuses (Fig. 1A; Supplementary Fig. S1A). Quantitative real-
time PCR analyses showed that its transcript level was in-
creased markedly in shoots and roots that lacked Zn, whereas 
Fe-, Cu-, and Mn-deficiencies did not influence expression (Fig. 
1A). We also measured transcripts under different zinc concen-
trations (Fig. 1B; Supplementary Fig. S1B), comparing per-
formance with a control MS medium containing 30 µM Zn. Al-
though reducing the zinc level increased expression in shoots 
and roots, an excessive amount (300 µM) had no effect. In 
response to a zinc re-supply, OsZIP8 mRNA in the shoots de-
clined continuously for 6 h to a very low level (Fig. 1C); this 
decrease was more gradual in the roots, and levels were not 
further reduced in that tissue after 4.5 h (Fig. 1C; Supplemen-
tary Fig. S1C). 

Functional complementation analyses in yeast mutants were 
performed to test the metal transport activity of OsZIP8 (Sup-
plementary Fig. S2). The OsZIP8 cDNA was expressed Sac-

charomyces cerevisiae zrt1 zrt2 double mutant (ZHY3), which 
possesses disrupted null mutations in the genes for the high-
affinity Zn transporter, ZRT1 and ZRT2, and thus the mutant is 
unable to grow on low-Zn media (Zhao and Eide, 1996a). 
AtIRT1 was used as a positive control. Both OsZIP8 and 
AtIRT1 restored the growth defect of ZHY3, on synthetic de-
fined medium lacking zinc, whereas the pDR195 control did not 
(Supplementary Fig. S2). This strongly indicates that OsZIP8 is 
a zinc transporter. 
 
OsZIP8 is a plasma membrane-localized transporter 
For further insight into the functioning of OsZIP8, we analyzed 
its subcellular distribution by expressing a fusion protein with 
GFP. OsZIP8 protein is predicted to be localized to the plasma 
membrane (http://aramemnon.botanik.uni-koeln.de).Transgenic 
plants were generated by Agrobacterium-mediated co-cultiva-
tion, using binary vector pGA3560 that encodes OsZIP8-GFP 
under the control of the cauliflower mosaic virus 35S promoter. 
As a control, we also generated transgenic plants expressing 
GFP alone under the control of that promoter. In plants stably 
transformed with these constructs, green fluorescence was 
observed in the seedling roots (Fig. 2). For plants transformed 
with the OsZIP8-GFP fusion construct, green fluorescence also 
was apparent in the plasma membrane, which was consistent 
with our prediction (Fig. 2). In contrast, fluorescence of GFP 
alone was observed in both cytoplasm and nucleus. Together 
with the yeast complementation data, this localization implied 
that OsZIP8 is a Zn transporter in the plasma membrane. 
 
Production of activation tagging-mutant and OsZIP8- 
overexpressing plants 
To evaluate the functions of OsZIP8 in planta, we isolated a 
putative activation tagging mutant from our rice flanking se-
quence-tag database (An et al., 2003; Jeon et al., 2000; Jeong 
et al., 2006). In Line 4A03374 (OsZIP8-D1), T-DNA was in-
serted at 1248 bp upstream from an ORF of OsZIP8 (Fig. 3A). 
Homozygous plants were selected by PCR from T2 progeny, 
using gene-specific and T-DNA primers. Subsequent quantita-
tive real-time PCR analysis showed that OsZIP8 transcript 

Fig. 1. Expression analysis of OsZIP8

under micronutrient deficiencies. (A) Stan-

dard MS medium (MS) contained 100 µM

Fe (III)-EDTA, 30 µM ZnSO4, 0.1 µM

CuSO4, and 10 µM MnSO4 as micronutri-

ents. For deficiency trials, seeds were

germinated and grown for 7 days in MS

media lacking ZnSO4 (Zn-), Fe (III)-EDTA

(Fe-), CuSO4 (Cu-), or MnSO4 (Mn-). (B)

Real-time PCR analysis of OsZIP8 under

different Zn concentrations. Seedlings

were grown for 7 days on MS media con-

taining 0.0, 0.3, 3.0, 30.0, or 300.0 µM Zn

SO4. (C) Time-course analyses of OsZIP8

expression upon recovery in shoots and

roots. Plants were grown under zinc defi-

ciency for 7 days, then transferred to zinc-

sufficient MS medium (30 µM ZnSO4).

Tissues were harvested 0, 0.5, 3, 4.5, 6,

12, 18, 24, 48, and 72 h after transfer.

Each value is average of 3 independent

experiments. Relative values are between

transcript levels of OsZIP8 and OsAct1.

Vertical bars indicate standard deviation.
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WT and 12 independent transgenic plants were examined. rRNA levels are shown to indicate RNA amounts used for analysis. 
 
 
levels were 55- and 25-fold higher in the seedling shoots and 
roots, respectively, compared with the WT (Fig. 3B). 

To assess the functioning of OsZIP8 further, we generated 
12 transgenic plants that ectopically expressed full-length 
OsZIP8 cDNA under the control of the maize ubiquitin promoter 
(Fig. 3C). Transcript levels were determined by northern blot 
analysis with RNA samples from leaves of independent trans-
genics (Fig. 3C). We selected plants #1 (Z8OX-1) and #3 
(Z8OX-3) for additional analysis. 
 

Increased expression of OsZIP8 causes a reduction of Zn  
in shoots and seeds 

Because OsZIP8 is regulated by micronutrient status, we inves- 
tigated this gene’s role under certain deficiencies. When plants 
were grown on a standard MS medium the transgenics were 
shorter than the WT (Figs. 4A and 4B). Respective heights for 
OsZIP8-D1, Z8OX-1, and Z8OX-3 were reduced to 89%, 93%, 
and 91%, relative to the wild type (Fig. 4B). To assess whether 
elevated levels of OsZIP8 expression affect metal distribution, 
we measured those concentrations in shoots and roots at the 

Fig. 2. Subcellular localization of OsZIP8-GFP in rice roots. Full-

length OsZIP8 cDNA was fused to GFP in the same reading 

frame and resulting construct was used for rice transformation. 

Repre-sentative confocal microscopic images show roots ex-

pressing OsZIP8-GFP fusion protein or GFP alone. Roots ex-

pressing GFP under control of CaMV 35S promoter were used 

as control (P35S-GFP). Fluorescence (left) and bright-field (mid-

dle) images are overlaid at right. Bars = 10 μM. 

Fig. 3. Isolation of T-DNA activation-

tagging mutant and generation of OsZIP8-

overexpressing transgenic plants. (A) 

Schematic dia-gram of OsZIP8 and T-

DNA insertion site. Dark boxes indicate 3 

exons; connecting white boxes are introns. 

In Line 4A03374, T-DNA was inserted into 

5′ UTR region, 1248 bp away from ATG

start codon. Horizontal arrows indicate 

primers (F1, R1, and LB) for genotyping 

T2 progeny. Arrows show gene-specific 

primers for analyzing expression level (Fw

and Rv) and generating overexpressing 

transgenic plants (OxF and OxR). (B) 

Real-time analysis of OsZIP8-D1. OsZIP8-

specific primers (Fw and Rv) were used 

with total RNA from shoot and roots of 

OsZIP8-D1 and segregated WT seed-

lings. Transcript levels were represented 

by ratio between mRNA levels of OsZIP8

and rice actin1. Vertical bars indicate 

standard deviation. (C) Generation of 

OsZIP8-overexpressing transgenic plants. 

Upper: Schematic diagram of pGA2872

expressing OsZIP8-sense transcript under 

control of maize ubiquitin promoter (Pubi). 

Lower: RNA gel blot analysis of OsZIP8-

overxpressing transgenic plants. OsZIP8 

full-length cDNA was used as probe. Two 
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seedling stage (Fig. 4C; Supplementary Figs. S3A-S3C). Com-
pared with the WT, zinc levels in OsZIP8-D1 and Z8OX-1 were 
reduced to 80% and 88% in the shoots, but increased to 278% 
and 160% in the roots, respectively (Fig. 4C). However, 
amounts of Fe, Cu, and Mn from OsZIP8-D1 and Z8OX-1 were 
similar to those from the wild-type segregants (Supplementary 
Figs. S3A-S3C). These observations indicated that reduced 
heights may result from the redistribution of zinc in transgenic 
plants. 

We also investigated whether transgenic plants are sensitive 
to a reduced supply of various micronutrients. Under deficient 
conditions, the transgenics were shorter than the WT as when 
grown with sufficient amounts (Figs. 4A and 4B; Supplementary 
Figs. S3D-S3F). When zinc was lacking, its content measured 
in OsZIP8-D1 and Z8OX-1 was reduced to 73% and 88% in 
the shoots, but increased to 128% and 121% in the roots, re-
spectively, compared with the WT (Fig. 4C). However, the 
amounts of Fe, Cu, and Mn were unchanged under that Zn 
deficiency (Supplementary Figs. S4A-S4C). Iron concentrations 
in the shoots and roots of OsZIP8-D1 and Z8OX-1were similar 
to those of the WT under Fe-deficient conditions (Supplemen-
tary Fig. S4D), whereas the levels of Cu or Mn in those tissues 
were unchanged when either were absent (Supplementary Figs. 
S4E and S4F). We also measured Zn concentrations in shoots 
and roots under Fe-, Cu-, or Mn deficiencies (Supplementary 
Fig. S5). Consistent with our observations from the control and 
zinc-deficient tests, Zn levels were lower in the shoots but 
higher in the roots. All of these data demonstrated that elevated 
expression of OsZIP8 influences the level of only zinc, but not 
Fe, Cu, or Mn.  

A                   B 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Fig. 5. Amounts of Zn (A) and Fe (B) in mature seeds from WT, 

OsZIP8-D1, Z8OX-1, and Z8OX-3 plants. Error bars represent SE. 

Significant differences from WT were determined by Student’s t-

tests. *, P < 0.05. 

 
 
Because changing the expression of OsZIP8 altered the zinc 

distribution at the seedling stage, we also measured micronu-
trient levels in a major sink tissue, the mature seeds. Seeds 
from OsZIP8-D1, Z8OX-1, and Z8OX-3 had 48%, 84%, and 
81% as much zinc as what was measured in WT seeds (Fig. 
5A), whereas Fe concentrations were similar among genotypes 
(Fig. 5B). Levels of Cu and Mn remained unchanged in all ma-
ture seeds (Supplementary Figs. S6A and S6B). 
 

Enhanced levels of OsZIP8 cause zinc to accumulate  

under excess-Zn conditions 

Previously, OsZIP8 was isolated as a functional zinc transporter 
in rice, as shown by complementation of Zn-uptake mutants of 

Fig. 4. Analysis of seedling pheno-

types for OsZIP8-D1- and OsZIP8-

overexpressing transgenics. (A)

Seeds of OsZIP8-D1 and Z8OX-1

were germinated and plants grown

on standard MS media containing 

100 µM Fe and 30 µM Zn (MS), or 

MS media without Zn (Zn-) or Fe 

(Fe-). Pictures were taken 8 days

after germination. Bars = 5 cm. (B) 

Quantification of WT and OsZIP8

mutant plants (n = 8 each) grown 

on control MS or Zn- media for 8 

days following germination. (C)

Zinc concentrations in shoots and 

roots from WT, OsZIP8-D1, and 

Z8OX-1 plants grown on control 

MS or Zn- media. Error bars rep-

resent SE. Significant differences 

from WT were determined by 

Student’s t-tests. *, P < 0.05. 
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Fig. 6. Excess-Zn treatment. Seeds were germinated and plants 

grown for 10 days on ½MS medium supplemented with 5 mM 

ZnCl2. Comparisons among WT and OsZIP8-D1 (A), Z8OX-1 (B), 

or Z8OX-3 (C) plants. Plant heights (D) and Zn concentrations in 

shoots (E) and roots (F) of WT, OsZIP8-D1, and Z8OX-1 (n = 4). 

Error bars represent SE. Significant differences from WT were 

determined by Student’s t-tests. *, P < 0.05. Bars = 5 cm. 
 
 
yeast (Yang et al., 2009) and we confirmed the Zn transport 
activity in yeast cells. Therefore, we tested whether it might 
function under treatment with excess zinc. Our earlier research 
had indicated that rice plants do not respond to the low concen-
trations (< 1 mM Zn) usually applied to Arabidopsis (Lee et al., 
2007). Therefore, we selected 5 mM zinc as the physiological 
concentration for toxicity tests here. Under those conditions, 
transgenic plants had smaller shoots than those grown in a 
control MS medium (Figs. 6A-6D). Moreover, zinc concen-
trations in those transgenic shoots were lower than in the WT 
(Fig. 6E). However, the transgenic roots accumulated more Zn 
(Fig. 6F). 
 
Increased expression of OsZIP8 is associated with shorter  

plants and reduced zinc levels in flag leaves 

To evaluate the roles of OsZIP8 in plant development, we grew 
activation-mutant and over-expression transgenics on paddy 
fields. At the flowering stage, transgenic plants were signifi-
cantly shorter than the WT (Figs. 7A-7D). The OsZIP8-over-
expressing plants also had significantly fewer tillers than the 
WT, but no difference was seen when OsZIP8-D1 plants were 
compared with the control (Fig. 7E). Seed yields from trans-
genic plants also were reduced (Table 1). 

We measured Zn, Fe, Cu, and Mn concentrations in flag 
leaves at the flowering stage to evaluate whether elevated ex-
pression of OsZIP8 affects metal accumulation. Transgenic 
plants contained less Zn (Fig. 7F), but had the same amounts 
of Fe, Cu, and Mn as the control (Fig. 7G; Supplementary Figs. 

A            B            C 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
D                    E 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
F                    G 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Fig. 7. Phenotypes of OsZIP8- activation or -overexpressing trans-

genic plants grown on paddy fields. Representative photographs 

were taken after flowering. WT was compared with OsZIP8-D1 (A), 

Z8OX-1 (B), or Z8OX-3 (C). Bars = 10 cm. Plant height (D) and 

number of tillers (E) were recorded at flowering stage (n = 8). Zn (F) 

and Fe (G) contents were measured from 4 flag leaves at flowering 

stage. Error bars represent SE. Significant differences from WT 

were determined by Student’s t-tests. *, P < 0.05. 
 
 
S6C and S6D). These results suggested that zinc is important 
for plant growth. 
 
DISCUSSION 

 

In this study, we functionally characterized one of the rice ZIP 
transporter proteins, OsZIP8. Expression of OsZIP8 was in-
duced under Zn deficiency, but not when Fe, Cu, or Mn were 
lacking in the media. OsZIP8 was localized to the plasma 
membrane, as shown by the expression of the OsZIP8-GFP 
fusion protein in roots. These findings demonstrated that 
OsZIP8 is a plasma membrane-localized Zn transporter in rice. 

Because plants take up micronutrients from the soil, such 
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Table 1. Grain yield by OsZIP8 mutants grown on a paddy field. For 

yield, total spikelets and mature seeds were counted from 4 plants. 

Grain yield 

Line Genotype Total 

spikelets 

Mature 

seeds 

Fertility 

(%) 

WT 1575 ± 109 943 ± 88 60 ± 1 
OsZIP8-D1 

OsZIP8-D1 1291 ± 64 742 ± 96 60 ± 2 

WT 1982 ± 148 1182 ± 87 60 ± 2 
Z8OX-1 

T/T 1317 ± 194 832 ± 106 63 ± 2 

WT 2061 ± 334 1196 ± 202 58 ± 5 
Z8OX-3 

T/T 1646 ± 140 970 ± 80 59 ± 1 

 

 
transport and regulation must operate precisely and specifically. 
Substrate specificity of metal transporters is very important for 
maintaining adequate metal homeostasis and plant growth. ZIP 
proteins generally contribute to cytosolic Zn import. Here, ex-
pression of OsZIP8 was regulated by the status of Zn only, not 
by the levels of Fe, Mn, or Cu. In yeast, ZAP1 is the central 
player in plant responses to Zn deficiency (Zhao et al., 1998). 
This metal-responsive regulatory protein controls the expres-
sion of many genes by binding to Zn-responsive elements 
(ZRE) in the promoters of its target genes. In rice, two transcrip-
tion factors -- IDEF1 and IDEF2 -- specifically bind the Fe defi-
ciency-responsive cis-acting elements IDE1 and IDE2, respec-
tively (Kobayashi et al., 2007; Ogo et al., 2008), indicating that 
cis-elements/transcription factor interactions are functionally 
associated with Fe homeostasis. Because Zn deficiency-
responsive networks are largely unknown in rice, it will be inter-
esting to identify the consensus Zn-responsive elements from 
several Zn deficiency-inducible genes and, thereafter, find the 
novel transcription factors that regulate Zn homeostasis. 

Functional analysis using a Zn-uptake yeast mutant has indi-
cated that OsZIP8 acts as a specific Zn importer in rice plants. 
In our study, activation-tagging and over-expression trans-
genics differed in their patterns of accumulation for Zn, but not 
for Fe, Mn, or Cu. When excess Zn was applied, transgenics 
accumulated more in their roots, indicating that OsZIP8 is a Zn 
importer. 

An adequate Zn supply is important for plant growth (Cak-
mak, 2008; Palmgren et al., 2008). Zn deficiency is the most 
widespread micronutrient disorder that causes multiple symp-
toms in rice (Wissuwa et al., 2006). Under Zn deficiency, plants 
remain stunted and show substantial reduction in yields (Wis-
suwa et al., 2006). We observed that Zn concentrations in roots 
were higher in the transgenics than in WT irrespective of exter-
nal Zn status, whereas Zn concentrations in shoots and seeds 
were lower in the transgenics compared with WT. This led to 
shorter plants and reduced grain yields, indicating that en-
hanced expression of OsZIP8 could interrupt Zn homeostasis 
in rice, thus negatively influencing growth and productivity. 
Overexpression of OsZIP8 raised the Zn uptake from the soil, 
resulting in more accumulations in root cells. However, eleva-
tion of OsZIP8 expression might cause re-absorption of Zn to 
root cells that interfere with Zn movement from root cells to 
upper parts. A similar result was observed by overexpression of 
OsZIP4 (Ishimaru et al., 2007). We postulated that other genes 
are needed to enhance Zn transportation to shoots and seeds.  

Although phenotypes between activation tagging mutant and 
overexpressors were similar to each other, the relative Zn con-
centration in roots was higher in OsZIP8-D1 compared with the 
overexpressing-transgenic plants. The OsZIP8 OX plants 
showed reduction in tiller numbers, but not the OsZIP8-D1plants. 

These differences may be due to the promoters. Whereas the 
ubiquitin promoter caused ectopic overexpression, original 
expression patterns were maintained in OsZIP8-D1. 

Analysis of 35S-IRT1 transgenics has revealed that, when 
iron is limiting, the IRT1 protein is present only in the roots even 
though IRT1 mRNA is over-expressed constitutively throughout 
the plant (Connolly et al., 2002). This indicates that IRT1 is 
regulated post-transcriptionally. Furthermore, 35S-IRT1trans-
genic plants show no visible morphological changes in pheno-
type when grown in soil or under standard conditions (Connolly 
et al., 2002). In our activation-tagging and over-expression 
transgenics, transcripts were accumulated even under metal-
sufficient conditions, thereby altering plant architecture. OsZIP8- 
GFP fusion proteins, driven by the CaMV 35S promoter, also 
were detectable in the roots when metal supplies were ade-
quate. This demonstrated that post-transcriptional regulation 
does not play a significant role in our transgenic rice plants. 
 
Note: Supplementary information is available on the Molecules 
and Cells website (www.molcells.org). 
 

ACKNOWLEDGMENTS 

We are grateful to Kyungsook An and In-Soon Park for gene-
rating the transgenic lines, Jongdae Kyung for technical assis-
tance with the AAS measurements, Priscilla Licht for English 
editing, and Chang-Duk Jung for growing the transformed 
plants. This work was supported in part by grants from the Crop 
Functional Genomic Center, the 21st Century Frontier Program 
(Grant CG1111); the Biogreen 21 Program (034-001-007-03-
00), Rural Development Administration; and the Basic Re-
search Promotion Fund (KRF-2007-341-C00028); Kyung Hee 
University; and the National Science Foundation (grant no. 
DB10701119 to M.L.G.). 
 
REFERENCES 

 

An, S., Park, S., Jeong, D.H., Lee, D.Y., Kang, H.G., Yu, J.H., Hur, 
J., Kim, S.R., Kim, Y.H., Lee, M., et al. (2003). Generation and 
analysis of end sequence database for T-DNA tagging lines in 
rice. Plant Physiol. 133, 2040-2047. 

Bughio, N., Yamaguchi, H., Nishizawa, N.K., Nakanishi, H., and 
Mori, S. (2002). Cloning an iron-regulated metal transporter from 
rice. J. Exp. Bot. 53, 1677-1682. 

Cakmak, I. (2008). Enrichment of cereal grains with zinc, agronomic 
or genetic biofortification? Plant Soil. 302, 1-17. 

Colangelo, E.P., and Guerinot, M.L. (2006). Put the metal to the 
petal, metal uptake and transport throughout plants. Curr. Opin. 
Plant Biol. 9, 322-330. 

Connolly, E.L., Fett, J.P., and Guerinot, M.L. (2002). Expression of 
the IRT1 metal transporter is controlled by metals at the levels of 
transcript and protein accumulation. Plant Cell 14, 1347-1357. 

Eide, D.J. (2009). Homeostatic and adaptive responses to zinc 
deficiency in Saccharomyces cerevisiae. J. Biol. Chem. 284, 
18565-18569. 

Eide, D., Broderius, M., Fett, J., and Guerinot, M.L. (1996). A novel 
iron regulated metal transporter from plants identified by func-
tional expression in yeast. Proc. Natl. Acad. Sci. USA 93, 5624-
5628. 

Gaither, L.A., and Eide, D.J. (2001). Eukaryotic zinc transporters 
and their regulation. Biometals 14, 251-270. 

Guerinot, M.L. (2000). The ZIP family of metal transporters. Biochim. 
Biophys. Acta 1465, 190-198. 

Henriques, R., Jasik, J., Klein, M., Martinoia, E., Feller, U., Schell, J., 
Pais, M.S., and Koncz, C. (2002). Knock-out of Arabidopsis metal 
transporter gene IRT1 results in iron deficiency accompanied by 
cell differentiation defects. Plant Mol. Biol. 50, 587-597. 

Ishimaru, Y., Suzuki, M., Kobayashi, T., Takahashi, M., Nakanishi, 
H., Mori, S., and Nishizawa, N.K. (2005). OsZIP4, a novel zinc-
regulated zinc transporter in rice. J. Exp. Bot. 56, 3207-3214.  

Ishimaru, Y., Suzuki, M., Tsukamoto, T., Suzuki, K., Nakazono, M., 



558 Characterization of OsZIP8 

 

 

 

 

Kobayashi, T., Wada, Y., Watanabe, S., Matsuhashi, S., Taka-
hashi, M., et al. (2006). Rice plants take up iron as an Fe3+-
phytosiderophore and as Fe2+. Plant J. 45, 335-346. 

Ishimaru, Y., Masuda, H., Suzuki, M., Bashir, K., Takahashi, M., 
Nakanishi, H., Mori, S., and Nishizawa, N.K. (2007). Overex-
pression of the OsZIP4 zinc transporter confers disarrangement 
of zinc distribution in rice plants. J. Exp. Bot. 58, 2909-2915. 

Jeon, J.-S., Lee, S., Jung, K.-H., Jun, S.-H., Jeong, D.H., Lee, J., 
Kim, C., Jang, S., Lee, S.-Y., Yang, K., et al. (2000). T-DNA in-
sertional mutagenesis for functional genomics in rice. Plant J. 22, 
561-570.  

Jeong, D.H., An, S., Park, S., Kang, H.G., Park, G.G., Kim, S.R., 
Sim, J., Kim, Y.O., Kim, M.K., Kim, S.R., et al. (2006). Genera-
tion of a flanking sequence-tag database for activation-tagging 
lines in japonica rice. Plant J. 45, 123-132. 

Kawachi, M., Kobae, Y., Mori, H., Tomioka, R., Lee, Y., and 
Maeshima, M. (2009). A mutant strain Arabidopsis thaliana that 
lacks vacuolar membrane zinc transporter MTP1 revealed the 
latent tolerance to excessive zinc. Plant Cell Physiol. 50, 1156-
1170. 

Kobayashi, T., Ogo, Y., Itai, R.N., Nakanishi, H., Takahashi, M., Mori, 
S., and Nishizawa, N.K. (2007). The transcription factor IDEF1 
regulates the response to and tolerance of iron deficiency in 
plants. Proc. Natl. Acad. Sci. USA 104, 19150-19155. 

Krämer, U., Talke, I.N., and Hanikenne, M. (2007). Transition metal 
transport. FEBS Lett. 581, 2263-2272. 

Lee, S., and An, G. (2009). Overexpression of OsIRT1 leads to 
increased iron and zinc accumulations in rice. Plant Cell Environ. 
32, 408-416. 

Lee, S., Jeon, J.S., Jung, K.H., and An, G. (1999). Binary vector for 
efficient transformation of rice. J. Plant Biol. 42, 310-316. 

Lee, S., Kim, Y.Y., Lee, Y., and An, G. (2007). Rice P1B-type heavy- 
metal ATPase, OsHMA9, is a metal efflux protein. Plant Physiol. 
145, 831-842. 

Lin, Y.F., Liang, H.M., Yang, S.Y., Boch, A., Clemens, S., Chen, 
C.C., Wu, J.F., Huang, J.L., and Yeh, K.C. (2009). Arabidopsis 
IRT3 is a zinc-regulated and plasma membrane localized 
zinc/iron transporter. New Phytol. 182, 392-404. 

López-Millán, A.F., Ellis, D.R., and Grusak, M.A. (2004). Identifi-
cation and characterization of several new members of the ZIP 
family of metal ion transporters in Medicago truncatula. Plant 
Mol. Biol. 54, 583-596. 

Maser, P., Thomine, S., Schroeder, J.I., Ward, J.M., Hirschi, K., Sze, 
H., Talke, I.N., Amtmann, A., Maathuis, F.J., Sanders, D., et al. 
(2001). Phylogenetic relationships within cation transporter fami-
lies of Arabidopsis. Plant Physiol. 126, 1646-1667. 

Mizuno, T., Usui, K., Horie, K., Nosaka, S., Mizuno, N., and Obata, 
H. (2005). Cloning of three ZIP/Nramp transporter genes from a 
Ni hyperaccumulator plant Thlaspi japonicum and their Ni2+-
transport abilities. Plant Physiol. Biochem. 43, 793-801. 

Moreau, S., Thomson, R.M., Kaiser, B.N., Trevaskis, B., Guerinot, 
M.L., Udvardi, M.K., Puppo, A., and Day, D.A. (2002). GmZIP1 
encodes a symbiosis-specific zinc transporter in soybean. J. Biol. 
Chem. 277, 4738-4746. 

Nakanishi, H., Ogawa, I., Ishimaru, Y., Mori, S., and Nishizawa, N.K. 

(2006). Iron deficiency enhances cadmium uptake and translo-
cation mediated by the Fe2+ transporters OsIRT1 and OsIRT2 
in rice. Soil. Sci. Plant Nutr. 52, 464-469. 

Ogo, Y., Kobayashi, T., Itai, R.N., Nakanishi, H., Kakei, Y., Takaha-
shi, M., Toki, S., Mori, S., and Nishizawa, N.K. (2008). A novel 
NAC transcription factor, IDEF2, that recognizes the iron defi-
ciency-responsive element 2 regulates the genes involved in 
iron homeostasis in plants. J. Biol. Chem. 283, 13407-13417. 

Palmer, C.M., and Guerinot, M.L. (2009). Facing the challenges of 
Cu, Fe and Zn homeostasis in plants. Nat. Chem. Biol. 5, 333-
340. 

Palmgren, M.G., Clemens, S., Williams, L.E., Krämer, U., Borg, S., 
Schjørring, J.K., and Sanders, D. (2008). Zinc biofortification of 
cereals, problems and solutions. Trends Plant Sci. 13, 464-473. 

Park, J., Kim, Y.Y., Martinoia, E., and Lee, Y. (2008). Long-distance 
transporters of inorganic nutrients in plants. J. Plant Biol. 51, 
240-247. 

Pence, N.S., Larsen, P.B., Ebbs, S.D., Letham, D.L., Lasat, M.M., 
Garvin, D.F., Eide, D., and Kochian, L.V. (2000). The molecular 
physiology of heavy metal transport in the Zn/Cd hyperaccu-
mulator Thlaspi caerulescens. Proc. Natl. Acad. Sci. USA 97, 
4956-4960. 

Ramesh, S.A., Shin, R., Eide, D.J., and Schachtman, D.P. (2003). 
Differential metal selectivity and gene expression of two zinc 
transporters from rice. Plant Physiol. 133, 126-134. 

Varotto, C., Maiwald, D., Pesaresi, P., Jahns, P., Salamini, F., and 
Leister, D. (2002). The metal ion transporter IRT1 is necessary 
for iron homeostasis and efficient photosynthesis in Arabidopsis 
thaliana. Plant J. 31, 589-599. 

Vert, G., Grotz, N., Dedaldechamp, F., Gaymard, F., Guerinot, M.L., 
Briat, J.F., and Curie, C. (2002). IRT1, an Arabidopsis trans-
porter essential for iron uptake from the soil and for plant growth. 
Plant Cell 14, 1223-1233. 

Vert, G., Barberon, M., Zelazny, E., Séguéla, M., Briat, J.F., and 
Curie, C. (2009). Arabidopsis IRT2 cooperates with the high-
affinity iron uptake system to maintain iron homeostasis in root 
epidermal cells. Planta 229, 1171-1179. 

Wissuwa, M., Ismail, A.M., and Yanagihara, S. (2006). Effects of 
zinc deficiency on rice growth and genetic factors contributing to 
tolerance. Plant Physiol.142, 731-741. 

Yang, X., Huang, J., Jiang, Y., and Zhang, H.S. (2009). Cloning and 
functional identification of two members of the ZIP (Zrt, Irt-like 
protein) gene family in rice (Oryza sativa L.). Mol. Biol. Rep. 36, 
281-287. 

Zhao, H., and Eide, D. (1996a). The yeast ZRT1 gene encodes the 
zinc transporter protein of a high-affinity uptake system induced 
by zinc limitation. Proc. Natl. Acad. Sci. USA 93, 2454-2458. 

Zhao, H., and Eide, D. (1996b). The ZRT2 gene encodes the low 
affinity zinc transporter in Saccharomyces cerevisiae. J. Biol. 
Chem. 271, 23203-23210. 

Zhao, H., Butler, E., Rodgers, J., Spizzo, T., Duesterhoeft, S., and 
Eide, D. (1998). Regulation of zinc homeostasis in yeast by 
binding of the ZAP1 transcriptional activator to zinc-responsive 
promoter elements. J. Biol. Chem. 273, 28713-28720. 

 



<<
  /ASCII85EncodePages false
  /AllowTransparency false
  /AutoPositionEPSFiles true
  /AutoRotatePages /None
  /Binding /Left
  /CalGrayProfile (Gray Gamma 2.2)
  /CalRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CalCMYKProfile (ISO Coated v2 300% \050ECI\051)
  /sRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CannotEmbedFontPolicy /Error
  /CompatibilityLevel 1.3
  /CompressObjects /Off
  /CompressPages true
  /ConvertImagesToIndexed true
  /PassThroughJPEGImages true
  /CreateJDFFile false
  /CreateJobTicket false
  /DefaultRenderingIntent /Perceptual
  /DetectBlends true
  /DetectCurves 0.1000
  /ColorConversionStrategy /sRGB
  /DoThumbnails true
  /EmbedAllFonts true
  /EmbedOpenType false
  /ParseICCProfilesInComments true
  /EmbedJobOptions true
  /DSCReportingLevel 0
  /EmitDSCWarnings false
  /EndPage -1
  /ImageMemory 1048576
  /LockDistillerParams true
  /MaxSubsetPct 100
  /Optimize true
  /OPM 1
  /ParseDSCComments true
  /ParseDSCCommentsForDocInfo true
  /PreserveCopyPage true
  /PreserveDICMYKValues true
  /PreserveEPSInfo true
  /PreserveFlatness true
  /PreserveHalftoneInfo false
  /PreserveOPIComments false
  /PreserveOverprintSettings true
  /StartPage 1
  /SubsetFonts false
  /TransferFunctionInfo /Apply
  /UCRandBGInfo /Preserve
  /UsePrologue false
  /ColorSettingsFile ()
  /AlwaysEmbed [ true
  ]
  /NeverEmbed [ true
  ]
  /AntiAliasColorImages false
  /CropColorImages true
  /ColorImageMinResolution 150
  /ColorImageMinResolutionPolicy /Warning
  /DownsampleColorImages true
  /ColorImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /ColorImageResolution 150
  /ColorImageDepth -1
  /ColorImageMinDownsampleDepth 1
  /ColorImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeColorImages true
  /ColorImageFilter /DCTEncode
  /AutoFilterColorImages true
  /ColorImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /ColorACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.76
    /HSamples [2 1 1 2] /VSamples [2 1 1 2]
  >>
  /ColorImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.76
    /HSamples [2 1 1 2] /VSamples [2 1 1 2]
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 15
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 15
  >>
  /AntiAliasGrayImages false
  /CropGrayImages true
  /GrayImageMinResolution 150
  /GrayImageMinResolutionPolicy /Warning
  /DownsampleGrayImages true
  /GrayImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /GrayImageResolution 150
  /GrayImageDepth -1
  /GrayImageMinDownsampleDepth 2
  /GrayImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeGrayImages true
  /GrayImageFilter /DCTEncode
  /AutoFilterGrayImages true
  /GrayImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /GrayACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.76
    /HSamples [2 1 1 2] /VSamples [2 1 1 2]
  >>
  /GrayImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.76
    /HSamples [2 1 1 2] /VSamples [2 1 1 2]
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 15
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 15
  >>
  /AntiAliasMonoImages false
  /CropMonoImages true
  /MonoImageMinResolution 600
  /MonoImageMinResolutionPolicy /Warning
  /DownsampleMonoImages true
  /MonoImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /MonoImageResolution 600
  /MonoImageDepth -1
  /MonoImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeMonoImages true
  /MonoImageFilter /CCITTFaxEncode
  /MonoImageDict <<
    /K -1
  >>
  /AllowPSXObjects false
  /CheckCompliance [
    /None
  ]
  /PDFX1aCheck false
  /PDFX3Check false
  /PDFXCompliantPDFOnly false
  /PDFXNoTrimBoxError true
  /PDFXTrimBoxToMediaBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXSetBleedBoxToMediaBox true
  /PDFXBleedBoxToTrimBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXOutputIntentProfile (None)
  /PDFXOutputConditionIdentifier ()
  /PDFXOutputCondition ()
  /PDFXRegistryName ()
  /PDFXTrapped /False

  /Description <<
    /CHS <FEFF4f7f75288fd94e9b8bbe5b9a521b5efa7684002000410064006f006200650020005000440046002065876863900275284e8e55464e1a65876863768467e5770b548c62535370300260a853ef4ee54f7f75280020004100630072006f0062006100740020548c002000410064006f00620065002000520065006100640065007200200035002e003000204ee553ca66f49ad87248672c676562535f00521b5efa768400200050004400460020658768633002>
    /CHT <FEFF4f7f752890194e9b8a2d7f6e5efa7acb7684002000410064006f006200650020005000440046002065874ef69069752865bc666e901a554652d965874ef6768467e5770b548c52175370300260a853ef4ee54f7f75280020004100630072006f0062006100740020548c002000410064006f00620065002000520065006100640065007200200035002e003000204ee553ca66f49ad87248672c4f86958b555f5df25efa7acb76840020005000440046002065874ef63002>
    /DAN <>
    /DEU <>
    /ESP <>
    /FRA <>
    /ITA (Utilizzare queste impostazioni per creare documenti Adobe PDF adatti per visualizzare e stampare documenti aziendali in modo affidabile. I documenti PDF creati possono essere aperti con Acrobat e Adobe Reader 5.0 e versioni successive.)
    /JPN <>
    /KOR <FEFFc7740020c124c815c7440020c0acc6a9d558c5ec0020be44c988b2c8c2a40020bb38c11cb97c0020c548c815c801c73cb85c0020bcf4ace00020c778c1c4d558b2940020b3700020ac00c7a50020c801d569d55c002000410064006f0062006500200050004400460020bb38c11cb97c0020c791c131d569b2c8b2e4002e0020c774b807ac8c0020c791c131b41c00200050004400460020bb38c11cb2940020004100630072006f0062006100740020bc0f002000410064006f00620065002000520065006100640065007200200035002e00300020c774c0c1c5d0c11c0020c5f40020c2180020c788c2b5b2c8b2e4002e>
    /NLD (Gebruik deze instellingen om Adobe PDF-documenten te maken waarmee zakelijke documenten betrouwbaar kunnen worden weergegeven en afgedrukt. De gemaakte PDF-documenten kunnen worden geopend met Acrobat en Adobe Reader 5.0 en hoger.)
    /NOR <>
    /PTB <>
    /SUO <>
    /SVE <>
    /ENU <>
  >>
>> setdistillerparams
<<
  /HWResolution [2400 2400]
  /PageSize [595.276 841.890]
>> setpagedevice


