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Finally, our results (on the questionnaires) show that 
regardless of where sound and noise came from in eve-
ryday life, the RONDO was well accepted by the former 
OPUS 2 users.
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Regarding the comment of Wimmer et  al. on our article 
“Off the ear with no loss in speech understanding: compar-
ing the RONDO and the OPUS2 cochlear implant audio 
processors” [1], we would like to acknowledge that their 
comment has merit. Wimmer et al.’s article “Speech intel-
ligibility in noise with a single-unit cochlear implant audio 
processor” [2] found that speech understanding in noise 
with the RONDO was only significantly worse than with 
the OPUS 2 when speech was presented from the front and 
noise from the back (the S0N180 setting)—not when speech 
was presented from the front (S0N0) of the sides (S0NIL and 
S0NCL). Considering that our article did not specify the test 
setup we used for speech understanding in noise testing, it 
was inaccurate to assert that Wimmer et al.’s findings con-
tradicted our own or those of Mertens et al. [3] and Távora-
Vieira and Miller [4] without considering test setup.

We agree with the assertion that testing speech under-
standing in noise in different spatial settings gives a greater 
picture of our subjects’ hearing in “everyday life” than 
only testing in S0N0. We would, however, state that (1) 
hearing in everyday life cannot be adequately assessed by 
conducting speech testing only and that (2) subjective ques-
tionnaires, such as the HISQUI19 and RONDO-specific 
questionnaire used in our study, are valuable resources for 
assessing how CIs devices affect their users’ hearing lives. 
Ideally, future studies will use different spatial settings and 
subjective questionnaires to assess speech understanding. 

This reply refers to the comment available at doi:10.1007/s00405-
017-4465-3.
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