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Autonomy and duality 

While intellectuals have for centuries stood rather close to God, they 
have lately come down in the world in the footsteps of their former 
employel: They are less magisterial and solemn than they used to be. In 
the postmodern and post-Marxist West, intellectuals have massively 
renounced their exalted position as guardians of universally grounded 
values and truths, or as spokesmen for classes that they first endowed 
with a solemn historical mission. They no longer claim an exquisite 
calling, an obligatory normative identity, or a special accountability for 
the whole. Shorn of its rationalistic paraphernalia and missionary ide- 
ology, the intellectual profession reveals itself to be as beautiful and 
ugly as all other occupations, and vulnerable to the temptations that 
wait upon all forms of professional specialization. 1 

This worldly descent of the intellectuals follows a similar "normaliza- 
tion" of the exceptional stature of science. To Feyerabend's notorious 
question "what is so special about science?" the moderu social studies 
of science univocally reply: little or nothing. The demarcation between 
science and society is no longer a self-evident outcome of stable norms 
of rationality or secure methodical principles, but tends to be seen as 
contextually variable and essentially contestable. The ancient privilege 
that accorded science a less messy, opportunistic, idiosyncratic, inter- 
est-ridden, and "political" character than other social practices has 
been largely rescinded. That science is "something special" and differs 
in essential respects from other cultural and social activities is exposed 
as little more than a tenacious prejudice. 2 

In this article I argue that the intellectual profession, while perhaps 
representing "nothing special" in philosophical terms, still retains a par- 
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ticularity of its own, a specific difference or autonomy that it is impor- 
tant to emphasize and maintain. The postmodernist disenchanters of 
the intellect and the constructivist normalizers of science are perhaps 
too zealous in relativizing and levelling down distinctions. Feyerabend's 
tarnishing of the intellectual experts as "one special and rather greedy 
group" goes hand-in-hand with a rather drastic idealization of the lay- 
man and his capacity for democratically supervising science. A similar 
anarchist streak is encountered in Foucault, who, in his effort to de- 
frock all intellectual prophets, lawgivers, and problems-solvers, at one 
point exclaims: "down with spokespersons!" Bourdieu's suggestion that 
every man should become his own spokesperson and must learn "to 
speak rather than being spoken to" likewise antechambers in this anar- 
chist utopia? 

In all of these postures, however, the initial radicalism is eventually 
tempered. Feyerabend wisely refuses to root out the experts entirely: he 
advises using them, but never fully trusting them. Foucault is sensible 
enough not to preach the annihilation of all those who speak "for and 
above the others," but spells out more modest tasks for what he terms 
the "specific" intellectual. Bourdieu even advocates a "Realpolitik of 
Reason," according to which a self-consciously "corporatist" defense of 
the autonomous interests of intellectuals providentially coincides with 
a "politics of the universal. ''4 These examples suggest that the profana- 
tion of intellectual work cannot result in a complete effacing of all. 
sociological distinctions and epistemological demarcations without 
putting the principle of social differentiation itself at risk. The very fact 
that the intellectual is scaled down to more modest dimensions rather 
enjoins us to defend the autonomy of intellectual work in a pragmatic 
and more political sense, without having to resort to traditionally high- 
strung values and principles such as the "desire for truth," "rationality," 
or "value-freedom," or to sovereign distinctions such as those that 
divide knowledge from interest, power, and profit. 

Although professionalized knowledge production does of course pre- 
suppose a minimal craftsmanlike claim to cognitive and methodologi- 
cal superiority, this claim need no longer be certified by a traditional 
logic of justification. Since expert knowledge is manufactured in auto- 
nomously specialized fields of social activity, it is in several respects 
superior (albeit in other aspects inferior) to the knowledge fabricated 
outside. Knowledge-producing institutions are social sanctuaries, loci 
of institutionalized distanciation that insulate themselves to a certain 
extent from the realms of professional politics and economics and from 
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unspecialized ordinary life. They obey a distinctive, more relaxed time 
economy than other specialized occupations (e.g., journalism), are 
screened off to a certain extent from the pressures of publici~, and 
produce for a comparatively more esoteric collegial audience. The 
defense of intellectual autonomy thus entails the protection of the insti- 
tutional capacity for systematic, methodical knowledge production, in 
a minimal definition that does not entail commitment to a particular 
scientific methodology? 

This is why the idea of intellectual autonomy constitutes the central 
lever of my subsequent considerations. 'Autonomy" is a felicitous 
knowledge-political term because it not only specifies a crucial precon- 
dition for sustained professional competence, but simultaneously sen- 
sitizes us to the "corporatist" and conspiratorial dark side that inheres 
in all forms of professionalism. In this dual role, it also defines the axis 
of recent sociological debates about the productive and repressive 
functions of modern higher knowIedge professions. The classical func- 
tionalist view disseminated by Durkheim, Spencer, Tawney, and 
Parsons emphasized positive characteristics such as institutionalized 
expertise, democratic control over knowledge and technology, and a 
collective ethos of disinterested public service. The critical approach 
that was elaborated from the middle sixties on by authors such as 
Johnson, Freidson, Larson, and Illich, chose to highlight negative traits 
such as social closure, self-interest, privilege, control over clients and 
their needs, and the ideological legitimation thereof. 6 

The former approach, which rubbed shoulders with the vested com- 
plimentary self-image of professionals, encoded the quest for auton- 
omy in the bid for rational self-regulation that the production and 
application of superior knowledge and complex skills in the service of 
the general interest supposedly required. In the alternative approach, 
autonomy was instead connected to the private interest of professional 
elites who wished to extend their monopolistic control over a specific 
market of expertise and the material and immaterial profits that were 
promised by i t .  7 As a result of such contradictory determinations, the 
concept of professional autonomy gradually adopted a Janus face: it 
came to display" an intrinsic duplicity or duality in which good and evil, 
functional necessity and dysfunctional domination, appeared to con- 
spire closely. 8 

In what follows I focus more intently upon this "simultaneity" or intrin- 
sic coalition of these two faces of modern (intellectual) professionalism, 
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in an effort to supersede the barren opposition between the func- 
tionalist and critical traditions. I shall proceed from the hypothesis that 
the enabling and disabling dimensions of intellectual professions are 
interconnected in a much more immediate and constitutive sense than 
can be grasped from the dualistic opposition in which both traditions 
hold each other prisoner. "Duality" does not mean that the productive 
and exploitative dimensions, "eufunctions" and dysfunctions, can simp- 
ly be joined together by simple addition. It entails something like a 
generative or symbiotic coincidence of "light" and "dark" sides. These 
polarities appear to presume and precondition one another in a sense 
that falls out of range for one-dimensional "optimistic" or "pessimistic" 
approaches. 

If applied to the issue of intellectuals and spokespersons, one implica- 
tion is that their social indispensability is organically tied to the social 
threat that is generated by their presence in the division of labor. Intel- 
lectuals are necessary and useful, but they simultaneously present a 
social hazard. Indeed, what makes intellectual work socially risky 
inheres in the same structural properties that define its social utility. 
Intellectuals are socially "freed" to exercise the office of professional 
thinking, researching, speaking, and writing. Because they have been 
educated and trained in such skills and exercise them as workaday rou- 
tines, they are in many respects better at them than ordinary people. 
But the same professionalism and specialty turns intellectual spokes- 
men into a social threat, since by definition they speak on behalf of and 
in th e place of others; and in extreme cases strive permanently to ex- 
clude others from entering the arenas where one may speak publicly 
and from the means by which one may learn to do so. Because this is 
how they earn their daily bread and whence they derive power and 
prestige, intellectuals develop both individual and collective interests in 
opposition to those whom their services degrade into dependents. 

In this dual conception of intellectual autonomy, the optimistic and 
pessimistic connotations of "disinterestedness" and "interest" inter- 
mingle, dismissing traditional dualisms such as those that divide truth 
from power or involvement from detachment. Detachment and in- 
volvement can no longer be treated as contrary concepts or as polar 
extremities that draw a field of force or a continuum between them, but 
henceforth make up two faces of one and the same "knowledge-politi- 
cal" Janus head. 9 The autonomous, occupationally differentiated pro- 
duction of knowledge presupposes something like an institutional dis- 
tanciation or a socially defined form of detachment that is inseparable 
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from a close involvement with shared corporative or professional inter- 
ests. This implies that detachment as a social-institutional determinant 
of intellectual and scientific practice no longer needs the protective jus- 
tification of a philosophical theory of value-freedom. 

Protection of relative autonomy toward the outside (the celebrated 
"academic freedom") is not a normative principle that self-evidently 
emerges from the "nature" of intellectual and scientific work, but an 
entrenchment requiring incessant knowledge-political efforts toward 
the formation and upkeep of corporatist interest coalitions. Inside the 
relatively autonomous and hence collectively distanced field, knowl- 
edge-political competition rages and once again erases all traces of 
disinterestedness. Initially, therefore, detachment is little more than a 
secondary effect of the institutionalized objectivity or collective 
"estrangement" that an autonomous intellectual industry is capable of 
imposing upon its industrialists. Secondly, detachment is produced by 
the interested objectifications to which intellectual competitors mutual- 
ly force each other in their agonistic crossplay of criticism and anti- 
criticism. Both externally and internally such objectifying mechanisms 
have everything to do with the politics of knowledge and next to 
nothing with the classical ethos of value-freedom. 

The scientific field 

In this section, I examine a theory, elements of which have already sur- 
faced in the previous section, that supplies intriguing thought material 
for a further elaboration of a pragmatic, knowledge-political notion of 
intellectual autonomy. Indeed, Pierre Bourdieu's field theory of science 
and his conception of the role of intellectuals positions the concept of 
autonomy so centrally that it performs almost as a sociological deputy 
of more traditional criteria of truth and rationality: Professionalism and 
autonomy go far toward defining the specificity of the intellectual and 
scientific fields in their most authentic state. Furthermore, in critical 
abnegation of the de-differentation proclaimed by radical social studies 
of science, Bourdieu maintains a principled distinction between an 
"external reading," which thematizes the incorporatior~ of science in the 
wider social cosmos, and an "internal reading," which is oriented 
toward the concatenation of knowledge and (symbolic) power inside 
the scientific microcosmos itself. 1° 
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Before entering upon a discussion of Bourdieu's perspective, however, 
I first need to clarify my usage of the protean concept of "intellectual" 
and its relation to adjacent concepts such as "professional," "expert," 
and "academic scientist." First, it makes little sense to hope for "objec- 
tive" definitions of any of these categories, attainable by means of 
enumerative or "finger-pointing" exercises. All defining portraits of 
intellectuals, professionals, experts, and scientists are simultaneously 
self-portraits, often attempts to delineate a cherished identity, and 
hence liable to entail claims that are essentially knowledge-political 
in nature. For Bourdieu, the very definition of intellectuals, scientists, 
and professionals is itself continually at risk and at stake in struggles 
within intellectual, professional, and scientific fields. 11 Secondly, as 
evidenced by the above account, and following the lead of Feyerabend, 
Foucault, and again Bourdieu, I refrain from drawing any hard-and-fast 
demarcation lines between intellectuals and professionals or scientific 
experts. 12 The reported fall of the "general" and the concomitant rise of 
the "specific" intellectual has erased much of the sociological and 
normative distance between properly intellectual and professional 
work, which can no longer be usefully counterposed in the manner of a 
universalist, critical dedication to Culture or to the moral community 
as a Whole vs. a particularist devotion to self-serving corporative inter- 
ests. Cultural pessimists such as Hofstadter, Bloom, and Jacoby consis- 
tently underrate both the elitist hazards of emphasizing the universalist 
calling of intellectuals as well as the technical and social necessity of 
specialization, ignoring the extent to which professionalism has be- 
come an inescapable foundation for the credible performance of intel- 
lectuals in the public world. 

Nevertheless, Feyerabend, Foucault, and Bourdieu continue to portray 
intellectuals as (somewhat) more  than experts and scientists, insofar as 
the former tend to take on wider issues that open up the professions to 
each other and to the political. In contrast to the deceased "grand" 
intellectual, however, the new professional intellectual remains more 
closely involved with partial fields of competence and their local poli- 
tics of knowledge, and refuses to enter the arena of "big" politics as an 
alter ego and potential substitute for the professional politician. As an 
"anti-political" politician, she first of all engages with political issues 
within the profession, and typically meddles with "big" politics where 
domestic professional issues border on or erupt into larger public 
debates. Meanwhile, she does so as a part-time, though sophisticated 
amateur, anxious both to guard her own professional autonomy and to 
respect that of the politicians she challenges and criticizes. In this 
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framework, the problem of the public role of intellectuals is recast as a 
problem of the "two faces" of intellectual professionalism, irrespective 
of whether intellectuals speak for people or for things, or whether they 
speak in public places or in the more restricted spaces where they pri- 
marily encounter their fellow professionals. 

It is precisely this tense coalition between knowledge-political duality 
and professional autonomy that is also at the heart of Bourdieu's view 
of the social logic of science. Indeed, Bourdieu's field theory of science 
attempts to balance a generic definition, which has a levelling or dis- 
enchanting effect, with a specification, which produces a contrary 
demarcating effect. The generic definition undercuts the traditional 
celebration of science as an exception to the rule of a general theory of 
fields or a generalized "economy of practices," The operation of the 
scienfific field presupposes the existence of and itself generates a spe- 
cific type of interest; scientific practices only appear disinterested when 
compared with alternative interests that are produced in different 
fields. The competitive game of science is oriented toward the specific 
stake of gaining a monopoly over scientific authority, in which technical 
competence and symbolic power are inextricably intertwined. Hence 
the scientific struggle is characterized by an "essential duality" in which 
intrinsic intellectual and extrinsic material interests, intellectual and 
political strategies, epistemological conflicts and power conflicts are 
indissolubly j oined.13 

In the specifying operation, the emphasis is displaced from the inter- 
ested, political-strategic, "capitalizing" character of scientific practice 
toward the "other means" with which this quasi-political or quasi-eco- 
nomic rivalry is conducted. Here we are not so much concerned with 
knowledge politics but rather with knowledge politics; not with the 
accumulation of economic or  political capital but rather with that of 
cultural or informational capital. The axiom about "intrinsic duality" is 
now read in reverse, because the analytic focus is redirected toward the 
specific manner in which rational-scientific knowledge and technical 
competences turn into vehicles for the accumulation of symbolic power 
or symbolic capital. Not "ordinary" profit-seeking or "naked" power- 
grabbing (insofar as these exist at all) are operative here, but the urge 
for recognition, for a brilliant reputation, for a distinctive name; a forrn 
of interest that is simultaneously constituted and mystified by the overt 
dismissal of "ordinary" and "vulgar" objects of interest such as money 
mad power. 
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In this manner Bourdieu's model does justice both to the internal co- 
habitation of knowledge and politics and to the external divorce 
between the professional manufacture of knowledge and "outside 
worlds" such as politics, economics, or journalism. Both in the inter- 
face between science and the outside world and in the agonistic world 
inside, the traditional opposition between disinterestedness and inte- 
rest evaporates, severing the time-honored connection between intel- 
lectual distanciation and the positivist or Weberian conception of neu- 
trality. Indeed, if the truth about the social world is not constituted in 

spite of but precisely as a result of the knowledge-political interests of 
the sociologist, 14 the political logic of knowledge can only fully unfold 
as soon as science has emancipated itself sufficiently from external 

political (or economic) interests. On balance, the very science that ner- 
vously advertises itself as neutral and detached turns out to be pulled 
by political strings, while truly autonomous science can live without 
this posture of objectivity and neutrality. 

Thus distanciation, both in its external and internal dimensions, is 
immediately derived from specific forms of engagement. With respect 
to the broader relation between "theory" and "practice" or between the 
intellectual world and the everyday life world, Bourdieu draws our 
attention to the social determinations that condition the intellectual 
attitude as such, the "scholarly" or "contemplative" gaze directed 
towards the social world, As soon as we begin to observe, we effect an 
epistemological break that is simultaneously a social break, because we 
withdraw more or less completely from the world. This posture of the 
"impartial spectator" is not only socially exceptional but is also sup- 
ported by concrete social privileges. Detachment is not a product of 
methodological morality but of the "scholarly situation," the specific 
habitus of professional "schoolmen;' and presupposes the "scholb or 
otiurn" or the specific "idleness" that marks out the contemplative fife. 
Distanciation is a practical relation to practice. It is this practical 
engagement that the "ethnocentrism of the Savants" functions to con- 
ceal. 1~ 

A similarly intrinsic rapport between involvement and detachment is 
manifest in the internal analysis. The scientific field constitutes the the- 
atre of a more or less unequal struggle between (usually) two parties 
who are endowed with unequal quantities of specific capital and are 
therefore unequally equipped to appropriate the products and profits 
of scientific labor: the dominant or established elite and the dominated 
groups of outsiders and newcomers. The established group normally 
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opts for a strategy of conservation of the scientific status quo with 
which its interests are immediately linked. New entrants are capable of 
"choosing" a comparatively tranquil strategy of succession, or they can 
adopt the risk strategy of subversion of vested scientific authority, 
entailing novel redefinitions of the stakes and confines of the game. The 
struggle every actor has to engage in to enforce his own authority as a 
legitimate producer is invariably also a struggle to impose the "mode of 
production" and the definition of scientificity that maximally concurs 
with his own specific interestsJ 6 

It is this objective logic of rivalry between established and newcomers 
and the resultant cross-checking of their mutual products, which un- 
intentionally turns the pursuit of self-interest into a motor of scientific 
progress. The anarchic antagonism of private interests is transformed 
into a scientific dialectic, as every actor is forced, when challenging and 
resisting his opponents, to adopt an instrumentarium that lends his 
polemical purposes the universal scope of a methodical critique. This is 
how social mechanisms enforce the realization of universal norms of 
rationality. The libido dorninandi can only be satisfied by submitting to 
the specific censorship of the field, and by being sublimated into a libi- 
do sciendi, which can only triumph over its adversaries by opposing 
theorem to theorem, refutation to demonstration, and one scientific 
fact to another scientific fac t .  17 

Facts, values, and performative effects 

Although "duality" and "autonomy" figure prominently in Bourdieu's 
sociology of science, the epistemological status of these key terms 
remains troublesome. Duality is of course first of all an escape word, a 
polemical foil that twice delimits one's position: over against free- 
floating intellectualism on the one hand and all forms of (economic and 
political) interest-reductionism on the other. TbSs is enough to trans- 
form it into a term of embarassment that only provisionally liberates us 
from the procrustean alternative imposed by such well-established con- 
ceptual dichotomies. In addition, adjectives such as "intrinsic" or 
"essential" are epistemologically perplexing, because they suggest an 
essenfialist dialectic that claims to discover objectively determined 
contradictions in the heart of things. 

Bourdieu himself tends to present the principle of duality as a theoreti- 
cal summary of a string of empirical-analytical observationsJ 8 The 
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same empirical rigor is invested in his presentation of the concept of 
relative autonomy and his view of the historically structured specificity 
of the intellectual, scientific, and other cultural fields. Beneath such 
stoically descriptive or explanatory intentions, however, concepts such 
as duality and autonomy also appear to effectuate a subterranean nor- 
rnativity that is nowhere accounted for or recognized in so many words. 
Obviously, Bourdieu's Nietzschean (or better: Spinozist) impatience 
with all forms of utopianism and moralism is so pervasive, and his trust 
in the capabilities of a "rigorously" empirical science so overwhelming, 
that his field theory regularly slides toward objectivism and the risk of 
reification. 19 

Although a score of classical dualisms are convincingly put to rest, 
Bourdieu appears to underestimate the continuing hold upon his work 
of the obstinate antinomy of normativism versus naturalism or that of 
facts versus values. 2° On this point, his reflexive critique of objectivism 
appears insufficiently radical. Even though he announces his intention 
to think beyond the old antinomy between the positive and the nor- 
mative, and reaches for a form of ethics that purports to supersede it, it 
remains unclear which version of the classical antinomy is put to the 
test (the neo-Kantian one? the positivist one?) and how precisely the 
rift between Sein and Sollen should be mended. It should also be noted 
that Bourdieu retains a distinctly positivistic, Durkheimian order of 
epistemological priority, according to which the ethical quality of social 
science is ultimately derivable from its explanatory power. It is the 
knowledge of objective determinations and objective necessities that 
circumscribes a form of freedom that in turn may condition a modest 
practical ethics. Indeed, reflexive sociology is an ethic because it is a 
science. 21 Elsewhere Bourdieu frames his critique of the naive utopi- 
anism of the classical philosophy and sociology of science in such a 
manner as virtually to presuppose an epistemological distinction 
between facts and values. Merton is indicted for incorrectly offering 
the normative rules that figure in scientists' self-images as descriptions 
of the positive laws of the scientific mode of production itself, whereas 
"the market in scientific goods has its laws, and they have nothing to do 
with ethics." This is enough to suggest that these "immanent" laws of 
the field can be determined according to a canon of empirical exacti- 
tude that is exempt from all normativity. 22 

Both the principle of duality and that of autonomy, however, can only 
be sensibly defended if one acknowledges that they both represent 
more than descriptive generalizations, and circularly knot together 
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normative and empirical propositions in a seamless epistemological 
web. In both cases the description immediately posits the norm. "Ines- 
capable" or "intrinsic" duality, of course, is one way of saying that the 
good or functional and the bad or dysfunctional aspects of intellectual 
practices are tied together much more closely than is normally ac- 
counted for. 23 Due to such rapprochements, the polar opposites change 
their normative hue. The good shades into something less good, but 
what used to be considered evil also becomes a little less so. The 
ddmasqud of the mandarins and of their narcissistic ideology of dis- 
interestedness and disengagement is balanced by the epistemological 
rehabilitation of previously dark and marginal phenomena such as 
competition, interest, accumulation of symbolic capital, and (knowl- 
edge) politics. 

For example, the definition of the intellectual and scientific world as an 
agonistic arena or as a capital market where unequally endowed parties 
compete for mutual recognition and distinction, constitutes much more 
than a cool observation concerning the allegedly impersonal opera- 
tion of the objective laws of the field. This way of describing things 
includes a fair sample of normative suggestions: that scientific rational- 
ity is not a singular and uniform phenomenon, that it is not definition- 
ally constrained by the quest for consensus, and that conflict, competi- 
tion, and struggle fulfill a positive, generative function in the produc- 
tion of knowledge. 24 A similar observation is valid for the definition of 
the stake of the intellectual game as itself one of the stakes in the intel- 
lectual game, and the concomitant thesis that there are no arbiters in 
the field who are not themselves interested parties to the dispute. -~5 At 
first hearing, this may sound like an empirical generalization; but the 
proposition is at least as normative as it is descriptive, because it entails 
an implicit plea for a radical pluralism of truth and method. 26 

If it is true that the bulk of analytical concepts and propositions in 
Bourdieu's sociological lexicon carry a normative surplus and mingle 
facts with values, they can more fruitfully be read as performative 
definitions that (re)describe their object in such a m ~ n e r  that the de- 
scription simultaneously attempts to (re)cream what it purports to de- 
scribe. "Performativity" is a useful denotation of the knoMedge-politi- 
cal construction effect of representations that naturally combine nor- 
mative and empirical judgments. Notwithstanding Bourdieu's extra- 
ordinary sensitivity to the ordering function of language and to the con- 
structivist truth that words can make and break things, 27 his approach 
once again appears to incur a reflexive deficit. His failure to appreciate 
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the performative significance of his own theory tends to transform all 
supposedly "realistic" statements about objective structures, relation- 
ships, and positions, or about the incontrovertible primacy of objective 
laws of the field, into ever so many reifications. In violation of his stated 
principles, Bourdieu appears to abandon his theory in the nick of time 
to embrace a rhetoric of totality and transcendence according to which 
the "complete system of strategies," the "game as such;' may now be 
reviewed from an allegedly neutral position outside and above the 
game. 28 

If we refocus upon the problem of specificity or relative autonomy, we 
encounter a similar objectivist slant. Despite a deep sensitivity to the 
classifying effect of social and social-scientific classifications, which 
definitely sets him apart from the crowd of his fellow-sociologists, 
Bourdieu still underestimates the extent to which every codifying 
representation of social likenesses and differences, of frontiers, 
domains, articulations, and instances, functions to create the same so- 
cial universe that it claims objectively or realistically to mirror. The 
defining sociologist engages just like any ordinary actor in the struggle 
for the imposition of legitimate classifications, and classifies others in 
order "to tell them what they are and what they have to be: '29 In similar 
fashion, sociological claims about specificity or relative autonomy, 
according to which different social fields are expected to "obey" differ- 
ent objective logics or different "immanent necessities," are not osten- 

sire but performative definitions by means of which the sociologist 
forces the social facts that he defines into obedience and submission? ° 
Like everybody else, Bourdieu participates in the social struggle for 
classification. Like everybody else, he "works on" the field rather than 
divining its innermost logic. 

In this interpretation, the relative autonomy of the scientific field not 
only constitutes an empirical-historical variable but also erects a nor- 
mative yardstick. The historical-sociological analysis of science imme- 
diately (and circularly) suggests its own criterion of scientificity. 31 The 
autonomization of the scientific field secures the development of spe- 
cific field laws which in turn guarantee the advance of rationality. As 
the accumulated scientific stock multiplies, the struggle for social 
recognition is increasingly sublimated into a struggle for scientific 
recognition, i.e., a type of recognition that can only be conferred in a 
field of "restricted production;' in a system of peer review by col- 
leagues who are simultaneously competitors. The performative impli- 
cation is that scientists shouM actually recognize no other clients than 
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their competitors, and shouM in fact exclude as illegitimate all ex- 
changes not considered legal tender in the field. 

This performative tonality is also discernible in Bourdieu's conception 
of the "inaugural revolution," according to which the development of 
the relative autonomy of a particular field takes a qualitative jump that 
fundamentally alters its domestic logic of competition. Because the 
costs of entry rise steeply and continued investment in the field be- 
comes increasingly drawn-out and costly, homogeneity among the 
competitors increases, the contrast between conservative and subver- 
sive strategies diminishes, and great periodic revolutions are replaced 
by numerous small permanent revolutions that are liberated from 
external political effects and "social arbitrariness. ''~2 An "authentic" 
scientific field is accordingly defined as one in which polemical dis- 
putes are encased in a more fundamental consensus about the stakes of 
the game and the means with which to resolve disagreements; a dis- 
sensus that derives its productivity precisely from the objective agree- 
ment that undergirds it. 33 

A Realpolitik of reason? 

In my view, therefore, the principles of knowledge-political "duality" 
and "relative autonomy" must be read as performative propositions, 
which together lay the foundations for a new normative-empirical 
epistemology. The double operation of Bourdieuan field theory, which 
"evens out" the deconstruction of the traditional concept of truth with a 
social demarcation between science and other social fields, appears 
rigorously to exchange normative propositions for empirical ones, but 
at closer range turns out to be unable to divest itself of a residual nor- 
mativity. Truth and rationality are conceived as compelling effects of a 
social mechanism of nonviolent (but not interest-free) rivalry, which 
can only be installed in a self-regulating and autarchic scientific field. 
Thus, knowledge-political rivalry and relative field autonomy take the 
place formerly reserved for classical criteria of rationality, and combine 
to make up a new twofold criterion of scientificity. They constitute two 
sides of the same social-epistemological coin. 

However, Bourdieu's work also bears traces of an Objectivistic "mis- 
recognition" of its own basic principles. His clairn to be able to survoler 
the entire complex of strategies in the field still underwrites the possi- 
bility of a sovereign, totalizing point of view and a neutral outsider's 



92 

position, which are twice incompatible with the radical perspectivism 
of a dual theory of interests. Bourdieu seems imperfectly aware of the. 
fact that his statements about so-called objective laws of the scientific 
field possess a crypto-normative quality and are without exception per- 
formative constructions. This 'Yield objectivism" tends to invite reifying 
definitions of the limits and specific stakes of particular fields, which in 
turn conflict with the neighboring conviction that both, and hence also 
the identity of the legitimate players in the field, are permanently and 
irreversibly contested and contestable? 4 

In summary, the idea of a neutral foundation for objective truth and for 
universal conditions of scientific rationality are furtively readmitted 
through the sociological back door. Indeed, Bourdieu tends to advance 
his field theory as a sociological underpinning of the "universal validity 
of scientific reason," for example when he summarily crucifies the 
"nihilistic subjectivism" that is attributed to the Strong Programme and 
to Woolgar & Latour, or takes on postmodernist philosophy more 
generally. 35 In conscious paradox, this brand of universalism is consist- 
ently paired to and grounded in a particularistic interest theory. Rather 
than quarrying in a Habermasian vein for universal preconditions of 
communicative rationality, Bourdieu insists upon specifying the social 
and historical conditions that force actors to take an interest in the uni- 
versal, i.e., constrain them to contribute to the production of universal 
truth through the push and pull of their strategic self-interests. That is 
why he counteracts the idea of a universalist pragmatics of language 
with his own alternative of a "politics of the universal" or a "Realpolitik 
of Reason." 36 

In this defense of universalism by particularistic means ("private vices, 
public virtues"), the idea of relative autonomy once again occupies a 
prominent position. This is clearly corroborated by Bourdieu's concep- 
tion of the "anti-political" calling of intellectuals. Intellectuals are 
"paradoxical beings" who enter upon the historical stage by super- 
seding the opposition between pure culture and social engagement. 
They are "bi-dimensional" beings that belong to an intellectually auton- 
omous field and hence must respect its indigenous laws, but who simul- 
taneously deploy their specific expertise and authority in political ac- 
tivity outside of it. They intervene in politics without turning into politi- 
cians, without ceasing to be full-time cultural producers. Contrary to 
the traditional antinomy between autonomy and engagement, it is 
therefore perfectly possible to exercise both simultaneously. 37 
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We cannot fail to notice that this portrayal of the identity of intellec- 
tuals is once again predominantly introduced as a realistic, empirical- 
genetic definition. Ethical-political interventions by intellectuals should 
be grounded first and foremost upon a "rigorous" understanding of the 
operation and historical constitution of the intellectual field. Both for- 
mulation and context, however, make it abundantly clear that this def- 
inition harbors critically normative elements, and that, as a result, the 
figure of the intellectual, acquires a distinctly performative profile. 3s 
The representation of intellectuals as two-dimensional beings and the 
stylization of their anti-political engagement constitute a hybrid mix- 
ture of facts and values, and cannot be simply derived from a detached 
reading of historical events. A non-polemical, non-perspectival charac- 
terization of their "essential" identity, such as Bourdieu still seems to 
advocate here, of course also runs against his conviction, vented else- 
where, that the definition of what makes a "true" intellectual is always 
and invariably at stake in the intellectual field itself. 39 

Leaving aside this epistemological conundrum, we may notice that 
Bourdieu's conception of an "anti-political politics" of the intellectuals 
harbors the same explicit synthesis of involvement and detachment we 
have encountered several times before. The "paradoxical" nature of 
intellectuals simultaneously requires us to strengthen their autonomy 
and to guard against the temptations of the ivory tower. This is realiz- 
able if institutions are created that enable them to intervene in politics 
under their own authority, especially in order to gain control over the 
material means of cultural production and intellectual legitimation. 
Intellectuals are therefore under an obligation to value the defense of 
their own autonomous interests as their primary task: defense of the 
autonomy of the field must even be accorded top priority. 4° For too 
long intellectuals have sheltered themselves behind the interests of 
other groups and classes and celebrated these as universal interests. 
Now it is time to speak up for their own. Intellectuals must no longer 
feel remorse in defending their own corporatist privileges, since "by 
defending themselves as a whole, they defend the universal." Protection 
of their corporafive autonomy thus effectively coincides with the de- 
fense of the social conditions of the possibility of rational thought, as 
they are paradigmafically exemplified in the scientific field, where no 
one is able to succeed over anyone else without arming himself with 
better arguments, reasonings, and demonstrations. 41 

What is most striking in this "corporatism of the universal" is its almost 
dialectical configuration of opposites. On the one hand, Bourdieu does 



94 

not hesitate to picture the defense of intellectuals' professional auton- 
omy as a matter of collective interest bargaining. But neither does he. 
shrink from sublimating this corporative interest into a universal inter- 
est, so that universalism tends to turn into an immediate corollary of 
field autonomy. Consequently, his politique de la raison is still tainted 
with a residue of rationalistic idealism and by a concomitant under- 
estimation of the dark sides of intellectual professionalism - including 
his own. The corporatism of the intellectuals is euphemistically 
wrapped in a residually Hegelian notion about the universal class. Dif- 
ferent from Gouldner's "neo-Hegelian" notion about intellectuals as a 
"flawed universal class," however, universalism does not arise from the 
internalization of a normative "culture of critical discourse," but from a 
set of sociological constraints that force critical cross-control of intel- 
lectual products; while the corporatist '~laws" are not so much set in 
contradiction to, as seen as pertinently instrumental to the attainment 
of whatever universality there is currently to be gained. This indeed is 
true Realpolitik, because local corporatist interests are no longer 
masked by universalistic claims, but are now openly celebrated as cen- 
tral cog-wheels in the grand engine of sociological providence. 

Bourdieu, then, steadily tends to universalize this corporatism and its 
adjoining sociological theory of rationality. 42 His "dual" interest per- 
spective is therefore euphemized both in the internal and in the exter- 
nal dimensions. On balance, and like Gouldner, he has difficulty in 
accommodating the true Janus face of intellectual autonomy, according 
to which general interests and group interests, public benefits and pri- 
vate vices (or "good" and "evil") come together much more intrinsically 
and symbiotically than is accounted for by the optimistic mechanics of 
his latter-day invisible hand. The professionalization of intellectual 
labor inescapably includes a dark side of academism, symbolic vio- 
lence, clientelism, and monopolistic expropriation. It is therefore highly 
debatable whether the autarchy of the intellectual field should really be 
developed to such an extent that the assignment of reputation in the 
intellectual marketplace is restricted solely to an audience of collegial 
competitors. One may likewise question the capacity and wisdom of 
the social sciences to carry through an inaugural revolution that would 
definitely put politics and other social practices at large, and would 
reach for the homogeneity of investments and the methodological con- 
sensus that Bourdieu conceives as a prerequisite for a truly scientific 
dialectic. 43 
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Bourdieu himself places exclusive emphasis upon the threat to intellec- 
tual autonomy that is posed by heteronomous interests such as those of 
the new mandarins of state and economy and the media technocrats. 
But this tends once again to veil the threat to society constituted by the 
epistemocracy of the intellectuals themselves. The "anarchist" question 
posed by Feyerabend and Foucautt, i.e., how may society defend itself 
against the privileges and the interest politics of the intellectuals, 
should therefore be weighed more seriously. In this respect at least, 
Habermas's drive to force open the esoteric cultures of expertise in 
science, morality, and art, and to restore an open channel of communi- 
cation between them and the practice of everyday life, appears to offer 
a more balanced point of departure. 44 

This does not diminish the fact that Bourdieu's (anti-Habermasian) 
defense of intellectual autonomy as a form of interest politics contains a 
reflexive insight of the greatest fertility. The relative autonomy of the 
intellect (and the concomitant social distance) can henceforth be 
claimed without the epistemological drapery of the ethos of value- 
freedom. This social demarcation stands as a prerequisite for the un- 
folding of a specific rivalry logic in which strategic interests and com- 
municative arguments are syncretically matched. Pace Habermas, 
rationality is not constituted through the exclusion of strategic ele- 
ments, but through a (performative) recognition of their very omni- 
presence. And what is valid for the internal reading also extends to the 
external one: the field-autonomy that is the prerequisite of scientificity 
can only be defended in the form of a sober-minded intellectual cor- 
poratism. 

Conclusion: Knowledge politics and anti-politics 

Bourdieu's sociology of knowledge, as we have amply seen, success- 
fully "evens out" the profanation of philosophical conceptions of 
rationality and truth by means of a social demarcation of science as an 
autonomous line of work. The resulting precarious equilibrium 
between these two apparently contrary tendencies, I claim, suggests 
nothing less than a novel solution to the traditional conundrum of 
Reason versus Power or Right versus Might. The first, demystifying, 
operation levels down the intellectualist hierarchy of the Mind and 
posits an intrinsic juncture between intellect and politics, knowledge 
and interest, reason and power, which is not too dissimilar from 
Foucault's principle of pouvoir/savoir. The second operation counter- 
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balances this by an equally principled disjuncture, insofar as the social 
realms of culture and politics are institutionally divorced, and their re- 
spective autonomy is defended over against attempts to blur or erase 
their mutual boundaries. It is this precarious balance between the prin- 
ciples of "knowledge politics" and "anti-politics" that also suggests a 
fresh definition of the role of intellectuals, since it finally dispenses with 
the traditional alternative of "ivory tower" detachment and the involve- 
ment of a fully politicized culture. 

The classical dilemma of Reason and Power is no longer "resolved" by 
subordinating or reducing one of its constituent terms to the other, but 
by their simultaneous fusion and separation in an interplay of politi- 
cization and depoliticization, osmosis and differentiation. On the one 
hand, science, art, and culture in general are redescribed as forms of 
politics "continued by other means," which engenders a metaphorical 
extension of the concept of the political. On the other hand, the auton- 
omy of these "other means" and the specificity of the professional pro- 
duction of culture is guarded in such a manner as to maintain a clear 
line of demarcation between cultural politics and "big" politics. Recog- 
nition that science and culture are social and political through and 
through does not erase the boundaries between culture and politics as 
functionally differentiated subsystems in the social division of labor. 
The epistemological fusion between knowledge and power can go to- 
gether well with a social-institutional separation between science and 
society. 

In traditional conceptions of the Reason-Power relationship, the two 
extreme options of principled detachment and principled involvement 
share an important characteristic. They embody two forms of "knowing 
better": two forms of elitist self-understanding on the part of the aca- 
demically educated. 45 Both the idea of an "ivory tower" and the drive 
for full politicization support a notion about the supremacy of the 
rational mind that invites the intellectual to look down in condescen- 
sion upon the low life of politics and POliticians. In the first case, intel- 
lectuals derive their superiority from their privileged husbandry of uni- 
versal values and truths, and castigate any colleague who descends into 
the political marketplace as a traitor to the Spirit. In the reverse case of 
politicization, intellectuals likewise claim to know better than politi- 
cians. This time, however, they eagerly invade the agora in order to take 
the place of their dilettante rivals - dreaming the historical dream that 
connects Plato to Hegel and Marx, and Marx to both Sartre and 
Heidegger. The project of legislative reason, which in the former case 
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leads toward renunciation of the world, turns political, and the accu- 
sation of intellectual treason is now reversed upon the uncommitted 
and the inactive. 46 

The recent disenchantment of reason, however, has sharply trans- 
formed these terms of debate. The reduction of intellectual work to 
"ordinary" proportions has enabled intellectual workers to defend their 
autonomy in a more realistic and pragmatic way, i.e., without calling 
upon traditional epistemic values such as the "love of truth" or "value- 
freedom;' or wielding traditional dualisms such as truth versus interest 
or knowledge versus power. In this constellation, detachment and 
involvement are no longer contrary concepts, or poles that spread a 
force field between them, but rather constitute two sides of the same 
knowledge-political coin. Distanciation as social-institutional pre- 
condition for the successful performance of science and culture no 
longer requires the legitimating support of the classical ethos of value- 
freedom. The relative autonomy of culture can (and should) be main- 
tained against politics with political means. 

This idea of an "anti-political politics" thus effectively dodges the tradi- 
tional dilemma that opposes the detachment of Reason to the involve- 
ment of Power. Indeed, in Konrfid's characterization, it is the political 
engagement or obtrusiveness of those who refuse to become politicians 
and, at the end of the day, prefer to leave the routine exercise of power 
to other professionals than themselves. Crucial to this view is a (per- 
formative) awareness that doing politics is different from the display of 
cultural creativity; that the work of "organizing ideas" does not and 
should not coincide with the work of "organizing people and things," 
but is (and should be) subjected to a distinct logic of its own. Konrfid 
therefore likens the relation between professional politics and cultural 
anti-politics to that between two mountains: neither of them is inter- 
ested in taking the place of the other; neither is able to eliminate or 
substitute for the o the r .  47 It is this very separation of tasks and interests, 
which "neutralizes" the knowledge-political marriage between culture 
and politics by means of their anti-political divorce, which defines the 
promise of a culture of democratic differences. 48 

In Bourdieu's "corporatism of the universal," however, the Realpolitik 
. 

of intellectual autonomy is still to some extent euphernized by means of 
a residual, and curiously roundabout, notion of intellectual trans- 
cendence. His is no longer the straightforward universalism of the ethic 
of professional disinterestedness; nor does he espouse the more intri- 
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cate varieties implied in Gouldner's idea of a culture of critical dis- 
course or in Habermas's project of a linguistically certified communi- 
cative symmetry. His darker "Smithian" calculation of the transfor- 
marion of private vices into public benefits, nevertheless, by deploying 
partial interests as providential mainsprings of the universal, still tends 
to contribute to an overly reverential and sublimated (self)image of the 
professionals of culture, by underwriting something like their agonisti- 
cally constituted, but collectively ensured guardianship of "truth" and 
"rationality. ''49 

In a more thoroughly "dualistic" approach to the problem of autonomy, 
there is no longer any single profession or corporation that may claim 
privileged access to a universalistic cultural grounding. All professions 
are equally "suspect" in their claims to represent the general interest, 
and must balance the modest recognition of their own capacities by a 
recognition of the distinct rationality and autonomy of others. In this 
perspective, intellectuals and politicians are embroiled in something 
like a generalized, "societal" version of the agonistic logic that Bour- 
dieu considers a characteristic and beneficial feature of the develop- 
ment of science and other restricted fields. While inside the scientific 
field a critical game of competition ranges scientific rivals against one 
another, so likewise in the broader societal field checks and balances 
are installed between professional powers that have a vested interest in 
keeping a sharp eye upon each others' every movement. 

In this manner, the corporatism of the intellectuals is matched by the 
corporatism of the politicians. Through this institutionalized rivalry, 
their mutual obtrusiveness is checked and balanced by systematic 
mutual distrust. They mutually respect one another's professional juris- 
diction, but are also increasingly conscious of the natural proximity 
between their good and evil sides, their utility and disutility, their func- 
tions and dysfunctions. Politicians and intellectuals are as useful as they 
are dangerous. More precisely: they are dangerous as a result of the 
same autonomy that conditions their utility. Nothing special. But surely 
"something different." 
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