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Regional Brand Development Model
Under the Perspective of System Theory

Lai-bin Wang

Abstract The regional brand development is to enable regional brands sustained,
orderly, stable and coordinated development under the constraints of the four
elements of the government, business, social and other intermediary organizations,
from this, the structural model of the regional brand development is formed. The
article argues that the regional brand building and development must proceed from
the following points: First, in the social subsystem, focus on the cultivation of
social cultural, change people’s traditional concept, nurture a kind of social culture
of brand share, and strengthen the basic research for technological innovation;
second, in the enterprise subsystem, improve product quality, good brand mar-
keting, management and technological innovation; third, government subsystem,
in terms of policy, capital, infrastructure, branding promotion, offer support;
fourth, in other intermediary organizations subsystem, give full play the coordi-
nating role of industry associations, human resources, financial resources, legal
advice, and other aspects are inseparable from intermediary organizations.
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131.1 Introduction

The regional brand concept was first proposed by Keller et al. (1998), the location
like the products or services as branding, brand name is usually the actual name of
this region. The brand makes people aware of the existence of the region, and
related associations. Keller et al. (1998) also believes that the region can be like as
the brand of product or service (Kevin 1999). Rosenfeld (2002) believes that the
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implementation of the regional brand strategy based on industry clusters in less
developed countries is a kind of way to enhance the competitiveness (Rosenfeld
2002; Simon 2007). In the development process of regional brands, Allen etc.
believe that traditional brand theory is applied to the regional context, two espe-
cially critical issues must be considered, namely the management of stakeholder
groups and government leaders to play the role (Simon 2007; Malcolm 2006;
Eraydn 2010).

Domestic studies of the regional brand theory date from 2002. With the vigorous
development of industrial clusters in China, in the industrial clusters of Zhejiang,
Jiangsu, Guangdong, Fujian and other brand-name products gathered growth and
brand regionalization phenomenon, theoretical studies of the regional brand begins
to be the part of the attention of scholars. Xia Zengyu explores the regional brand
building. After 2005, the regional brand research articles were published exten-
sively, and researches involving the content, nature and characteristics of the
regional brands, the formation mechanism and affecting factors (Sun 2009), regional
brand values and interests regional brand and corporate brand, the effect of the
regional brand, the regional brand equity and assessment (Yang 2005), regional
brand governance mechanisms, regional brand building in the role of government
(Cai 2008), dynamic evaluation and coordinated development of regional brands,
the regional independent brand cultivation mode, regional brand management and
other aspects of a more systematic study (Zeng 2000).

The current study mainly uses case studies, mostly stays in the qualitative
phase, lack of quantitative research tools and methods, and seriously impact on the
establishment of the theoretical framework of regional brands, therefore, on the
basis of qualitative research, to develop a regional brand quantitative measurement
tools which enhance the quantitative study of the regional brand, is an important
direction for future research in this field.

Regional brand studies are now beyond the narrow boundaries of the marketing
application, involving disciplines such as sociology, history, political which is
little attention in the past marketing and branding. So disciplines involved with
regional branding have extensive features and present the trend of multi-
disciplinary.

131.2 Connotation of the Regional Brand

Since the establishment of a socialist market economy, have emerged around a
number of products suitable for local production, and gradually formed a large-
scale industrial clusters and business clusters, and thus become regional brand
being characteristics of region. The regional brand is the ‘‘industrial products’’
which have considerable size and strong production capacity, higher market share
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and influence within an administrative (geographic) area, is an area of industry
group to build a unified brand. In addition to general brand unique, easy to dis-
tinguish and irreplaceable features, it has non-exclusive unique features, as well as
non-competitive, external, regional, cluster and dispersed such.

Regional brand is the outward manifestation of the regional competitiveness,
the strength of the competitiveness of the regional brand can reflect the level of
regional economic development and government performance level. Therefore,
regional brand is not only the practical issues of corporate, is also a scholar of great
concern academic proposition.

It is generally believed that the regional brand is a product of regional economic
development, is the industry within the region of considerable size and strong
manufacturing capabilities, higher market share and influence of business and
business-owned brand goodwill sum. It consists of two elements: regional and a
good brand effect. In the backdrop of economic globalization, regional brand can
make people will a certain image and its association with this region, there is a link
up to drive regional economic development through regional brands to create and
disseminate. The regional competition has become an important form of compe-
tition in the market; the regional brand has become a contemporary economic
development and significant features. Regional brand is the inevitable outcome of
the regional economic development, reflecting the core competitiveness of the
regional economy, representing the subject and the image of a region.

In addition to general brand characteristics, regional brand has its own unique
characteristics: First is symbiotic. Regional brand is a public brand and resource
within a regional. Therefore, it has positive externalities; the utility has a good
symbiotic which can be shared by enterprises in the region.

Second is the persistence. Regional brand is the result of collaboration of many
enterprises in the region, the extraction of a number of brand essences, have a solid
foundation, and brand effect more extensive and lasting.

Third is regional. Regional brand has a certain degree of regional and rooted. It
deeply affected by local cultural, economic, political, regional factors and overall
performance.

131.3 Formation Process of the Regional Brand

Regional brands have distinct characteristics and formation processes. Regional
brand in China under the reform, opening up and the market economy environ-
ment, the formation process has a strong era, nationality. The formation process of
the regional brand is the main formation of the regional brand building elements,
including regional competitive industries to choose, the formation of industrial
clusters, regional brand creation and the formation of brand economy chain.

The choice of regional advantage industry is the basic link of the regional
brand, has a direct impact on the quantity and quality of the regional brand
building. In a way, it is the premise of the formation of industrial clusters. The

131 Regional Brand Development Model 1243



formation of industrial clusters is the basis of regional brands. The continuous
development of the regional brand will inevitably bring about the brand economy
chain. At the same time, the creation of the regional brand permeates every aspect
of being.

131.4 System Theory and Regional Brand Development

131.4.1 System Theory

In this paper, the regional brand building still is a regional industrial clusters as the
foundation, regional industry cluster stakeholders will naturally become the main
body of the regional brand building, and these stakeholders is to constitute the
elements of the regional industrial clusters, exist the complex contact among them;
regional brand building is a strategic development to execution and then to the
outside world to exchange feedback rating system, regardless of the strategy
establishment, the follow-up implementation, the final regulatory assessment for
feedback to the strategic plan amendment is influence each other, so the regional
brand building based industry cluster is a complex system works.

131.4.2 Whole Course Regional Brand Development Model

(1) Input stage

In different brand-building phase, the investment of resources is also different.
In the start-up period, due to the extremely limited resources of the enterprise, the
lack of first-class industrial clusters, this requires the government to increase
investment, make the related policies, and other intermediary organizations in
technology, human resources, and financial resources need give strong support.
Resources focus on investment to a single market to achieve rapid breakthrough of
a brand, is a universal model for a regional brand to be established firmly in a
market (Fig. 131.1).

In the period of rapid development, with the region brands is becoming well-
known in the market, followed by rapid growth in the size of the industry cluster,
government support and policy makers should be biased in favor of SMEs, to
develop a reasonable market access system, and other intermediary organizations
should strengthen resource inputs.

At maturity, the regional brand has a strong competitive position in traditional
markets; status in the industry is about to changes from the pursuer to the tran-
scender and the leader. The input resources are relatively abundant, but because of
loss of the development of benchmarking, will have a more technical or market
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trial and error behavior. The right strategic choices of region brand development
will lead to greater efficiency; otherwise it will bring huge economic losses.

In the recession phase of the regional brands, in order to re-establish the brand
market image, you must change the development strategy, the liberal market
access system, excellent products and good social public relations which can make
regional brand reemerge to the former presence.

(2) Transformation process

The transformation process is the integration process of the resources, between
enterprises, between enterprises and governments, enterprises and other interme-
diary organizations by competing collaborative strategy, heter-organization and
self-organization, yield the greatest returns on investment resource.

Self-organization theory is called by a joint name including the dissipative
structure theory, collaborative theory, super-cycle theory, and chaos and fractal
theory. It is generally believed that the self-organizing mechanism is through the
various elements of the system of ‘‘competing-Synergy’’. Synergy can be divided
into positive and negative, positive synergy is Pareto improvement by repeated
game, resulting in ‘‘social promotion’’, the negative synergy produce ‘‘social
inserting’’. Visible, the results of competing is not really expected, in fact, a case in
point is that a large number of clusters decline and disappear in external com-
peting, which is manifestation of non-adaptability of the industry cluster and the
regional brand.

Similar regional brand should not be conflict and contradiction, but should be a
mutual learning, learn from each other, enhance each other the fraternal competing
synergies, therefore, must be designed new means of communication, change the
concept of the development of regional brands interested parties (enterprises,
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Fig. 131.1 Whole course
regional brand development
model
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industry associations, government), and guide the development of similar regional
brand moving in the benign interaction competing relationship.

(3) Output stage

After reasonable resources transformation process, business, government and
other intermediary organizations achieve a win–win situation, regional brand of
scientific management system, to promote local economic and socio-economic
development, mainly reflected the knock-on effect in the regional brand.

131.5 Systematic Regional Brand Development Mode

Government, business, social and other intermediary organizations, regional brand
building as the core, constitutes an interrelated complex system. The core of the
regional brand development system is composed of four subsystems that is the
government, business, social and other intermediary organizations, the basic
structure shown in Fig. 131.2. Shown in Fig. 131.2, a regional brand development
system not only has the characteristics of the general system, the interaction
mechanism between the internal structure and systems, is much more complex
than the general system. The sustainable development of the system depends not
only on the coordinated development of the various subsystems, but also depends
on the degree of coordination between the various subsystems.

Regional 
Brand

development

Government
 subsystem

enterprise 
subsystem

intermediary 
organizations
subsystem

Social 
Subsystem

Fig. 131.2 Systematic
regional brand development
model
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131.5.1 Government Subsystem

The government plays an extremely important role in regional brand building and
development process. From the perspective of systems theory, government sub-
system, use of local advantages of resources, take a variety of marketing tools,
establish and promote regional brand, and in combination with the needs of the
regional brand development process, make scientific support policies.

First of all, the government must conduct regional image marketing. In addi-
tion, the government should rationalize the ideas and mechanism in macroscopic
level of the regional economic development, strengthen macro-guidance and
promotion, improve relevant mechanisms, and develop appropriate policies and
measures. The government need encourage brands to create famous brands,
implement brand strategy and corporate incentives, and make preferential policies
and incentives for brand-name enterprises to play a designer demonstration effect.

131.5.2 Enterprise Subsystem

Enterprises play a leading role in regional brand building, by nurturing large
enterprises in particular in a comparative advantage industry in the region, as the
core, and corresponding formation of a series of supporting vendors, large-scale
enterprise communities can be formed in the region, through the corporate com-
munity acts to promote the development of competitive industries and industrial
clusters, and form a certain reputation and influence of regional brands in the
market.

In the enterprise subsystem, the enterprises of different sizes create quality
products in the use of local comparative advantage resources, increase brand
awareness and reputation, and lay a solid foundation for the construction of the
regional brand. Then, this enterprise make use of modern marketing management
concepts, methods, strategies and means to improve their own brand influence at
the same time, strengthen the regional brand promotion. In addition, it is necessary
for enterprise to improve the technological innovation capability. If no R&D
innovation, always behind the others, the production would be not market
advantage. The enterprise can improve production efficiency, reduce operating
costs and improve management of resources, only through innovation of product
design and production technology, establishment and improvement of the tech-
nological innovation system, the active use of advanced technology to transform
traditional industries; only with high-tech, regional brand has a high brand value
and market competitiveness.
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131.5.3 Intermediary Organizations Subsystem

The development of regional brands requires a large number of professional
intermediaries in professional support services, such as policy coordination
withered, standard setting, trademark use, legal services, technical support, man-
agement consulting, disciplinary mechanism, as well as qualified guarantee (such
as loan credit guarantee), etc. Thus, industry associations, chambers of commerce
and other intermediary institutions should give full play to its functions.

Industry Association plays an important coordination and communication role
between enterprises. The Association is composed of voluntary corporate, non-
governmental organizations, has connection function in the construction of
regional economic between the enterprise and the market, business and govern-
ment. Association does depth analysis of the regional brand development, in
consultation with relevant government departments to help enterprises solve dif-
ficulties and problems of brand development process, through the development of
a regional brand development plans and unified applicable policies of regional
brand, the exchange of experience in regional brand building in the industry and
strive to create a higher value of regional brands.

131.5.4 Social Subsystem

Long-term development of the regional brand cannot be separated from local
economic development, support services, is also affected by the impact of local
social and cultural environment. In the beginning of the construction of regional
brand, creating a brand-sharing culture has an important role in the development of
the regional brand. It is necessary to establish and perfect a set of brand sharing
mechanism that is shared investment, shared interests, to coordinating operation,
the formation of clusters acting criteria, and accompanying cost estimates and
cost-sharing mechanism, with a strict barrier to entry, put an end to the subversive
opportunistic behavior to the regional brand image.

Social progress is also very important to the development of regional brands.
We should speed up reform of the scientific research system, and construction to
meet the requirements of the market economy, the investment system, scientific
research and development mechanisms and the growth of talent and incentives.
The same time increase the distribution system reform to meet the requirements of
the market economy; enhance technological innovation through technology shares
and other forms of power. To create a social environment of the growth of tech-
nology professionals, scientific and technological personnel to be able to get
enough market-oriented, institutionalized incentives for technological innovation
to develop and retain a sufficient number of qualified personnel.

1248 L. Wang



131.6 Conclusion

Through the above measures, the contradiction in these subsystems can be
effectively avoided, and promote the coordinated development between the vari-
ous subsystems, finally achieve economic benefit, social benefit and environment
efficiency unification, so as to realize the sustainable development of regional
brand system.

Of course, the article on regional brand development structure model is only
limited to theoretical studies, large amounts of data investigation and analysis on
the basis of use of systems analysis tools such as system dynamics on empirical
research, which can be better to provide a reference for the development of
regional brands.
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