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         Introduction 

   We don’t think about it. We forget about it. We are normal and live our life, except when I 
must remember to check my review date and go to the clinic (Soso, HIV-positive woman in 
a HIV-serodiscordant couple, Goroka, Papua New Guinea). 

 In the Australian winter of 1981, the year I began primary school, an epidemic of 
unknown cause or origin offi cially began with reported cases of  Pneumocystis cari-
nii  pneumonia in gay men in the USA. Soon after, Australians—mostly gay men 
and individuals with haemophilia—began to face the epidemic, forced to live with 
and respond to a new illness that affected not only them, but also their partners, fam-
ily, friends, and communities. As no members of my family were infected or affected 
by this new mysterious illness, I remained oblivious to the virus for many years. It 
would not be for another decade and a half that I would fi nd myself personally 
affected by HIV, and part of a “key population”, as serodiscordant couples are now 
termed. But this was not how we viewed ourselves, nor how “HIV experts” classi-
fi ed us at that time. This was, in part, because at that historical moment HIV treat-
ment was minimal and the current culture of biomedical prevention was still far in 
the future. 

 HIV is most frequently transmitted during “intimate acts in private relation-
ships”, making it a “disease rooted in relationships” (Kalichman  2000 :175). As 
Persson ( 2011 ,  2013 ) has underscored in her body of work on serodiscordant rela-
tionships in Australia, it is critical to understand how serodiscordance operates rela-
tionally. This means enquiring into how HIV impacts upon the social and embodied 
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sense of self for both HIV-positive and HIV-negative partners, as well as the diverse 
ways this shapes how serodiscordance, and risk, is lived in different local realities. 
At the core of serodiscordance is the issue of intersubjectivity because individuals, 
as Merleau-Ponty ( 1973 ) said, rarely act in isolation from others. Similarly accord-
ing to Schutz ( 1973 :55), the social world “is from the outset an intersubjective 
world”. Thus, although HIV is a virus physically confi ned to the body of the HIV 
infected individual, both the person with HIV and their partner (and others) experi-
ence HIV affectively and socio-culturally. In short, lived experiences of HIV are 
intersubjective, profoundly mediated by both social and biomedical contexts. Such 
an emphasis on the relationality and intersubjectivity of serodiscordance (within 
sexual and other familial relationships) has been at the heart of my own work on 
HIV, particularly as it relates to AIDS dementia (Kelly  2008a ,  b ,  c ,  2010 ). 

 Seeing serodiscordance from this perspective destabilises any effort to essen-
tialise what living in a serodiscordant relationship means. In this chapter specifi -
cally, by exploring serodiscordance in different local, historical and biomedical 
settings, I attempt to unsettle popular discourses of and the meanings ascribed to 
serodiscordance by illustrating how they are neither universal nor consistent across 
time or place. I provide historical insights into the “emergence” of serodiscordant 
couples by drawing on my own story as an HIV-negative woman in a heterosexual 
serodiscordant relationship in Australia. I also chronicle my experience of the emer-
gence of HIV serodiscordant couples in the national response in Papua New Guinea 
(PNG), fi rst as an imagined biomedical anomaly and subsequently as a normalized 
phenomenon of living with HIV. In doing so, I make visible snippets of the realities 
of couples’ lives, bringing to the fore personal stories of HIV and serodiscordance. 
I thus consider the private lives behind a global health concern, offering an analysis 
of the effects of biomedicine and living in relationships with mixed HIV status. But 
fi rst I examine the politics of representation of living with HIV and its impacts on 
understandings and representations of couples with mixed HIV status.  

    The Space for Serodiscordant Couples 

 Long marginalised to the edges of the epidemic (e.g. Kelly  2006 ; Roman  1997 ; Van 
der Straten et al.  1998 ), HIV-negative partners are now more visible than at any 
other time in the history of the epidemic, if for no other reason than their role in 
clinical research on Treatment-as-Prevention (TasP). Results from the high-profi le 
HIV Prevention Trials Network trial have shown that early treatment of HIV reduces 
HIV transmission in serodiscordant couples by 96 %, as compared with delayed 
treatment (Cohen et al.  2011 ). As a result, TasP has become a key biomedical inter-
vention in the HIV landscape, with a very specifi c goal; to reduce HIV incidence 
globally. 

 This new concern with serodiscordant couples, however, has almost exclusively 
been focused on quantitative understandings of HIV transmission/acquisition risk 
rather than the intimate practices and daily realities of couples’ lives. Their bodies 
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have become a primary focus of the biomedical gaze in large-scale trials. Whether 
they engage in same-sex or opposite-sex intimate relationships, and whether located 
in African, North-American or other countries and regions, serodiscordant partners 
have become central to understanding HIV transmission risk from a clinical and 
epidemiological viewpoint. But this perspective is only partial and refl ects little of 
living with serodiscordance. It has also meant that serodiscordant relationships have 
overwhelmingly been framed as sites of HIV risk, as if these couples in all their 
variances were the same across both time and space. Hence, with the transformation 
of the biomedical landscape, the recent attention to serodiscordant couples is wel-
comed, but comes with a level of caution as to the genuine interest above and beyond 
“risk” and the potential biomedicalisation of these relationships. 

 People new to HIV could be forgiven however for believing that serodiscordant 
relationships are a recent phenomenon, a late addition to the HIV epidemic and to 
“living with HIV”. But, of course, intimate serodiscordant partnerships have always 
been a characteristic of the epidemic; they simply have not been given the attention 
they now incite, whether biomedical, political or social. This was the reason I 
referred to the politics of representation in an earlier article where I explored, using 
visual images, my partner’s life and subsequent death from AIDS dementia, a feared 
and deeply stigmatised AIDS-related condition, arguing that my shadowed face in 
one particular image at an AIDS Candlelight Memorial was symbolic of my invisi-
ble serostatus position as an HIV-negative partner of a person living with HIV (see 
Kelly and Kerner  2004 ).  

    Situated Knowledge 

 To explore the issues outlined for this chapter I draw on a number of different sets 
of “data” (knowledge). Along with insights gained through my work as a social 
researcher on HIV in PNG, my life, like that of many people, has also been inti-
mately impacted by the virus. Jossie and Soso, two women employed in my home 
to care for my children, live with HIV; both of them have married HIV-negative men 
in the fi ve to ten years we have known each other. Reaching further into the past, my 
connection to serodiscordance grows more intimate still. My partner Andrew died 
from AIDS-related dementia in early 1999, 8 days before my 23rd birthday. Thus 
my embodied experience of serodiscordance is situated at a very different historical 
moment than Jossie’s and Soso’s. I have permission and the blessing of family 
members, friends, and research participants to draw on all of the stories presented in 
this chapter. My commentary here should be recognised as, in part, auto- 
ethnographic, in the midst of an ongoing HIV journey that is both professional and 
personal, across highly diverse cultural, linguistic and temporal settings. In this 
way, I work in the “borderland between passion and intellect, analysis and subjec-
tivity, ethnography and autobiography, art and life” (Behar  1996 :174). This per-
spective offers a unique window onto changes in the biomedical landscape over 
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time—changes which I argue are critical to the (re)framing of serodiscordant rela-
tionships in PNG, and likely in other contexts as well. 

    Intimate Understanding 

 I met Andrew in my late teens. The night of the day we met I dreamed of our wed-
ding; needless to say I was deeply taken by him. I had never met someone who had 
intrigued me as much nor whom I shared so much in common with. Diagnosed with 
HIV in December 1984, Andrew had already lived with HIV for many years before 
I met him; his resilience, passion and humour were infectious not only to me, but 
also to all those who met him. I was not intentionally entering into a relationship 
with “a person with HIV.” I was experiencing my fi rst great love. It was a love that 
would teach me much about the value of life, but also of living with HIV; lessons I 
continue to benefi t from long after his death. 

 Our relationship posed immediate challenges; in the mid-1990s in Australia, 
effective HIV treatment was lacking and much fear and discrimination prevailed. 
Andrew’s family carried a hereditary bleeding disorder and was deeply affected by 
HIV early on in ways most families were not. Andrew was 11 years old when he was 
infected and 14 years old when diagnosed with HIV. His maternal uncle, who also 
had haemophilia, was diagnosed in his early thirties. This uncle, who died the year 
before I met Andrew, left behind an HIV-negative wife and young daughter, born 
within a year of his diagnosis. 

 AZT was the only HIV treatment available at the time Andrew and I met. Many 
people suffered from its toxicity, hence his decision not to risk premature death 
from treatment side effects. Treatments advanced considerably during our 4-year 
relationship, though treatment as we know it today simply did not exist. In particu-
lar, there were severely limited options for people like Andrew, who had been diag-
nosed with HIV-related dementia some 18 months into our relationship. At one 
point, he was granted, on compassionate grounds, permission to commence treat-
ment on a trial drug believed to cross the blood brain barrier. 

 Soon after Andrew started this trial treatment, however, he stopped. The side 
effects were unmanageable and intolerable, and ongoing cognitive deterioration 
suggested that the regimen was not adequately treating HIV in his brain. He wanted 
desperately to live but not at the cost of being severely impaired by dementia. 
Andrew and I were never to benefi t from the medical advances that were yet to 
come in the ways many of our friends did and continue to do. With his ongoing 
cognitive deterioration, the hope for HIV treatments to halt or reverse the damage of 
HIV to his brain became a hope for death, suggesting the complex and temporal 
dimensions of hope, treatments and HIV (Kelly  2007 ).   
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    Situating HIV in PNG 

 In the almost 30 years since HIV was fi rst diagnosed in PNG in 1987, epidemiologi-
cal, socio-cultural and political understandings of the epidemic have undergone 
momentous change. As the country with the largest number of people living with 
HIV in the Pacifi c (National AIDS Council Secretariat [NACS]  2010 ,  2013 ) and 
with a rapid increase in diagnoses in the early years, the epidemic in PNG was pre-
viously predicted to follow the path witnessed in sub-Saharan Africa (Australian 
Agency for International Development  2006 ; NACS  2013 ). 

 That said, there is increasing recognition that not all people in PNG are equally 
at risk of infection, nor is the epidemic evenly felt across the country (Kelly-Hanku 
et al.  2014a ,  b ; Maibani et al.  2011 ; NACS  2013 ). The current epidemic is complex; 
mixed rather than concentrated or generalized (Kelly-Hanku et al.  2014a ,  b ), and 
not readily classifi ed into HIV estimate models or epidemiological categories. 
When I fi rst began working in PNG at the turn of the century, HIV treatments were 
not yet available. A few years later, they were integrated in a pilot project at the 
country’s largest HIV clinic in the nation’s capital. Thus, HIV treatments were late 
to be incorporated into PNG’s response to the epidemic, particularly considering the 
grim sub-Saharan analogies that were drawn at the time. Fast-forward to the present 
day and treatments are available throughout the country. 

 In the past 10 years, a wealth of research (social, cultural, laboratory and epide-
miological) has enhanced our understandings of HIV in PNG. This includes my 
own research studies, such as  The ART of Living , the fi rst study on living with HIV 
and treatment in the country (Kelly et al.  2009a ), as well as the fi rst study to bring 
attention to the core issue of this edited volume: couples with mixed HIV status 
(Kelly et al.  2011 ). In this study, of participants living with HIV who were sexually 
active and in a regular heterosexual relationship, 21 % reported being in a serodis-
cordant relationship; a further 14.3 % did not know their partner’s status (Kelly et al. 
 2011 ). There was no signifi cant difference in condom use between couples with 
mixed HIV status, couples with the same HIV status or those where the status of the 
partner was unknown. In qualitative interviews from the same study, people living 
with HIV described their HIV-negative partners as playing an important role in their 
lives in terms of treatment adherence, keeping HIV a secret, nutritional support and 
a sense of normality through sexual intimacy and care (Kelly et al.  2009a ;  2011 ). 

 More recent qualitative research on prevention of parent-to-child transmission 
(PPTCT) programs shows that, with the rapid roll out of antiretroviral treatment 
(ART), HIV-positive women and their negative husbands are fulfi lling reproductive 
desires, with increasing numbers of couples knowingly entering into a serodiscor-
dant relationship (Kelly et al.  2013 ). Marriage, pregnancy and parenthood are sig-
nifi cant cultural practices and expectations in PNG, and understanding this makes 
plain how transformative biomedicine can be. It allows people with HIV, and sero-
discordant couples, to re-enter society from the margins of contagion and pollution, 
enabling their claims of reproductive citizenship (Kelly  2012b ). 
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 Notwithstanding severely limited second-line treatment and numerous treatment 
stock outs, the treatment and management of HIV in PNG has progressed signifi -
cantly in the past few years. Portable point-of-care CD4 machines are now readily 
and widely available in most treatment centers. But access to viral load testing—
critical to determining treatment failure—is non-existent. The absence of viral load 
testing infl uences the clinical management of HIV as well as discourses of HIV risk. 
Excluding the few HIV activists who attend regional meetings, nowhere have I 
heard people with HIV or their HIV-negative spouses talk about “non- infectiousness”, 
undetectable viral loads or TasP, as found in other studies of serodiscordant couples. 
Rather, people talk about treatment as putting the virus to sleep or putting a fence 
around it and enabling them to have “normal” babies free from HIV. While it is not 
clear if this encodes the same understanding that lies behind more scientifi c dis-
courses, its expression is certainly different in PNG. As viral load testing becomes 
available in the future, it will be important to map how this new technology might 
alter narratives of HIV risk and how the knowledge of viral load might be incorpo-
rated into the sexual and reproductive practices of couples with mixed HIV status.  

    Sero-Silence and Diversity 

 The current PNG National HIV Strategy (NACS  2010 ) is the fi rst to mention sero-
discordance, and does so only twice. This occurred only because my supporters and 
I were so intent on breaking the silence that surrounded such couples and, in par-
ticular, ensuring their access to Post Exposure Prophylaxis (PEP). The policy on 
PEP provision at the time the Strategy was drafted named only victims of sexual 
violence and occupational exposure. I knew that unless serodiscordance was explic-
itly included, the policy would be left to interpretation, and possibly discriminatory 
application. To appropriate and re-apply a phrase coined by Persson ( 2008 ), our 
work in those meetings (where the strategy and policies were designed) was to 
ensure there was no “sero-silence”. Another expression of sero-silence is the way 
global public health discourses frequently frame serodiscordance as homogenous. 
This muzzling of diversity in mixed-status couples, historically and across different 
socio-cultural (and biomedical) landscapes, is an ongoing limitation of the extant 
literature. Here I offer just a few examples of the diversity I have come across in my 
work and personal experience. 

 Many marriages throughout PNG, but particularly in the Highlands Region, are 
polygamous. I encountered a serodiscordant polygamous marriage in early 2008 
while in Mendi, the provincial capital of the Southern Highlands, for the ART of 
Living study. The diagnosed HIV-positive woman, one of two wives, had been 
enrolled in the PPTCT program, after having tested positive for HIV at her fi rst 
antenatal visit. She had only given birth within the last 24 h prior to me meeting her. 
As we talked, her co-wife shared that she too wanted a baby but that she did not 
know her HIV status. Nor, it turned out, did the husband of these women. He had 
recently been released from prison for a brutal act of domestic violence. Wanting to 
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know their status, the co-wife and their husband attended the Catholic HIV Center 
a few days later. Both tested negative for the virus. 

 Though only a snippet, this family’s story has stayed with me, offering a variant 
narrative to the dominant construction of serodiscordance perpetuated by national 
and international policy and rhetoric. In prevailing HIV discourse, polygamous 
unions are erased, despite polygamy being a type of marriage endorsed and codifi ed 
culturally, religiously and often legally in many parts of the world. In countries such 
as PNG, serodiscordant polygamous unions are not a socio-cultural (or biomedical) 
anomaly. Yet such relationships are rarely acknowledged in the literature on serodis-
cordance more broadly, let alone in the clinical drug trials that have brought bio-
medical attention to serodiscordance. Polygamous unions with mixed HIV status 
stretch and challenge our common understanding of serodiscordant “couples”. But 
if we look beyond intimate partnerships, serodiscordance begins to stretch and 
diversify even further. 

 At another point during my time in Mendi, a local priest brought a group of 
people living with HIV from his diocese for their HIV medical review at the local 
Catholic HIV treatment and care centre. There were two young brothers amongst 
them. As people waited for their reviews, we all played a game of basketball, laugh-
ing and sharing stories. A story of the boys was relayed to me be by another member 
of the group. Both boys had been infected perinatally, though their middle brother 
was born without the virus. Their parents, however, had died from AIDS. This chain 
of infection and death was forged before ART was introduced in PNG; had the fam-
ily lived elsewhere where treatment was already available, this chain of infection 
and loss of life may have been prevented. 

 This story of mixed HIV status between family members is not unique to this 
family or to PNG. In Australia, prior to the development of more advanced HIV 
treatments, I knew of families in which parents and children were serodiscordant, or 
siblings were of mixed-status—including a family with identical twins where one 
was HIV-positive and the other negative. This kind of serodiscordance also charac-
terized my late partner’s family: Andrew’s uncle was infected but his wife and 
daughter were negative. Though not often discussed, intra-familial serodiscordance 
has only become  more  common as HIV treatment and prevention have evolved. 
Indeed, because PPTCT programs are designed to ensure that children of HIV- 
positive mothers are born without HIV, and that HIV-positive men do not infect their 
spouse and therefore their child, such programs increase rather than decrease mixed- 
status relationships. Creating serodiscordance within families is the explicit global 
biomedical aim of PPTCT.  

    Treatment and the (Re)framing of Serodiscordance 

 I grasp the concern about the emphasis placed on biomedical technologies to con-
trol and manage HIV (e.g., Knight et al.  2014 ), what some criticize as a “remedical-
ization of HIV” (Nguyen et al.  2011 ) at the expense of other socio-cultural and 

Situating Serodiscordance: Living in Relationships with Mixed HIV Status…



78

structural interventions. And yet, as someone whose serodiscordant relationship 
came to a tragic end because existing treatments were incapable of extending my 
partner’s life, I am also compelled to acknowledge the exhilaration and hope that 
contemporary treatments afford those living with the virus. But rather than debate 
the promises or limitations of treatment, I want to explore the potential re-framing 
of serodiscordance in the context of treatment. I note that Persson ( 2015 ) uses a 
similar term—re-imagining—in relation to TasP among serodiscordant couples in 
Australia. The similarity is both coincidental and speaks of the extent to which bio-
medicine is affecting the re-framing/re-imagining of serodiscordance across vastly 
different epidemiological and cultural landscapes. 

 The absence of treatment played a critical role in how Andrew’s and my relation-
ship and lives unfolded, including how our experiences of discordance differed in 
very important ways from the couple I quoted at the start of this chapter. Life was 
rarely ever “normal” for us. Our daily lives were constant reminders of HIV, of ill-
ness and demise. His disease consumed his life, my own and that of his family. In 
addition, parenthood was something Andrew and I wanted to experience together. 
But unlike many mixed-status couples today, even in a low-income country such as 
PNG, we had no safe means of making a family in Australia in the mid to late 1990s. 
At the time, it posed signifi cant risks (particularly for me as the female, HIV- 
negative partner) or required highly intrusive (and expensive) biomedical interven-
tions (e.g., sperm washing). In comparison, PPTCT makes reproduction for couples 
with mixed HIV status seem almost mundane. Because of advances in treatment and 
increased global access, those currently living in resource-limited settings are able 
to achieve something that was not possible earlier in the epidemic for Andrew and 
me, even in a resource-rich context: they not only survive, they thrive. 

 Until fairly recently in PNG, particularly when treatments were new and today’s 
sense of living with HIV was not yet evident, considerable stigma and moralisation 
surrounded sexuality in the context of HIV. However, through both my research and 
my personal involvement in the lives of people with HIV, I have witnessed the emer-
gence of new sexual relationships that defy earlier HIV narratives of sorcery, demise 
and discrimination (Kelly  2012a ,  b ; Kelly et al.  2009a ,  b ). With access to antiretro-
viral therapies now widespread, such narratives have diminished considerably, as 
evidenced by the stories of two women living with HIV: close friends Jossie and 
Soso were both supported in their marriages to HIV-negative men by their health 
care workers. Moreover, Jossie was supported to have four children, all of whom are 
negative as a result of ART and her determination to adhere to breastfeeding advice. 

 Serodiscordant relationships in PNG now appear largely accepted by health pro-
fessionals and, to varying degrees, within families and communities. This does not 
diminish the diffi culties of disclosure, of positive-negative sexuality, of treatment 
adherence or reproduction. However, with treatment, the quest for relationships and 
parenthood is not limited to those who can afford expensive interventions or those 
who live in high-income countries; it is now in the grasp of most mixed-status cou-
ples in PNG. The mixed-status couples I know in PNG live a sense of normality far 
removed from my and Andrew’s experience.  
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    God, Risk, and Being Normal 

 Biomedical discourses homogenize HIV risk amongst serodiscordant couples, fail-
ing to account for variances across settings and sexual practices that affect risk. 
They also tend to overlook the culturally specifi c dynamics that shape and inform 
how relationships of mixed HIV status (be they monogamous, polygamous or het-
erosexual, homosexual or both) are lived in local, historical and biomedical reali-
ties. In the context of PNG, one key cultural dynamic to consider is the role of 
religion. Several Christian churches play an important role in the national response 
to HIV (particularly treatment and care) (Kelly  2009 ), and Christianity more gener-
ally has a profound impact upon the diverse and sometimes confl icting ways that 
people perceive HIV treatment and HIV risk (Eves  2012 ; Kelly-Hanku et al.  2014a ). 
But more than that, Christianity offers those living with HIV an important and pre-
vailing framework for understanding health and personal infection, sometimes 
alongside or in stark contrast to biomedical models (Kelly-Hanku et al.  2014a ; 
Kelly  2012a ). And it is Christianity, as opposed to TasP, or even condoms, which is 
perceived by those without HIV to provide the greatest protection against infection 
(Eves  2012 ; Kelly et al.  2009b ), including HIV-negative people in serodisordant 
couples. Sophie, a participant in the  Art of Living  Study (2008) highlighted this 
dimension to HIV in PNG when she shared the following comment by her HIV- 
negative husband: “He told me, ‘I love you and we live together; so according to my 
own faith, your sickness will not infect me’” (Kelly et al.  2009a ). 

 Soso told a similar story, one that highlights the increasing normalization of 
serodiscordance in PNG in the biomedical age, but also the powerful infl uence of 
Christianity on local risk perceptions. Soso and her husband had both been diag-
nosed with HIV when she was 1 month pregnant. Immediately starting on ART, she 
gave birth to a little girl free of HIV. Her husband, sadly, passed away and a short 
time afterward she commenced working in my house to support herself and her 
three children. Not long after I came to know Soso, Michael, a friend and  wantok  
(person from the same village) of her late husband, asked Soso to marry him. 
Michael knew that Soso was HIV-positive and that his friend had died of the dis-
ease. As a church man, Michael believed in several things: that he should be mar-
ried; that Soso did not create the “sin” of HIV in her body, and; that God would 
protect him from HIV because he, like Soso, was innocent, for neither of them 
caused the disease. During a conversation about this book chapter, Soso shared with 
me what her new husband had said to her at the time of his marriage proposal:

  My belief in God is that I can marry you and not get this disease. I am an innocent man. You 
are a mother. And your husband is responsible for giving you this disease so I won’t get this 
disease. I believe in God the Father. 

 Over the years Michael had shared similar comments with me that reinforced the 
normality of their marriage and the notion that God would decide if he became sick 
or not. 

 I asked Soso one morning, as we shared breakfast, about when her next HIV 
medical review would be; I was worried because she had not said she would be late 
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to work for some time because she needed to fi rst attend clinic in the morning. She 
dismissed my concern, saying, “Don’t worry, sometimes when I am busy here with 
the children, I send Michael and they give him my medicine”. When I asked her if 
there were many other husbands like Michael who were negative and go to the 
clinic, Soso replied; “When I was diagnosed there weren’t couples like my husband 
and I. Now there are lots of couples where the man or woman has HIV and their 
partner doesn’t; it’s normal”. Taking the idea of normal further, she said:

  We don’t think about it. We forget about it. We are normal and live our life, except when I 
must remember to check my review date and go to the clinic, but the rest of the time we 
don’t, we just act normal. I don’t think too much about it, I forget about it. We just stay 
normal and live life. And my daughter [exposed to HIV in pregnancy] is normal. I will see 
my children get older and have children of their own. I am fi t and healthy. 

 This notion of normal intrigued me, as did the belief in God’s ability to protect a 
person from HIV; I would never have used such concepts to describe my relation-
ship with Andrew. I clearly saw signs of HIV’s presence in Andrew’s body in ways 
Michael does not see in Soso. And so we could never forget about HIV in the way 
Michael and Soso described. Moreover, I was scared of becoming infected in a way 
Michael does not appear to be. Although raised in the Roman Catholic tradition, I 
did not believe in or trust that a spiritual fi gure would ensure my safety from infec-
tion. My fear increased when HIV viral load testing came into use, and I was not 
alone. Andrew and I heard stories of people committing suicide in response to 
receiving their viral load results. There was, at that time, limited social understand-
ing of their meaning, but the numbers used to express viral load—in the thousands 
and millions—were enormous. This was in stark contrast to CD4 test results, which 
were, depending on your stage of disease progression, in the double or, if you were 
lucky, triple fi gures. Beyond the fi gures themselves, there was no biomedical, let 
alone popular discourse of non-infectivity or undetectable viral load back then. In 
short, our serodiscordant experience could not have been more different than Soso 
and Michael’s. Christianity, normality and biomedicine were not frameworks for 
understanding HIV in my Australian context all those years ago.  

    Conclusion 

 As HIV treatments have been re-applied to prevent the transmission of HIV, couples 
with mixed HIV status have been brought into the biomedical, public health and 
clinical gaze, most markedly with TasP. But this gaze has almost exclusively been 
focused on quantitative understandings of risk. Narratives of the daily lives, feelings 
and practices of couples and individuals in these relationships have not been 
afforded the same priority as clinical and epidemiological understandings. In this 
chapter, I have tried to address this imbalance by providing vignettes of actual prac-
tices, intimate events and feelings among mixed-status couples, both through my 
own story and those of others. In doing so I have sought to show that, though the 
biomedical model makes no space for such a perspective, serodiscordance is an 
intersubjective experience, an intensely relational and diverse phenomenon. 
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 Despite the existence of diverse serodiscordant relationships from the outset of 
the epidemic, our understanding of serodiscordance has been narrow. This, I sug-
gest, is in large part because the concept of serodiscordance has been used to 
 understand transmission risk rather than people’s lived realities. This has resulted in 
a systematic erasure of differences in local realities—polygamous unions are a good 
example. Further, by limiting the concept of serodiscordance to “risk” in couples, 
we fail to understand the complex and dynamic ways that HIV is experienced and 
lived in social relationships, above and beyond those of a sexual nature, encompass-
ing broader family relations and community contexts. In places such as PNG, where 
family and familial relationships are central to identity, these connections are para-
mount and worth further consideration as we refi ne and deepen our understandings 
of serodiscordance. 

 I have drawn here on my long-term understanding of HIV, ranging from having 
been in a serodiscordant relationship in Australia early in the epidemic to now living 
and working with serodiscordant couples in PNG. I have shown that, while living in 
a mixed-status relationship goes well beyond sex and reproduction, it is nonetheless 
within these domains that we can most easily observe some of the many changes 
and new possibilities brought about by HIV treatment. Welcome biomedical 
advances in the global response to HIV mean that mixed-status couples (and fami-
lies) in PNG and Australia can now identify as “normal”, rather than as a “key popu-
lation” as global HIV discourses currently in circulation would have them classifi ed. 
My own early experience of being part of a mixed-status couple in a resource-rich 
setting like Australia contrasts markedly with the realities of mixed HIV status cou-
ples today and the normalisation of serodiscordance that is emerging in PNG and 
other settings in what is now a very different biomedical landscape. 

 On a fi nal note, the power of recent scientifi c discoveries and increased access to 
HIV treatment notwithstanding, the “end of AIDS” is not (yet) ensured. People still 
become infected and die from AIDS-related conditions, as my dear friend of almost 
10 years Jossie did in late 2015, leaving her HIV-negative husband and children 
behind. Given that HIV medicine is a rapidly moving fi eld, there is an ongoing need 
to understand treatment as situated within local meanings and practices, particularly 
in serodiscordant relationships. We must forego a-historical and de-contextualized 
conceptions and, instead, engage critically with diverse cultural, temporal, and bio-
medical realities to understand what living with serodiscordance means and may 
mean into the future.     
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editing of this chapter, as well as to the women and men who have shared their stories with me over 
the course of my involvement in the HIV epidemic. 
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