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Chapter 16
Soils Contaminated with Persistent 
Organic Pollutants (POPs): Current 
Situations, Management, 
and Bioremediation Techniques: 
A Mexican Case Study

María Luisa Castrejón-Godínez, Alexis Rodríguez, Enrique Sánchez-Salinas, 
Patricia Mussali-Galante, Efraín Tovar-Sánchez, 
and Ma. Laura Ortiz-Hernández

Abstract  The presence of different Persistent Organic Pollutants (POPs), such as 
organochlorine pesticides, polybrominated diphenyl ethers, polychlorinated aro-
matic compounds, polychlorinated dibenzofurans, polychlorinated dibenzo-p-
dioxins, among others, has been reported in agricultural and industrial areas across 
different regions worldwide. POPs are highly toxic chemical compounds that cause 
severe adverse effects on ecosystems and have been related to multiple diseases in 
humans, including cancer, birth defects, and dysfunction in the immune, nervous, 
and reproductive systems. The Stockholm Convention is an international strategy 
for implementing policies to control or eliminate the production and use of these 
chemicals. In this context, developing strategies for the elimination and remediation 
of polluted sites by POPs is an urgent requirement. Bioremediation is a process 
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whereby dangerous pollutants become less toxic or nontoxic moieties, reducing 
their concentrations to undetectable levels or eliminating organic pollutants using 
the physiological capabilities of living organisms. Therefore, bioremediation has 
been proposed as the most suitable biotechnology for the treatment of polluted envi-
ronments with POPs. In practically all geographic regions of Mexico, different 
POPs have been reported in agricultural and urban areas. The main POPs reported 
include different organochlorine pesticides, such as aldrin, dichlorodiphenyltrichlo-
roethane (DDT), endosulfan, endrin, and hexachlorocyclohexanes (HCHs), in agri-
cultural districts, while in urban areas the most studied POPs were polychlorinated 
biphenyls and polybrominated diphenyl ethers. In Mexico, the scientific research in 
POPs bioremediation has been focused on identifying and characterizing microor-
ganisms (bacteria and fungi) capable of biodegrading POPs as a bioprospection 
strategy for future bioremediation applications. In the present chapter, the chemical 
characteristics of POPs, their impact on ecosystems and human health, as well as 
the presence of these compounds in different localities of Mexico and biodegrada-
tion studies are reviewed.

Keywords  Biodegradation · Dioxins · Environmental pollution; Pesticide · 
Polychlorinated compounds

16.1  �Introduction

There are many organic chemical compounds, with high toxicity, whose generation 
and release into the environment are related to human activities. Therefore, it is 
necessary that they should be detected and quantified. Among pollutants, those that 
have attracted the most attention are those that do not degrade easily and are often 
the most toxic; these chemicals are recognized as POPs. POPs are a group of com-
pounds of both natural and anthropogenic origins. However, through different 
industrial processes, human activities constitute the main cause of the intentionally 
and unintentionally POPs generation (Rottem 2017). POPs are harmful substances 
that pose a significant environmental and human health risk. POPs are diverse in 
chemical structure, however they share common characteristics, such as high envi-
ronmental persistence due to their resistance to the natural biochemical, chemical, 
and photolytic degradation processes, and high toxicity to living organisms. POPs 
are semi-volatile compounds with a high capability of long-range transport to other 
places, such as the polar regions, they also can be bioaccumulated in the fatty tissues 
of animals, humans included (Rottem 2017; Wahlang 2018; Wang et al. 2019; Kim 
et al. 2020; Sun et al. 2020; Sheriff et al. 2021). POPs comprise a group of numer-
ous artificial chemicals including dioxins, brominated flame retardants (BFRs), 
organochlorine pesticides (OCPs), perfluorinated compounds (PFCs), polychlori-
nated biphenyls (PCBs), and inclusively, polycyclic aromatic hydrocarbons (PAHs) 
(Wahlang 2018).
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With the establishment of the Stockholm Convention in 2001, an international 
agreement to regulate the production, distribution, use, and disposal of POPs was 
reached (Sheriff et al. 2021). The first Stockholm Convention list of POPs included 
12 priority pollutants: aldrin, chlordane, dichlorodiphenyltrichloroethane (DDT), 
dieldrin, endrin, heptachlor, hexachlorobenzene, mirex, toxaphene, PCBs, polychlo-
rinated dibenzo-p-dioxins (PCDD), and polychlorinated dibenzofurans (PCDFs); 
these chemicals were known as the “dirty dozen” (Tandon 2021). The production and 
extensive use of these chemical formulations began shortly after the end of World 
War II (Jennings and Li 2015). The Stockholm Convention bans these “first genera-
tion” 12 chemicals because of their toxicity, persistence, bioaccumulation, and long-
range transport (Patel et al. 2021). Additionally, the Basel and Rotterdam Conventions 
contemplate hazardous wastes and other special wastes, such as medical and elec-
tronic waste; and provide an information exchange procedure for international trade, 
such as imports of pesticides and other dangerous substances, in an attempt to reduce 
the environmental and human health impacts (BRS Conventions 2021).

Many countries signed and ratified Stockholm Convention in 2003 and have sub-
sequently developed their national implementation plans (NIPs). However, some of 
these countries have proved reluctant to ratify the language of the Convention. 
Derived from this, the proposal of new compounds and their inclusion in the 
Convention is complex. Such reluctance increases the production, use, and environ-
mental release of compounds that threaten human health around the world. The 
signatory parts of the Stockholm Convention must take legislative and administra-
tive actions to prevent the POPs associated environmental impacts, in both inside 
their territory and at the global level (Sharkey et al. 2020). However, the current 
knowledge state, environmental management practices, the degree of political and 
economic controversy in the POPs issue, as well as the importance of this topic in 
the public opinion and among policymakers, make it challenging to apply (Rottem 
2017). Mexico has a robust legal framework that regulates POPs. In addition, 
numerous evaluations of sites contaminated with POPs have been carried out in dif-
ferent country regions, to establish the quality of the soil and water, highlighting the 
urgency of developing management alternatives and remediation strategies for these 
contaminated areas. On the other hand, POPs exposition monitoring studies have 
been performed in different regions of the Mexican territory to generate a profile on 
the POPs people exposure. In México, population exposure to DDT, a pesticide 
used in public health, as well as the exposition to PAHs derived from biomass com-
bustion in indigenous communities has been documented. In addition, communities 
in industrial and urban areas are exposed to polybrominated diphenyl ethers 
(PBDEs) and the PCBs present in brick kiln smoke and non-controlled waste dis-
posal sites (Orta-García et al. 2014).

In the present chapter information about the general characteristics of POPs, the 
sources, pollution, and other environmental impacts are reviewed. It also covers 
human health threats, POPs environmental biomonitoring and ecotoxicology, the 
International and Mexican regulation related to POPs, soils polluted by POPs in 
Mexico, the management alternatives of POPs in Mexico, as well as the bioremedia-
tion alternatives.
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16.2  �Persistent Organic Pollutants (POPs)

16.2.1  �What Are POPs

Persistent Organic Pollutants (POPs) are limited water solubility and highly toxic 
chemical compounds, broadly resistant to most of the physical, chemical, and bio-
logical degradation processes in the environment. Due to these characteristics, 
POPs can persist in nature for a long time in the different environmental strata and 
be mobilized through the soil, water, and air. In addition, the high lipid solubility of 
these chemicals lets them be bioaccumulated in animal and human tissues, as well 
as their biomagnification through the trophic webs (Fu et al. 2003; Klánová et al. 
2009). According to their chemical characteristics, POPs are semi-volatile and low 
water solubility compounds, with molecular weights ranging from 200 to 500 Da 
(Jacob and Cherian 2013). These chemicals commonly are highly halogenated (Br, 
Cl, F), being chlorine, the main halogen element present in this group of com-
pounds. The number of carbon–chlorine bonds in a POP compound is directly 
related to its persistence; the higher the number of these bonds, the more hydrolysis 
stability and degradation resistance is shown by the compound (Yarto et al. 2003; 
Weinberg 2009; Venegas and Naranjo 2010; Guo and Kannan 2015; Lorenzo et al. 
2018; UNEP 2021).

Different studies worldwide have evidenced the adverse environmental and 
human health impacts of POPs (Fu et al. 2003; Lorenzo et al. 2018). Therefore, the 
Stockholm Convention on Persistent Organic Pollutants, established in 2001, aims 
to protect the environment and human health from POPs. This international instru-
ment requires governments to implement measures to eliminate, reduce the produc-
tion, use, import, export, and environmental release of POPs (Weinberg 2009). In 
1995, at the Stockholm Convention, an initial list of POPs that included 12 chemical 
compounds that were considered as priorities was created. The first included com-
pounds were: aldrin, dieldrin, chlordane, DDT, endrin, heptachlor, hexachloroben-
zene, PCBs, PCDD, PCDFs, mirex, and toxaphene (Yarto et al. 2003). In subsequent 
years, several novel chemicals were included in the Stockholm Convention list of 
POPs: Chlordecone, HCHs (α-, β-, and γ-isomers), hexabromobiphenyl, tetrabro-
modiphenyl ether and pentabromodiphenyl ether, hexabromodiphenyl ether and 
heptabromodiphenyl ether, perfluorooctane sulfonic acid, and perfluorooctanoic 
acid in the year 2009; endosulfan in 2010; hexabromocyclododecane in 2013; hexa-
chlorobutadiene, pentachlorophenol, its salts and esters, and the polychlorinated 
naphthalenes in 2015; decabromodiphenyl ether and the short-chain chlorinated 
paraffins in 2017; and finally, dicofol and pentachlorobenzene in 2019 (UNEP 
2011, 2021).

POPs have been classified in three general categories: (1) Pesticides used in agri-
culture, (2) Industrial chemical products used for diverse applications, and (3) 
Chemical products generated unintentionally because of incomplete combustion or 
chemical reactions (Weinberg 2009). Worldwide, pesticides have been employed 
for multiple activities, including pest control in agriculture, disease vectors control, 
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among others. Once applied, pesticides are volatilized from crop fields to the atmo-
sphere, or are translated to soil, superficial and underground water bodies through 
runoff and infiltration events. The presence of these pollutants in the environment 
favors their entrance to the organisms, where pesticides are bioaccumulated in their 
tissues. The release of pesticides included in the POPs list is implicated in several 
adverse impacts in the environment, as well as threats to the biodiversity and human 
health (Gaur et al. 2018). Among the POPs of group two, industrial chemical com-
pounds, PCBs have been reported as highly dangerous to the environment and 
human health. These chemicals are broadly used for diverse industrial applications 
due to their unique characteristics of low inflammability, heat resistance, chemical 
stability, low vapor pressure, high boiling point (320–420 °C), and dielectric prop-
erties Due to their intensive use since the 1930s, pollution caused by PCBs has been 
registered in several regions around the world (Abou-Elwafa 2015; Vukasinovic 
et al. 2017; Dave et al. 2021).

Currently, 30 POPs are listed in the Stockholm Convention (UNEP 2021). The 
information related to these compounds is shown in Table 16.1. These POPs are 
classified in three annexes (A, B, and C). Chemical compounds in Annex A are 
subject to the prohibition of their production, use, importation, and exportation. The 
compounds listed in annex B are subject to restrictions in their production and use. 
However, some of these compounds have exemptions to these restrictions. For 
example, the use of the pesticide DDT is allowed for the control of disease vectors, 
such as the mosquitoes of the Anopheles genus that are the transmitters of the para-
site Plasmodium sp. in Malaria, as well as the perfluorooctane sulfonic acid, which 
is a compound employed in the photographic industry, and the production of semi-
conductors, plates of metal, certain medical devices, firefighting foam, and insect 
traps. The compounds listed in Annex C include PCDDs and PCDFs whose unin-
tentional release must be reduced. These compounds are produced and released into 
the atmosphere due to incomplete combustion and chemical reactions during open 
waste burning, fossil fuels combustion, and chemicals production processes (UNEP 
2011; UNEP 2017; Gaur et al. 2018).

16  Soils Contaminated with Persistent Organic Pollutants (POPs): Current Situations…



418

C
at

eg
or

y
PO

P 
na

m
e

A
cr

on
ym

C
A

S 
nu

m
be

r
St

ru
ct

ur
e

C
la

ss
ifi

ca
tio

n

Pe
st

ic
id

e
A

ld
ri

n
30

9-
00

-2
Cl

Cl Cl
Cl

Cl
Cl

E
lim

in
at

io
n

α-
he

xa
ch

lo
ro

cy
cl

oh
ex

an
e

α-
H

C
H

31
9-

84
-6

C
l

C
l

C
l

C
l

C
l

C
l

β-
he

xa
ch

lo
ro

cy
cl

oh
ex

an
e

β-
H

C
H

C
l

C
l

C
l

C
l

C
l

C
l

C
hl

or
da

ne
51

03
-7

4-
2

Cl
Cl Cl

Cl

Cl
Cl

Cl

Cl

C
hl

or
de

co
ne

14
3-

50
-0

C
l

C
l

O
C
l

C
l

C
l

C
l

C
l
C
l

C
l

C
l

D
ic

of
ol

11
5-

32
-2

C
l

C
l

C
l

C
l
C
l

O
H

D
ie

ld
ri

n
60

-5
7-

1
Cl

Cl Cl
Cl

Cl
Cl

O

E
nd

os
ul

fa
n

11
5-

29
-7

Cl
Cl Cl

Cl

Cl
Cl

O O
S

O

Ta
bl

e 
16

.1
 

PO
Ps

 in
cl

ud
ed

 in
 th

e 
St

oc
kh

ol
m

 C
on

ve
nt

io
n 

(F
ie

dl
er

 e
t a

l. 
20

13
; J

on
es

 2
02

1;
 U

N
E

P 
20

21
)

M. L. Castrejón-Godínez et al.



419

C
at

eg
or

y
PO

P 
na

m
e

A
cr

on
ym

C
A

S 
nu

m
be

r
St

ru
ct

ur
e

C
la

ss
ifi

ca
tio

n

E
nd

ri
n

72
-2

0-
8

Cl
Cl Cl

Cl
Cl

O

γ-
he

xa
ch

lo
ro

cy
cl

oh
ex

an
e

γ-
H

C
H

58
-8

9-
9

C
l

C
l

C
l

C
l

C
l

C
l

H
ex

ab
ro

m
ob

ip
he

ny
l

H
B

B
36

35
5-

01
-8

Br

Br

Br

Br

Br

Br

H
ex

ab
ro

m
od

ip
he

ny
l e

th
er

PB
D

E
68

63
1-

49
-2

20
71

22
-1

5-
4

44
62

55
-2

2-
7

O
Br

Br
Br

Br
Br

Br

H
ep

ta
br

om
od

ip
he

ny
l e

th
er

20
71

22
-1

6-
5

O
Br

Br
Br

Br Br

Br

Br

M
ir

ex
23

85
-8

5-
5

Cl
Cl

Cl
Cl

ClCl
Cl

Cl

Cl
Cl

Cl
Cl

Pe
nt

ac
hl

or
op

he
no

l, 
its

 s
al

ts
 a

nd
 e

st
er

s
PC

P
87

-8
6-

5
13

1-
52

-2
27

73
5-

64
-4

37
72

-9
4-

9
18

25
-2

1-
4

O
H

C
l

C
l

C
l

C
l

C
l

(c
on

tin
ue

d)

16  Soils Contaminated with Persistent Organic Pollutants (POPs): Current Situations…



420

C
at

eg
or

y
PO

P 
na

m
e

A
cr

on
ym

C
A

S 
nu

m
be

r
St

ru
ct

ur
e

C
la

ss
ifi

ca
tio

n

Te
tr

ab
ro

m
od

ip
he

ny
l e

th
er

B
D

E
54

36
-4

3-
1

O
Br

Br
Br

Br

Pe
nt

ab
ro

m
od

ip
he

ny
l e

th
er

PB
D

E
32

53
4-

81
-9

O
Br

Br
Br

Br

Br

To
xa

ph
en

e
80

01
-3

5-
2

C
l

C
l

C
l

C
l

C
l

C
l

C
l

C
l

D
ic

hl
or

od
ip

he
ny

ltr
ic

hl
or

oe
th

an
e

D
D

T
50

-2
9-

3

Cl

Cl
Cl

Cl

Cl
R

es
tr

ic
tio

n

H
ep

ta
ch

lo
r

76
-4

4-
8

Cl

Cl
Cl Cl

Cl

Cl
Cl

In
du

st
ri

al
D

ec
ab

ro
m

od
ip

he
ny

l e
th

er
D

ec
a-


B

D
E

11
63

-1
9-

5
O

Br
Br Br

Br
Br

BrBr
Br

Br
Br

E
lim

in
at

io
n

H
ex

ab
ro

m
oc

yc
lo

do
de

ca
ne

H
B

C
D

25
63

7-
99

-4
Br

Br

Br
Br

BrBr

Pe
rfl

uo
ro

oc
ta

no
ic

 a
ci

d
PF

O
A

33
5-

67
-1

F
F

O

F

F

F

F F

F

F

F
F F

F

F

F
F

F
O
H

Sh
or

t-
ch

ai
n 

ch
lo

ri
na

te
d 

pa
ra

ffi
ns

SC
C

Ps
85

53
5-

84
-8

C
l

C
l

C
l

C
l

C
l

Ta
bl

e 
16

.1
 

(c
on

tin
ue

d)
M. L. Castrejón-Godínez et al.



421

C
at

eg
or

y
PO

P 
na

m
e

A
cr

on
ym

C
A

S 
nu

m
be

r
St

ru
ct

ur
e

C
la

ss
ifi

ca
tio

n

U
ni

nt
en

tio
na

l 
pr

od
uc

tio
n

Po
ly

ch
lo

ri
na

te
d 

di
be

nz
o-

p-
di

ox
in

s
PC

D
D

s
C
l m

C
l n

O O

U
ni

nt
en

tio
na

l p
ro

du
ct

io
n

Po
ly

ch
lo

ri
na

te
d 

di
be

nz
of

ur
an

s
PC

D
Fs

O

C
l n

C
l m

Pe
st

ic
id

e,
 

in
du

st
ri

al
, a

nd
 

un
in

te
nt

io
na

l 
pr

od
uc

tio
n

H
ex

ac
hl

or
ob

en
ze

ne
H

C
B

11
8-

74
-1

C
l

C
l

C
l

C
l

C
l

C
l

E
lim

in
at

io
n 

an
d 

U
ni

nt
en

tio
na

l p
ro

du
ct

io
n

Pe
nt

ac
hl

or
ob

en
ze

ne
Pe

C
B

60
8-

93
-5

Cl
Cl Cl

Cl Cl

Pe
st

ic
id

e 
an

d 
In

du
st

ri
al

Pe
rfl

uo
ro

oc
ta

ne
 s

ul
fo

ni
c 

ac
id

PF
O

S
17

63
-2

3-
1

F
F

S O

O F

F

F

F F

F

F

F
F F

F

F

F
F

F

O
H

R
es

tr
ic

tio
n

In
du

st
ri

al
 a

nd
 

un
in

te
nt

io
na

l 
pr

od
uc

tio
n

H
ex

ac
hl

or
ob

ut
ad

ie
ne

H
C

B
D

87
-6

8-
3

C
l

C
l

C
l C

lC
l C

l

E
lim

in
at

io
n 

an
d 

U
ni

nt
en

tio
na

l p
ro

du
ct

io
n

Po
ly

ch
lo

ri
na

te
d 

bi
ph

en
yl

s
PC

B
s

11
09

7-
69

-1
C
l n

C
l m

Po
ly

ch
lo

ri
na

te
d 

na
ph

th
al

en
e

PC
N

C
l m

C
l n

16  Soils Contaminated with Persistent Organic Pollutants (POPs): Current Situations…



422

16.2.2  �Sources, Pollution, and Other Environmental Impacts

POPs as dibenzofurans and dioxins are generated naturally through volcanic activi-
ties and forest fires. However, human activities mainly produce these compounds 
through industrial processes, waste incineration plants, and agricultural activities 
(Gaur et al. 2018; Thakur and Pathania 2020; Akhtar et al. 2021). The environmen-
tal fate of the POPs is the atmosphere, which is the main transport media for these 
compounds (Fernández and Grimalt 2003). Next, these compounds can reach the 
water bodies, where they accumulate in the tissues of aquatic organisms (bioaccu-
mulation) increasing their levels through trophic webs (biomagnification), generat-
ing adverse secondary effects (Lorenzo et al. 2018). POPs can also be found in soil 
and river sediments (Ren et al. 2018; Thakur and Pathania 2020).

POPs have generated significant adverse effects over a great diversity of species; 
their presence has been reported in almost all trophic levels, endangering the biodi-
versity of the polluted sites (Akhtar et al. 2021). Furthermore, the POPs exposition 
has been correlated with the reduction in the population levels of several species, 
due to immunotoxicity, failure in the function of the endocrine, reproductive and 
immunologic systems, as well as mortality increase in pups, deformations, increase 
in the incidence of tumors, thinning of the eggs wall, metabolic changes, cancer, 
changes in their behavior, alterations in the activity of the glutathione-S-transferase 
enzyme, as well as adult mortality, among others (Yarto et al. 2003; Venegas and 
Naranjo 2010; García et al. 2012; Alharbi et al. 2018). Likewise, POPs affect envi-
ronmental factors such as temperature, precipitation, thaw, and biogeochemical 
cycles such as the carbon cycle, contributing to global warming (Thakur and 
Pathania 2020).

16.3  �Human Health Threats

POPs generate serious problems for human health. Different authors, such as 
Alharbi et  al. (2018), Zacharia (2019), Djangalina et  al. (2020), and Thakur and 
Pathania (2020) point out that different POPs have been found in embryos, fetuses, 
and people of all ages. Human diseases related to POPs exposition include adverse 
effects on the endocrine system function, due to their profile as endocrine disrup-
tors, generating hormonal alterations, adversely affecting the reproductive system 
resulting in birth defects, premature labor, developmental disorders, low birth 
weight, among others. POPs are also related to the development of cancer, cardio-
vascular diseases such as hypertension, angina pectoris, cardiac arrhythmias, among 
others, as well as to obesity, learning disabilities, diabetes, chloracne, porphyria, 
atherosclerosis, and neuropsychological impairment (Fig. 16.1). According to Tam 
et  al. (2021), the World Health Organization reports 4.9 million deaths directly 
caused by POPs exposure each year, in addition to millions of people who develop 
POPs related diseases.
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16.4  �POPs Environmental Biomonitoring and Ecotoxicology

Ecotoxicological studies evaluate the impact of toxic substances on the processes of 
natural ecosystems, as the flow of matter and energy of ecosystems, the dynamics of 
communities, the distribution and abundance of populations, and the morphology, 
physiology, and behavior of individuals (Galloway and Depledge 2001). There are 
some facts that need to be considered for biomonitoring and assessing ecotoxico-
logical studies regarding the POPs environmental effects. (1) Since POPs bioaccu-
mulate and biomagnificate along the food chain, these effects can be monitored at 
different levels of biological organization (from molecules to ecosystems). In eco-
toxicological studies, biomarkers from the individual to the ecosystem level are 
used, considering the effects seen at the cellular and subcellular levels (Mussali-
Galante et al. 2013). (2) These include a wide range of acute and chronic health 
effects, including cancer, congenital disabilities, immunosuppression, neurological 
disorders, and reproductive alterations. POPs are also referred to as endocrine dis-
ruptors (Kallenborn 2006; Mitra et al. 2011) being this last toxicity mechanism that 
is one of the most studied areas to date. (3) As endocrine disruptors, POPs directly 
compete with several natural hormones displacing them from their respective recep-
tor binding sites, consequently, these pollutants are considered to act as synthetic 
hormones. The hormonal imbalances caused by pollutant-associated endocrine dis-
ruption have proved to be valuable indicators for documenting POPs adverse effects 
on various organisms (Kallenborn 2006). Hence, ecotoxicological studies and bio-
monitoring strategies should consider the use of biomarkers for assessing the eco-
toxicity of POPs at various levels of the biological organization.

Currently, biomarkers give additional knowledge that cannot be obtained from 
the analysis of POPs concentrations alone. Also, they may incorporate the effects of 
chemical mixtures through a long exposure time. It is advisable to use a multibio-
marker approach at different levels of the biological organization to evaluate the 

Fig. 16.1  Examples of human health problems related to POPs
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effects of POPs on the environment, in order to establish a more robust approach to 
any possible effects that may occur. At polluted sites, the organisms that integrate 
the top of the food web can bioaccumulate high POPs concentrations in their tis-
sues, pollutant concentrations that exceed the individual toxicity thresholds, trigger 
several biochemical and physiological alterations in the exposed individuals. 
Therefore, ecotoxicological studies generate the bases for the prevention and reduc-
tion of risk by characterizing and evaluating the possible effects caused by the pres-
ence of toxic compounds and substances. In studies at the ecosystem level, it should 
be considered that toxic pollutants do not occur in isolation but in mixtures, or in 
combination with physical and biological agents.

Furthermore, in ecotoxicological surveys, the selection of a biomonitor species 
must be made according to the pollutant of interest and the site that needs to be 
monitored. The main suggested criteria for selecting them properly are (1) reduced 
mobility, (2) being in contact with the pollutant; (3) accumulation of high levels of 
the pollutant; (4) high abundance; (5) wide geographic distribution; (6) high longev-
ity; (7) easy to sample; (8) easy to manipulate; (9) dose–response relationship; (10) 
long-term presence; (11) simple eating habits; (12) broad environmental stress tol-
erance; (13) well-defined species taxonomically; (14) extensive knowledge of its 
life history and biology (Haug et  al. 1974; Phillips 1980; Phillips and Rainbow 
1994; Rainbow 1995; Tanabe and Subramanian 2003; Luoma and Rainbow 2008; 
Zhou et al. 2008; Mussali-Galante et al. 2013). Associating molecular change to 
potential individuals, population, and community, with the aim of establishing links 
between the different levels of the biological organization is pertinent when consid-
ering the impact of POPs, because toxicity appears first in individuals before popu-
lations are affected, with subsequent changes at community level.

16.4.1  �At the Individual Level

The effect of POPs will depend on the life stage of the exposed species, life history 
traits, overall health condition, and nutritional status. The main effects of POPs at 
the individual level are endocrine-disrupting, genotoxicity, ethology changes, repro-
ductive alterations, immune dysfunction, and neurotoxicity.

Endocrine-disrupting. The consequences of these endocrine-disrupting effects 
can be observed mainly as physiological alterations in reproductive systems, spe-
cifically, alteration to sexual organs and hermaphroditism. The hormone-disrupting 
effects of anthropogenic pollutants have been shown to be valuable indicators for 
the documentation of pollutant effects on various organisms. For example, the 
induction of vitellogenin production (a hormone linked to egg production in 
females) in juvenile or male fish has become one of the most important biomarkers 
linked to endocrine-disrupting chemical agents. The relationship between POPs 
exposure and their effects using vitellogenin gene expression has been assessed as a 
biomarker of effects in fish (Zapata-Perez et al. 2007). For example, Zapata-Perez 
et al. (2007) studied the hardhead catfish (Ariopsis felis) from three ecosystems in 
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the Southern Gulf of Mexico and Yucatan Peninsula. The authors detected that the 
concentrations of chlordanes, DDTs, HCHs, and PCBs were higher in exposed fish 
and that vitellogenin gene expression was over-expressed in fish collected from the 
site registering the highest levels of different POPs. Statistical analysis showed that 
the vitellogenin gene expression was significantly related to the concentrations of 
total DDTs and PCBs and negatively related to total Drins (dieldrin, aldrin, endrin).

Genotoxic damage. The genotoxic damage has been reported in different wild 
species exposed to POPs. González-Mille et al. (2019) found a significant associa-
tion between total levels of POPs and genotoxic damage in different taxonomic 
groups, such as invertebrates, fishes, amphibians, and reptiles exposed to POPs mix-
tures. This is an important finding since genotoxic effects have been linked to eco-
logical effects at higher levels of biological organization (Mussali-Galante 
et al. 2014).

Ethology changes. It has been documented that exposure to POPs (e.g., DDT) 
promotes alterations in the central nervous system, manifesting a deficit in learning 
and memory, and locomotion, as well as ethological alterations (Smith et al. 1976; 
Topinka et al. 1984; Tilson et al. 1987; Paul et al. 1994; Schantz and Widholm 2001; 
Mariussen and Fonnum 2006). In general, the main target of POPs (e.g., andrin, 
α-endosulfan, dieldrin, lindane, aldrin) in the central nervous system is the GABAA 
receptor (gamma-aminobutyric acid). Chronic exposure to POPs alters protein 
numbers, including antioxidant enzymes, receptors, and transporters of certain neu-
rotransmitters, etc. (Slotkin and Seidler 2008, 2009). They also alter metabolic 
enzymes, including acetylcholinesterase, ion channels such as Mg2+, Na+/K+ and 
Ca2+, and ATPases of the plasma and mitochondrial membrane (Sahoo et al. 1999; 
Jia and Misra 2007), which contributes to changes in memory and learning. The 
brain accumulates large amounts of POPs comparable to adipose tissue. Therefore, 
brains exposed to levels of insecticides are capable of interfering with GABAergic 
neurotransmission (Vale et al. 2003).

Histopathological effects. As generated by POPs and a good effect biomarker 
that detects morphological alterations in various tissues by toxic agents. In fish 
exposed to chlordanes, dieldrin, DDT, and PAHs, histological liver abnormalities 
have been documented (Stehr et al. 1997).

Cancer. In addition to all the above-described effects at the individual level, 
many POPs are known or suspected carcinogens. PAHs, PCDD, and PCDFs are 
perhaps the most obvious examples (Jones and de Voogt 1999). Moreover, in top-
predator species, POPs effects also extend to the immune system (Safe 1994; Ross 
et al. 1995), enhancing their susceptibility to disease and affecting their behavior 
patterns (De Swart et al. 1994).
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Table 16.2  Sites in Mexico polluted with POPs

POP
Concentration 
(ng/g DW) Environmental sample Location Reference

Northwest Region

ΣCHL 0.38–0.72 Agricultural drain 
sediments

Mexicali valley, 
Baja California

Sánchez-
Osorio et al. 
(2017)

ΣDDT 1.5–30
ΣHCH 0.022–3.4
ΣCHL 0.055–8.2 Residential soils
ΣDDT 1.3–152
ΣHCH 0.034–8.0
DDD 0.84–12.4 Agricultural soils Juarez Valley, 

Chihuahua
Núñez-
Gastélum 
et al. (2019)

DDE 0.28–21.16
DDT 0.13–171.86
Endosulfan 0.75–1076
Isodrin 0.71–17.07
DDT ND-336.2 Agricultural soil Culiacan valley, 

Sinaloa
García-
Hernández 
et al. (2021)

Endosulfan 1.4–1974.8
HCH ND-24.9
DDT 0.51–21.95 Agricultural drain 

sediments
Culiacan valley, 
Sinaloa

García-de la 
Parra et al. 
(2012)

Endosulfan 0.5–4.85
HCH 0.22–8.77
PCBs 0.05–3.29
Aldrin ND-0.6 Agricultural and lagoon 

sediments
Navachiste-
Macapule 
system, Sinaloa

Montes et al. 
(2012)Dieldrin 0.2–2.5

Endosulfan I 0.2–6.2
Endosulfan II 0.2–2.5
Endosulfan 
sulfate

0.7–9.4

Endrin 0.3–27.0
Endrin aldehyde 0.3–1.4
Endrin ketone 0.3–9.8
α-HCH 0.3–41.3
β-HCH 0.3–533.3
γ-HCH 0.3–7.7
δ-HCH 0.3–70.2
Heptachlor ND–17.9
Heptachlor 
epoxide

ND–0.6

Methoxychlor 0.5–42.1
p,p′-DDD ND–0.6
p,p′-DDE 0.4–2.8
p,p′-DDT ND–1.8
DDT ND–3131.4 Agricultural soil Yaqui valley, 

Sonora
García-
Hernández 
et al. (2021)

Endosulfan ND–37

(continued)
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POP
Concentration 
(ng/g DW) Environmental sample Location Reference

CHL 0.009–1.0 Agricultural drain 
sediments

Yaqui valley, 
Sonora

Sánchez-
Osorio et al. 
(2017)

DDT 0.21–55
HCH 0.032–5.6
CHL 0.062–25 Residential soils
DDT 0.13–268
HCH 0.035–3.1
Aldrin 2.3 Agricultural soil Caborca, Sonora Leal et al. 

(2014)α-Chlordane 1.2
γ-Chlordane 2.4
Dieldrin 3.3
Endosulfan 8.9
Endrin 5.6
HCB 2.9
α-HCH 2.0
γ-HCH 1.4
Heptachlor 2.73
Isodrin 3.1
Methoxychlor 2.4
Mirex 2.2
p,p′-DDD 3.1
p,p′-DDE 9.6
p,p′-DDT 1.3
Aldrin 2.8 Agricultural soil Hermosillo, 

Sonoraα-Chlordane 2.6
γ-Chlordane 2.0
Dieldrin 2.3
Endosulfan 3.6
Endrin 7.5
HCB ND
α-HCH 1.4
γ-HCH 1.7
Heptachlor 2.5
Isodrin 8.4
Methoxychlor 8.9
Mirex 4.2
p,p′-DDD 4.0
p,p′-DDE 7.8
p,p′-DDT 5.0

Table 16.2  (continued)
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POP
Concentration 
(ng/g DW) Environmental sample Location Reference

Aldrin 2.2 Agricultural soil Guaymas, 
Sonoraα-Chlordane 2.3

γ-Chlordane 3.8
Dieldrin 4.3
Endosulfan 3.9
Endrin 19.0
HCB 4.8
α-HCH 3.7
γ-HCH 2.0
Heptachlor 3.4
Isodrin 1.4
Methoxychlor 3.1
Mirex 1.7
p,p′-DDD 1.8
p,p′-DDE 45.8
p,p′-DDT 4.2
Aldrin 5.4 Agricultural soil Magdalena, 

Sonoraα-Chlordane 1.1
γ-Chlordane 2.3
Dieldrin 6.7
Endosulfan 4.1
Endrin 24.4
HCB 0.7
α-HCH 2.3
γ-HCH 1.4
Heptachlor 1.7
Isodrin 0.4
Methoxychlor 5.0
Mirex 2.0
p,p′-DDD 1.1
p,p′-DDE 9.0
p,p′-DDT 3.5

Table 16.2  (continued)
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POP
Concentration 
(ng/g DW) Environmental sample Location Reference

Aldrin 1.0 Agricultural soil Ures, Sonora
α-Chlordane 1.7
γ-Chlordane 1.7
Dieldrin 0.9
Endosulfan 1.4
Endrin 18.8
HCB ND
α-HCH 1.8
γ-HCH 1.6
Heptachlor 1.3
Isodrin ND
Methoxychlor 4.2
Mirex 1.5
p,p′-DDD 1.1
p,p′-DDE 1.0
p,p′-DDT 0.6
Aldrin ND–41,000 Agricultural soils Mayo valley, 

Sonora
Cantú-Soto 
et al. (2011)BHC ND–127,900

Lindane ND–3000
Methoxychlor ND–19,900
p,p′-DDD ND–23,200
p,p′-DDE ND–42,200
p,p′-DDT ND–120,400
Aldrin ND–74,000 Residential soils
BHC ND–938,500
Endosulfan ND–35,100
Endrin ND–161,400
Lindane ND–13,900
Methoxychlor ND–20,000
p,p′-DDD ND–39,300
p,p′-DDE ND–226,300
p,p′-DDT ND–301,200

Table 16.2  (continued)
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POP
Concentration 
(ng/g DW) Environmental sample Location Reference

Aldrin ND–15,900 Agricultural soils Yaqui valley, 
SonoraBHC ND–143,100

Endosulfan ND–124,000
Endrin ND–32,500
Lindane ND–2100
Methoxychlor ND–71,700
p,p′-DDD ND–13,300
p,p′-DDE ND–61,600
p,p′-DDT ND–110,000
Aldrin ND–25,800 Residential soils
BHC ND–292,400
Endosulfan ND–43,300
Endrin ND–377,300
Methoxychlor ND–19,700
p,p′-DDD ND–197,300
p,p′-DDE ND–621,300
p,p′-DDT ND–679,700
Northeast Region

DDT 25.3–790 Urban soil Monterrey, 
Nuevo León

Orta-García 
et al. (2016)PBDEs 1.80–127

PCBs 4.0–65.5
Western Region

PBDEs 0.2–2.5 Lake sediments, urban Chapala lake, 
Jalisco

Ontiveros-
Cuadras et al. 
(2019)

PCBs 9–27

PBDEs 0.3–1.5 Lake sediments, rural El Tule lagoon, 
Jalisco

Ontiveros-
Cuadras et al. 
(2014)

PCBs 1.7–24.7
PBDEs 0.4–1.8 Santa Elena 

lake, JaliscoPCBs 1.5–15.4
East Region

Aldrin 9.31 Agricultural soil Tepeaca, Puebla Islas-García 
et al. (2015)Endosulfan I 6.43

Endosulfan II 1.91
Endrín aldehyde 2.55
Heptachlor 13.80
p,p′-DDE 17.04
trans-Chlordane 29.70

Table 16.2  (continued)
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POP
Concentration 
(ng/g DW) Environmental sample Location Reference

HCB 0.2–1.5 Agricultural soil Puebla and State 
of Mexico

Waliszewski 
et al. (2008)α-HCH 0.2–2.2

γ-HCH 1.0–7.2
p,p′-DDE 2.0–7.1
o,p′-DDT 4.9–31
p,p′-DDT 22.9–99.2
PCBs 0–88022.1 Agricultural soils Tlaxcala, 

Tlaxcala
García-Nieto 
et al. (2019)DDT 3.9–208.0

PCBs 135–93,941 River sediments
DDT 0.6–137
PCBs 23.8–77 Lake sediments, urban Las Matas 

lagoon, Veracruz
Ruiz-
Fernández 
et al. (2012)

Midwest Region

PBDEs 5–134 Urban soil San Luis Potosí, 
San Luis Potosí

Perez-
Vazquez et al. 
(2015)

PCB ND–80.5
DDD ND–25.6
DDT ND–4.9
Aldrin 0.65–1.35 Agricultural soil Río Verde, San 

Luis Potosí
Velasco et al. 
(2014)Endosulfan I 1.44–1.45

Endosulfan II 0.27–48.62
Endosulfan 
sulfate

1.96–9.51

Endrin aldehyde 0.75–4.56
α-HCH 0.58–0.92
β-HCH 1.08–5.73
γ-HCH 0.13–54.68
δ-HCH 0.08–9.07
Heptachlor 1.43–11.28
Heptachlor 
epoxide

11.18–26.04

Methoxychlor 1.20–37.70
p,p′-DDD 1.04–19.32
p,p′-DDE 0.13–15.01
p,p′-DDT 14.9–144.10
PBDEs 2.5–95.0 Urban soil San Felipe 

Nuevo 
Mercurio, 
Mazapil, 
Zacatecas

Costilla-
Salazar et al. 
(2011)

Table 16.2  (continued)
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POP
Concentration 
(ng/g DW) Environmental sample Location Reference

South Central Region

PCBs 253 Lake sediments, urban Espejo de los 
Lirios, Mexico 
city

Piazza et al. 
(2009)

PCBs 621 Lake sediments, urban Chalco lake, 
Mexico city

Piazza et al. 
(2008)

63.7 Texcoco lake. 
Mexico city

PBDEs 115–108,460 Urban soil Alpuyeca, 
Xochitepec, 
Morelos

Perez-
Maldonado 
et al. (2014)

Aldrin 0.1–12.2 Agricultural soil Tlaltizapán, 
Morelos

Velasco et al. 
(2012)Endosulfan I 0.1–16.2

Endosulfan II 0.1–35.8
Endosulfan 
sulfate

ND–17.9

Endrin 0.2–18
Endrin aldehyde 0.2–84
α-HCH 0.2–129.6
β-HCH 0.9–12.3
γ-HCH 0.1–44.2
δ-HCH 0.2–4.6
Heptachlor 0.05–36.1
Heptachlor 
epoxide

ND–11.1

Methoxychlor ND–34.4
p,p′-DDD 0.2–25.6
p,p′-DDE 0.1–70.6
p,p′-DDT 0.2–79.1
Southeast Region

PCBs 6–372 Lake sediments, urban Mecoacán lake, 
Tabasco

Armenta-
Arteaga and 
Elizalde-
González 
(2003)

DW Dry Weight, ΣHCH α-HCH + β-HCH + γ-HCH + δ-HCH (Hexachlorocyclohexanes), ΣDDT 
o,p′-DDE  +  o,p′-DDD  +  o,p′-DDT  +  p,p′-DDE  +  p,p′-DDD  +  p,p′-DDT, ΣCHL 
HEPT  +  HEPX  +  TC  +  CC (Chlordanes), PBDEs Polybrominated diphenyl ethers, PCBs 
Polychlorinated biphenyls, ND Non detected

Table 16.2  (continued)
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16.4.2  �At the Population Level

Effects of POPs exposure can be established between molecular and physiological 
alterations in individuals and changes at population level. These changes include:

Reduction in abundance of the population. It has been documented that wild 
population exposed to DDT and analogous insecticide rothane caused a reduction in 
population size. For example, fish-eating in the USA (Hunt and Bischoff 1960), 

Table 16.3  Methods applied in bioremediation

Strategies Description

In situ bioremediation

Bioaugmentation Consist in the addition of pure of mixed exogenous microbial cultures 
to increase the microbial pollutants biodegradation

Bioventing Consist in the injection of air to contaminated soil to stimulate 
microbial activity and pollutants biodegradation

Biosparging Consist in the pressurized air injection below the contaminated water 
surface, oxygen supply stimulates microbial growth, aerobic 
biological activity and improve pollutants biodegradation

Biostimulation Consist in the modification of the characteristics of the polluted 
environment to stimulate growth and biological activity of the 
microflora in charge of the bioremediation process; this includes the 
nutrients availability increase, adding sources of carbon, nitrogen, 
phosphorous, among others

Microbial assisted 
phytoremediation

Consist in the use of combination of plants and beneficial 
microorganisms for degradation and detoxification of pollutants in soil

Natural attenuation Consist in the natural degradation of the pollutant by the biological 
action of the autochthonous microorganism from contaminated sites

Phytoremediation Consist in the use of different higher plants species for soil 
remediation, plants can extract, stabilize, or biodegrade pollutants

Ex situ bioremediation

Biofiltering Consist in the use of a biofilter in which immobilized microorganisms 
retain or biodegrade pollutants

Biopiling Consist in a bed of mound of contaminated soil, in which factors as 
moisture, temperature, nutrients, oxygen, and pH are controlled to 
enhance microbial pollutants biodegradation

Bioreactors Consist in the use of a bioreactor system in which microorganism 
growing biodegrade pollutants. The system controls all parameter for 
supporting microbial growth and biological activity

Composting Consist in the mixing of contaminated soil with a bulking agent, the 
pollutants are biodegraded by aerobic microbial and posterior 
thermophilic action using static or aerated piles in the treatment

Land farming Consist in the treatment of contaminated soil, adding it to the 
superficial layer of the soil or into a treatment cell, polluted material is 
mixed periodically for biodegradation

Windrows Consist in forming windrows of polluted soil, polluted material is 
rotated periodically for microbial-mediated degradation improvement

Sources: Das and Dash (2014); Azubuike et al. (2016); Sharma (2020); Raffa and Chiampo (2021)
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birds of prey in Europe, North America (Hickey and Anderson 1968), and the UK 
(by a reduction in eggshell weight and thickness) (Ratcliffe 1967). These findings 
show the lethal effects and toxicity that POPs cause on top species of the food chain. 
Also, it has been documented that the insecticide dieldrin was responsible for the 
population crash of sparrowhawks (Accipiter nisus) in the UK (Sibly et al. 2000), 
demonstrating that high bioaccumulation of POPs found in the tissues of this preda-
tor species is clear evidence of the lethal effects of these pollutants.

Alteration in sexual organs. This effect can lead to low reproductive success 
and low fitness rates of the exposed population. Ecotoxicological research on wild-
life populations has demonstrated that endocrine-disrupting chemicals profoundly 
impair animal reproduction and development. It has been documented that tributyl-
tin (TBT) promotes masculinization in female marine mollusks, and this POP may 
cause a decline or local extinction of the population. For example, Bryan et  al. 
(1986) and Gibbs and Bryan (1986) registered that the Dog whelk (Nucella lapillus) 
exposed to TBT decline its population size in the UK. The observed masculinization 
in females and the depressed reproductive capacity were explained by the competi-
tive inhibition of TBT with cytochrome P450 dependent aromatase, enzyme respon-
sible for the aromatization of testosterone and its conversion into estradiol 
(Matthiessen and Gibbs 1998). In many ecotoxicological studies, regional decline 
in fish, bird, and/or invertebrate populations resulting from exposure to POPs, such 
as DDT, PCBs, PCDD, and TBT has been related to biochemical, cellular, endo-
crine, and physiological effects in individuals (Vasseur and Cossu-Leguille 2006). 
One interesting finding is that organochlorines, notably DDED a metabolic break-
down product of DDT, can affect eggshell thickness in birds of prey (Ratclife 1967; 
Pearce et al. 1979), resulting in low fitness rates of the exposed population.

16.4.3  �At the Community Level

In communities, particularly where contamination may act as a chemical stressor, 
different indexes and community properties have proved useful for evaluating the 
extent of environmental pollution. POPs can dissolve in the fatty tissues of organ-
isms reducing their growth, size, fecundity, and fitness, which may eventually influ-
ence community structure (Arkoosh et  al. 1998; Robinet and Feunteun 2002). 
However, few studies exist that evaluate changes in wild species assemblages 
(Clements and Rohr 2009). The little information generated so far at community 
level generates gaps in the effect of environmental pollutants on community struc-
ture, species composition, diversity, and functional groups. At community level, the 
most employed diversity measure indexes include the species richness, the Shannon–
Wiener index (H′), and the Pielou evenness index (J).

In this context, in a study conducted by Neamtu et al. (2009) which characterized 
POPs in the Bahlui river in Rumania, the communities of phytoplankton and benthic 
invertebrates were monitored. They observed that water toxicity, related to the pres-
ence of POPs, appears to be higher for algae and less for benthic invertebrates, such 
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as Daphnia magna, and indicated that primary producers reacted stronger than con-
sumers at the presence of pollutants. The species richness in phytoplankton and 
macroinvertebrates appears to be negatively influenced by pollution. Also, the 
Shannon–Wiener diversity index, the Pielou evenness index, and the McNaughton 
dominant index each indicated that invertebrate communities appear to a have a 
more stable structure along the river. Johnston and Roberts (2009) documented, in a 
review and meta-analysis of the effects of contaminants on the richness and even-
ness of the marine community, that species richness is the most sensitive index for 
measuring community level effects, evidencing that polluted communities contain 
fewer species. Also, a near to 40% reduction in species richness was detected, 
regardless of the type of pollutants. It is important to note that as biological organi-
zation levels rise, the complexity of assessing cause-effect relationships between a 
certain pollutant and their effects also rises. That’s why there are very few studies 
evaluating the ecotoxicological effects of POPs at higher levels of biological orga-
nizations, mainly at community level. Therefore, biomonitoring studies of ecologi-
cal effects exerted by pollutants are urgent and necessary to gain information for 
more robust biomonitoring and mitigation strategies.

16.5  �Soils Polluted by POPs in Mexico

According to Mexican normativity, a polluted site is defined as “a place, space, soil, 
waterbody, installation or combination of these kinds of sites that has been in con-
tact with materials or waste, which, due to their concentrations or characteristics, 
could represent a risk for human health, living organisms or the goods and proper-
ties of people” (LGPGIR 2021). The causes of pollution are diverse. These include 
the inadequate disposal of different waste categories, leaks of hazardous materials 
or wastes from tanks, underground containers, tubes and ducts, the lixiviation of 
hazardous materials from places with production activities, storage sites, landfills, 
and dumpsites, as well as accidents and spills of chemical substances during trans-
portation operations (SEMARNAT 2021).

The polluted sites can be divided into two main categories: those affected by 
environmental emergencies and the sites with the presence of environmental pas-
sives, the inadequate management of hazardous materials as well as the incidence of 
accidents that release toxic chemicals causes pollution in all environmental strata 
(soil, water, and air). The environmental presence and persistence of pollutants are 
recognized as a serious threat to ecosystems and human health. In Mexico more 
than 1000 polluted sites are registered. Contamination in these sites is related to 
different causes, including waste disposal, mining activities, industrial processes, 
and oil spills and its derivatives (SEMARNAT 2021). As pointed out above, the 
environmental presence of POPs is recognized as an important contamination con-
cern worldwide. Mexico has committed to reduce POPs generation and encourage 
scientific research to identify and monitor sites polluted by these kinds of chemi-
cals, as a signatory of the Stockholm Convention. Table 16.2 shows different studies 
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carried out to detect and monitor the presence of POPs in environmental samples 
around Mexico. The country is divided into eight geographical regions (Northwest, 
Northeast, West, East, North Central, South Central, Southeast, and Southwest). In 
almost all regions’ sites polluted by POPs have been detected.

Most of the 22 studies shown in Table 16.2 were carried out in the Northwest 
region, with seven studies carried out in Baja California, Chihuahua, Sinaloa, and 
Sonora. In these studies, the determination of the presence of different POPs in 
agricultural drain sediments, agricultural and residential soil, was achieved. The 
principal POPs monitored include OCPs such as DDT and its degradation products; 
lindane and other hexachlorocyclohexane isomers; aldrin, dieldrin, endrin, endosul-
fan, heptachlor, and methoxychlor (Cantú-Soto et al. 2011; García-de la Parra et al. 
2012; Montes et  al. 2012; Leal et  al. 2014; Sánchez-Osorio et  al. 2017; Núñez-
Gastélum et al. 2019; García-Hernández et al. 2021).

In the South Central region of Mexico four studies have been carried out in lake 
sediments near urban areas of Mexico City (Piazza et al. 2008; Piazza et al. 2009). 
In addition, in agricultural and urban soils of the state of Morelos (Velasco et al. 
2012; Pérez-Maldonado et al. 2014). POPs evaluated in these studies included poly-
chlorinated biphenyl, PBDEs, and different OCPs.

In the East region, four studies have taken place, two of them evaluating OCPs in 
agricultural soil samples in the state of Puebla (Waliszewski et al. 2008; Islas-García 
et al. 2015). The study of García-Nieto et al. (2019) was focused on the evaluation 
of the presence of DDT and PCBs in agricultural soils and river sediments in the 
state of Tlaxcala, while in the state of Veracruz, the study carried out identified the 
presence of PCBs in sediments of the lagoon of Las Matas close to an urban area 
(Ruiz-Fernández et al. 2012).

In the Midwest region, three studies were identified, two of them for the state of 
San Luis Potosí. The first study was carried out in soil samples of urban areas to 
identify the presence of DDT, PBDEs, and PCBs (Perez-Vazquez et al. 2015), and 
the second evaluated the pollution caused by different OCPs in soil samples of agri-
cultural areas (Velasco et al. 2014). In the same geographic region, Costilla-Salazar 
et al. (2011) evaluated the presence of PBDEs in soils of urban areas in the mining 
district of San Felipe Nuevo Mercurio in Mazapil, Zacatecas.

In the Western region, two studies looked at lake sediments of rural and urban 
areas of Jalisco and evaluated the presence of PBDEs and PCBs. Finally, just two 
studies were identified for both the Northeast and Southeast regions. Thus, in the 
city of Monterrey in the state of Nuevo León (Northeast region), the presence of 
DDT, PBDEs, and PCBs was evaluated in urban soil (Orta-García et  al. 2016). 
While in the state of Tabasco (Southeast region), the presence of PCBs in the sedi-
ments of the Mecoacán lake was detected (Armenta-Arteaga and Elizalde-González 
2003). For approximately 18  years, and according to the information shown in 
Table 16.2, several reports of the presence of POPs in agricultural and urban areas 
around Mexico have been published. Most of the studies have been carried out in 
soil and water bodies sediments near agricultural areas and urban zones. The pres-
ence of POPs evidences the negative impacts of human activities on the environ-
ment, especially those related to intensive agricultural and industrial activities. 
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Therefore, detecting and monitoring POPs studies are essential for establishing soil 
quality in urban and agricultural areas, highlighting the need for adequate manage-
ment of these chemicals, and the urgency of developing feasible alternatives for the 
remediation of these polluted areas.

16.6  �International and Mexican Regulation Related to POPs

At the international level different agreements have been signed related to chemical 
substances and hazardous waste, such as POPs. Among them is the Basel Convention, 
which covers hazardous waste and other wastes requiring special consideration, 
including medical waste, household waste, and electronic waste. Since January 1, 
2021, it includes additional provisions for curbing the proliferation of plastic waste 
(BRS Conventions 2021). Furthermore, the Rotterdam Convention provides a struc-
tured information exchange procedure based on prior informed consent to interna-
tional trade (the PIC Procedure), enabling parties to take informed decisions on 
future imports of hazardous pesticides and industrial chemicals, achieve good man-
agement, and lower the risk of harmful impacts on health and the environment. The 
Convention’s implementation contributes to better production, a better environ-
ment, better nutrition, and a better life (BRS Conventions 2021).

In addition, the Stockholm Convention covering the elimination and reduction of 
POPs, such as PCBs and DDT, was adopted 20 years ago. The Convention was 
agreed in Stockholm, Sweden, in May 2001, and the date of entry into force was 
May 17, 2004, with 152 signatories (Rottem 2017; Stockholm Convention 2021). 
The objective of the Stockholm Convention is to protect the environment and human 
health from compounds recognized as POPs (Alshemmari 2021). The Convention is 
regulated by the United Nations Environment Program (UNEP) (Fiedler et  al. 
2019). This international Convention requires governments to follow up on the 
agreements established as well as the active participation of the organizations that 
are part of the International Network for the Elimination of POPs. Currently, 184 
countries, including Mexico, have ratified the Convention (Sharkey et al. 2020).

The recently published third regional monitoring reports show that the concen-
trations of POPs in the environment and in human populations continue on a down-
ward trend. The presence of POPs is ubiquitous but if measures are implemented to 
reduce or eliminate both intentional and unintentional releases, the concentrations 
measured in humans and in the environment will continue to decrease. The knowl-
edge of the third regional monitoring reports also provides information on the moni-
toring of POPs and their relationship with changes in biodiversity and the climate 
change effects on the ecosystems function and structure (BRS Conventions 2021). 
Since 2005, Norway, Mexico, and the EU have assumed a leading role in nominat-
ing new substances for their inclusion in the Stockholm Convention (Rottem 2017). 
In 2005, five chemicals were proposed for their inclusion in the Convention, two by 
the EU, and three by Norway, Mexico, and Sweden, one by country. In 2006, five 
additional chemicals were proposed, three by the EU and two by Mexico. Finally, 
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in 2009, at the fourth meeting of the Conference of the Parties were included nine 
of these ten nominated chemicals: (1) α-hexachlorocyclohexane, (2) 
β-hexachlorocyclohexane, (3) chlordecone, (4) hexabromobiphenyl, (5) hexabro-
modiphenyl ether and heptabromodiphenyl ether, (6) lindane, (7) pentachloroben-
zene, (8) perfluorooctane sulfonate, and (9) tetrabromodiphenyl ether and 
pentabromodiphenyl ether (UNEP 2010a, 2010b; Selin 2010; Rottem 2017).

The three above-mentioned conventions constitute a coordinated life cycle 
approach to the environmentally good management of chemicals and waste across 
the world. The legally binding Basel, Rotterdam, and Stockholm (BRS) conventions 
share the common goal of protecting human health and the environment from the 
hazards of chemicals and waste, and have almost universal coverage with 188, 164, 
and 184 parties, respectively (BRS Conventions 2021). Mexico has made the deci-
sion to implement this international agreement through a National Implementation 
Plan (NIP), which was the product of a broad public consultation among authorities, 
industrial organizations, civil society organizations, and representatives of the pri-
vate and academic sectors. In compliance with the commitments assumed by 
Mexico in the Stockholm Convention, the Mexican government has updated its NIP, 
and presented for registration with the Secretariat of the Convention in its 2016 ver-
sion (INECC 2017; SEMARNAT 2017).

The legal framework for hazardous chemical substances and their waste provides 
many legal bases to regulate each step of their life cycle, from their manufacture or 
production to their final disposal as hazardous waste, which will greatly facilitate 
measuring the implementation of the Stockholm Convention. The Mexican 
Government has created numerous laws, regulations, and Official Mexican 
Standards (NOM) that together regulate every step of the life cycle of hazardous 
chemical substances and their waste, until their final disposal as hazardous waste 
(Romero et  al. 2009). The instruments that make up the legal and institutional 
framework of Mexico related to POPs are made up of 17 national laws and 28 
NOM, which fall under the responsibility of eight ministries of the 20 that make up 
the Federal Public Administration. However, the application of the legal provisions 
is complex due to the large number of legal systems that comprise it and the lack of 
coordination that has existed between the ministries for their creation, which has 
generated duplication of competences, regulatory gaps, and obsolescence of some 
of their instruments (Romero et al. 2009).

16.7  �Management Alternatives of POPs in Mexico

In 2003, the General Law for the Prevention and Integral Waste Management 
(LGPGIR, acronym in Spanish) was issued as part of the Federal Constitution of 
Mexico to promote sustainable development, by preventing the generation, and pro-
moting the recovery and integral management of waste, as well as preventing soil 
contamination (DOF 2003; Hernández-Padilla and Angles 2021).
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This Law classifies waste as follows (DOF 2003):

	(a)	 Solid urban waste. Those generated in homes, which result from the elimina-
tion of the materials used in domestic activities; the waste that comes from any 
other activity within establishments or on public roads that generates waste 
with domiciliary characteristics, and those resulting from the cleaning of public 
roads and places.

	(b)	 Special handling of waste: These are generated during production processes, 
with characteristics not considered hazardous or solid urban waste. In addition, 
those are produced by large urban solid waste generators.

	(c)	 Hazardous waste: Those that have any of the characteristics of corrosivity, 
reactivity, explosivity, toxicity, flammability, or that contain infectious agents, 
as well as containers, packaging and soils that have been contaminated when 
transferred to another site.

The LGPGIR established the obligation to formulate and implement manage-
ment plans for hazardous waste, as well as, used, expired, withdrawn from trade or 
discarded products. Among them are persistent organic compounds such as PCBs, 
pesticides, and containers that still contain remnants thereof, which include those 
subjects to the Stockholm Convention. This law also establishes that hazardous 
waste generators must present Management Plans every year, which are environ-
mental policy instruments that contribute to the improvement of waste management 
in Mexico. POPs are considered hazardous waste, so their management is estab-
lished in the above-mentioned law. In Mexico, most of the products with POPs have 
been banned since 1994, especially pesticides. For this reason, to comply with the 
Stockholm Convention, attention is mainly focused on the substitution and elimina-
tion of the PCBs contained in electrical transformers and capacitors, as well as on 
the reduction or elimination of the release of dioxins, furans, and hexachloroben-
zene in fixed and diffuse sources. Mexico, with the support of the North American 
Commission for Environmental Cooperation, and within the framework of the for-
mulation of the National Action Plan, prepared a preliminary diagnosis of POPs. 
This diagnosis was made to establish the action plan for three groups of POPs: 
pesticides, industrial POPs, and unintentional POPs.

In the case of PCBs, it is estimated that Mexico imported between 6000 and 
20,000 tons in total, which were mainly used in the electrical equipment of para-
statal companies (such as the Federal Electricity Commission). For this, the Official 
Mexican Standard (NOM-133-SEMARNAT-2015, Environmental Protection-
Polychlorinated Biphenyls (PCBs) -Management Specifications), was created. 
“This Official Mexican Standard establishes the specifications for the environmen-
tally adequate handling and disposal of hazardous waste that contains or is con-
taminated with PCBs when they are discharged, as well as for the handling and 
treatment of PCBs equipment.” This Official Mexican Standard, it is established that 
the handling of PCBs equipment, PCBs hazardous waste and PCBs liquid derived 
from maintenance activities, or due to removal of the equipment, must be managed 
through the following stages:
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Table 16.4  POPs bioremediation studies in Mexico

POP Microorganism
Concentration 
(mg/L)

Result in 
percentage Reference

α-Endosulfan Bacillus subtilis 14 76 Casanova et al. 
(2021)Bacillus 

pseudomycoides
95

Peribacillus simplex 95
Enterobacter cloacae 95
Achromobacter 
spanius

95

Pseudomonas putida 95
β-Endosulfan Bacillus subtilis 6 86

Bacillus 
pseudomycoides

86

Peribacillus simplex 86
Enterobacter cloacae 95
Achromobacter 
spanius

95

Pseudomonas putida 95
Endosulfan lactone Soil microorganisms 

and Eisenia fetida
0.001–0.009 90.1 Vázquez-

Villegas et al. 
(2021)

DDT Lysinibacillus 
fusiformis

50 41–48 García-de la 
Parra et al. 
(2012), Garcia 
et al. (2021)

Bacillus mycoides

Bacillus pumilus

Bacillus cereus

Lysinibacillus 
fusiformis

200 26–31

Bacillus mycoides

Bacillus pumilus

Bacillus cereus

α-Endosulfan Paecilomyces variotii 17.5 26.4 Hernández-
Ramos et al. 
(2019)

Paecilomyces 
lilacinus

10.9

Sphingobacterium sp. 14.3
β-Endosulfan Paecilomyces variotii 7.5 31.4

Paecilomyces 
lilacinus

9.0

Sphingobacterium sp. 21.1
α-Endosulfan Enterobacter cloacae 

PMM16
1.7 71.3 Jimenez-Torres 

et al. (2016)β-Endosulfan 100
Pentachlorophenol Rhizopus oryzae 

CDBB-H-1877
0.5 78.6 León-

Santiesteban 
et al. (2016)

2 90.8

(continued)

M. L. Castrejón-Godínez et al.



441

Storage. Hazardous waste of PCBs must be conditioned before being sent to the 
temporary storage of hazardous waste, considering the prevention of leachate gen-
eration and its infiltration into the soils; the dragging by rainwater or by the wind; 
fires, explosions, and accumulation of toxic vapors, leaks, or spills.

Transport. The transport of PCBs waste can only be carried out by land or sea. 
The carrier must be trained and have the necessary equipment and materials to con-
tain spills that may occur during the transport of equipment and waste. Transport 
units that become contaminated by direct contact with PCBs liquids or PCBs haz-
ardous waste must be subjected to cleaning activities, and the generated liquids and 
solids must be managed as hazardous waste.

Treatment and disposal. This must be carried out, in accordance with the 
following.

	1.	 Washing of equipment with PCBs, and liquid–liquid extraction.
	2.	 The liquid PCBs that are extracted from the equipment will have to undergo a 

process of elimination, through incineration, gasification, plasma, pyrolysis, and 
catalytic chemical.

Table 16.4  (continued)

POP Microorganism
Concentration 
(mg/L)

Result in 
percentage Reference

Lindane Streptomyces sp. 
A5-M7

1.7 32.6 Fuentes et al. 
(2011)

Streptomyces sp. 
A2-A5-M7-A11

33.1

Streptomyces sp. 
A2-A5-A8

31.4

Pentachlorophenol Pseudomonas 
fluorescens

200 77.6 Torres et al. 
(2010)400 94.5

600 94.1
Aldrin Pseudomonas 

fluorescens
10 94.8 Bandala et al. 

(2006)Dieldrin 77.3
Heptachlor 96.9
DDT Pseudomonas 

fluorescens
50 96.8 Santacruz et al. 

(2005)100 87.9
150 99.9

Polychlorinated 
biphenyls (PCBs)

Trametes versicolor 600–3000 29–70 Ruiz-Aguilar 
et al. (2002)Phanerochaete 

chrysosporium
34–73

Lentinus edodes 0–33
Pentachlorophenol Rhizopus nigricans 12.5 100 Tomasini et al. 

(2001)
Pentachlorophenol Phanerochaete 

chrysosporium
100 86 Mendoza-

Cantú et al. 
(2000)

16  Soils Contaminated with Persistent Organic Pollutants (POPs): Current Situations…



442

	3.	 In the case of spills to the soils with liquids containing PCBs, it is necessary to 
carry out a remediation process, considering the maximum permissible limits of 
contamination after the remediation. These limits range from 0.5 to 25 mg/kg, 
considering a subsequent agricultural, residential, and industrial land use, 
respectively. According to the soil characteristics and the conditions of contami-
nation with PCBs, the biological, physical, or chemical treatments, or a combi-
nation of them, can be applied in this remediation process.

Also authorized is the installation of companies that provide transport, repackag-
ing, shipping abroad for treatment (mainly by incineration), equipment decontami-
nation, and chemical dechlorination of liquid waste. About the possibility of 
existence of generating sources of dioxins, furans, and hexachlorobenzene in 
Mexico, a diagnosis of the generation was carried out (2012). As a result, the total 
emission of dioxins and furans from the top ten sources were 9722 g TEQ/year, 
which include agricultural waste burning, cement kilns, forest fires, industrial waste 
incineration, medical/hospital waste incineration, metallurgical production, open 
dump fires, pulp, and paper mills, uncontrolled domestic waste burning, among oth-
ers (SEMARNAT 2017). For the estimation of dioxin and furan emissions in 
Mexico, the emission factors provided by the Standard Instrument for the 
Identification and Quantification of Dioxin and Furan Releases (2005), for waste 
incineration equipment (hazardous, medical, municipal, etc.), were used (Costner 
2005; UNEP 2005).

16.8  �Bioremediation Alternatives of POPs

Bioremediation is a process that lets the biological degradation of dangerous pollut-
ants to less toxic or nontoxic moieties, reducing their concentrations to undetectable 
levels, or eliminating organic pollutants using the physiological capabilities of liv-
ing organisms (Ramírez-García et al. 2019; Vishwakarma et al. 2020). These organ-
isms include bacteria, fungi, and plants, these the most reported microorganisms, 
both endogenous of the polluted sites to bioremediate or isolated from different 
environments and added to the site for the pollution treatment (Zouboulis et  al. 
2019). In addition, bioremediation has been proposed for the treatment of contami-
nation derived from the presence of different pollutants in water and soil (Bharagava 
et al. 2020; Singh et al. 2020), including hydrocarbons (Xu et al. 2018; Ławniczak 
et al. 2020), pesticides (Giri et al. 2021; Sarker et al. 2021), and different persistent 
organic pollutants (Boudh et al. 2019; Devi 2020; Akhtar et al. 2021). In bioreme-
diation, living organisms are the key factor involved in the biodegradation and elim-
ination of pollutants. Due to this, adequate conditions for their development at the 
polluted sites are required for successful bioremediation, including adequate mois-
ture, pH, temperature, oxygen, and the availability of nutrients. However, the pres-
ence of high-level salinity, metallic ions, and other toxic chemical compounds can 
reduce the effectiveness of the biological treatments (Khudhaier et al. 2020). These 
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parameters can be controlled through the application of an adequate bioremediation 
strategy.

The bioremediation strategies are divided into two categories, in situ and ex situ 
technologies. In the in situ technologies, the polluted material bioremediation pro-
cess is carried out at the contaminated site, while in the ex situ technologies, the 
biological treatment of the contaminated material is carried out in specific bioreme-
diation installations (Das and Dash 2014; Azubuike et al. 2016; Sharma 2020; Raffa 
and Chiampo 2021). Examples of different bioremediation strategies are shown in 
Table 16.3. Several of these bioremediation strategies have been proposed as effec-
tive treatments for soil contamination caused by POPs, in different scientific studies 
which have been highlighted the potential of plants for POPs phytoremediation (Liu 
et al. 2018; Misra and Misra 2019; Futughe et al. 2020; Tripathi et al. 2020), as well 
as different microorganisms (bacteria, fungi, algae), exogenous or isolated from 
diverse polluted environments, capable of biodegrading POPs (Gaur et  al. 2018; 
Boudh et al. 2019; Zacharia 2019; Mbachu et al. 2020; Sonune 2021).

In Mexico, different studies on POPs bioremediation have been reported in the 
last 20 years. In these studies, the potential of several microorganisms for applica-
tion biodegradation and removal of different POPs have been highlighted. Table 16.4 
shows 13 studies carried out in Mexico (2000–2021). These reports aimed to evalu-
ate the biodegradation and removal of different POPs employing mainly bacterial 
and fungi strains. The research in the field of POPs bioremediation in Mexico has 
focused on the biodegradation of OCPs such as aldrin, DDT, dieldrin, endosulfan, 
heptachlor, lindane, and pentachlorophenol, with endosulfan being the most evalu-
ated POP. In Table 16.4, just one study evaluates the fungal biodegradation of PCBs. 
All studies showed in Table 16.4 were carried out at laboratory scale, employing 
different in vitro approaches. Due to this it is important to evaluate these microor-
ganisms in field studies on sites polluted by POPs. The main bacterial genus reported 
in the studies were Bacillus, Pseudomonas, and Streptomyces. With respect to the 
studies employing fungal strains the genus reported include Lentinus, Phanerochaete, 
Trametes, and Rhizopus. In Mexico, significant research efforts have been made to 
identify microorganisms, fungi, and bacteria, with great potential for applications in 
bioremediation strategies to eliminate POPs from contaminated sites. However, it is 
essential to carry out studies that include the evaluation of the biodegradation of 
other types of POPs, other than OCPs.

16.9  �Conclusions and Future Perspectives

The semi-volatile, lipophilic, and high persistence characteristics of POPs were 
highlighted. These compounds have been detected in different world regions, even 
in places where they have never been used. Their impacts on the environment and 
health, on individuals, populations, and communities, have also been discussed, 
highlighting their toxicity and dangerousness when remaining in the environment. 
POPs waste can reach the soil, water, and air and remain for long periods. Studies 
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to detect the presence of POPs have been carried out in soils from different regions 
of Mexico. Knowledge of polluted soils can help plan the restoration of these soils, 
make clear the need for adequate management, and the urgency of developing fea-
sible alternatives for the remediation of these polluted areas. It has also been stated 
that Mexico has signed the Stockholm Convention, and to comply with that com-
mitment it has developed internal legislation such as the LGPGIR (DOF 2003), 
NOM-133-SEMARNAT-2015 (DOF 2016), as well as the development of other 
instruments such as the Stockholm Convention Implementation, among others. In 
the LGPGIR, POPs waste is classified as hazardous, so there are standards that must 
be applied to POPs. For example, domestic legislation establishes how PCBs should 
be handled, which is why it is an activity monitored by the federal government.

In addition, bioremediation is an environmental-friendly and feasible method for 
eliminating and detoxifying pollutants, included POPs. Through bioremediation 
techniques such as phytoremediation and microbial-mediated pollutant degrada-
tion, the levels of POPs caused contamination can be reduced. Therefore, these 
bioremediation processes must be improved to offer a viable alternative for the deg-
radation of POPs or the remediation of soils contaminated with the same com-
pounds. It should be noted that Mexico is a country that has assumed the commitment 
to address the problem related to POPs, since it has established normative instru-
ments for their management and treatment. In addition, economic resources have 
been allocated for the diagnosis of POPs in Mexico, for the analysis of soils, water, 
and air contaminated with POPs, as well as for the remediation of contaminated 
sites. However, much remains to be done. Greater investment is necessary for the 
development of technologies for its effective treatment, and for remediating sites 
contaminated with POPs. In this way, Mexico could have the necessary capacity to 
positively impact on the elimination of POPs.

References

Abou-Elwafa AM (2015) Persistent Organic Pollutants. In: Still Only One Earth: Progress in the 40 
years since the first UN conference on the environment. Hester, R. E., & Harrison, R. M. (eds). 
Royal Society of Chemistry, p 150-183.

Akhtar ABT, Naseem S, Yasar A, Naseem Z (2021) Persistent Organic Pollutants (POPs): Sources, 
Types, Impacts, and Their Remediation. In: Prasad R. (ed). Environmental pollution and reme-
diation. environmental and microbial biotechnology. Springer, Singapore, p 213-246. https://
doi.org/10.1007/978-981-15-5499-5_8

Alharbi OM, Khattab RA, Ali I (2018) Health and environmental effects of persistent organic pol-
lutants. J Mol Liq 263:442-453. https://doi.org/10.1016/j.molliq.2018.05.029

Alshemmari H (2021) Inventories and assessment of POPs in the State of Kuwait as a basis for 
Stockholm Convention implementation. Emerg Contam 7:88-98. https://doi.org/10.1016/j.
emcon.2021.02.003

Arkoosh MR, Casillas E, Clemons E et al (1998) Effect of pollution on fish diseases: potential 
impacts on salmonid populations. J Aquat Anim Health 10:182–190, https://doi.org/10.157
7/1548-8667(1998)010%3C0182:EOPOFD%3E2.0.CO;2

M. L. Castrejón-Godínez et al.

https://doi.org/10.1007/978-981-15-5499-5_8
https://doi.org/10.1007/978-981-15-5499-5_8
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.molliq.2018.05.029
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.emcon.2021.02.003
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.emcon.2021.02.003
https://doi.org/10.1577/1548-8667(1998)010<0182:EOPOFD>2.0.CO;2
https://doi.org/10.1577/1548-8667(1998)010<0182:EOPOFD>2.0.CO;2


445

Armenta-Arteaga G, Elizalde-González MP (2003) Contamination by PAHs, PCBs, PCPs and 
heavy metals in the mecoácfin lake estuarine water and sediments after oil spilling. J Soils 
Sediments 3(1):35-40.

Azubuike CC, Chikere CB, Okpokwasili GC (2016) Bioremediation techniques–classifica-
tion based on site of application: principles, advantages, limitations and prospects. World J 
Microbiol Biotechnol 32(11):1-18. https://doi.org/10.1007/s11274-016-2137-x

Bandala ER, Andres-Octaviano J, Pastrana P et al (2006) Removal of aldrin, dieldrin, heptachlor, 
and heptachlor epoxide using activated carbon and/or Pseudomonas fluorescens free cell cul-
tures. J Environ Sci Health Part B 41(5):553-569.

Bharagava RN, Saxena G, Mulla SI (2020) Introduction to industrial wastes containing organic 
and inorganic pollutants and bioremediation approaches for environmental management. In 
Saxena G and Bharagava RN (eds). Bioremediation of industrial waste for environmental 
safety. Springer, Singapore, p 1-18. https://doi.org/10.1007/978-981-13-1891-7_1

Boudh S, Singh JS, Chaturvedi P (2019) Microbial resources mediated bioremediation of per-
sistent organic pollutants. In: Singh JS (ed). New and Future Developments in Microbial 
Biotechnology and Bioengineering. Elsevier. Amsterdam, p 283-294. https://doi.org/10.1016/
B978-0-12-818258-1.00019-4

BRS Conventions (2021) BRS Conventions. Implementation. Media Resources. Press Releases. 
2021 Triple COPs convened online. http://www.brsmeas.org/Implementation/MediaResources/
PressReleases/2021TripleCOPsconvenedonline/tabid/8915/language/en-US/Default.aspx

Bryan GW, Gibbs PE, Hummerstone LG, Burt GR (1986) The decline of the gastropod Nucella 
lapillus around South-West England: evidence for the effect of tributyltin from antifouling 
paints. J Mar Biol Assoc UK 66:611–640, https://doi.org/10.1017/S0025315400042247

Cantú-Soto EU, Meza-Montenegro MM, Valenzuela-Quintanar AI et  al (2011) Residues of 
organochlorine pesticides in soils from the southern Sonora, Mexico, Bull Environ Contam 
Toxicol 87(5):556-560. https://doi.org/10.1007/s00128-011-0353-5

Casanova A, Cabrera S, Díaz-Ruiz G, et al (2021) Evaluation of endosulfan degradation capacity by 
six pure strains isolated from a horticulture soil. Folia Microbiol 1-9. https://doi.org/10.1007/
s12223-021-00899-5

Clements WH, Rohr JR (2009) Community responses to contaminants: using basic ecological 
principles to predict ecotoxicological effects. Environ Toxicol Chem 28:1789–1800. https://
doi.org/10.1897/09-140.1

Costilla-Salazar R, Trejo-Acevedo A, Rocha-Amador D et al (2011) Assessment of polychlori-
nated biphenyls and mercury levels in soil and biological samples from San Felipe, Nuevo 
Mercurio, Zacatecas, Mexico. Bull Environ Contam Toxicol 86:212–216. https://doi.
org/10.1007/s00128-010-0165-z

Costner P (2005) Estimating releases and prioritizing sources in the context of the Stockholm 
Convention dioxin emission factors for forest fires, grassland and moor fires, open burning of 
agricultural residues, open burning of domestic waste, landfill and dump fires. The interna-
tional pops elimination project. united nations industrial development organization (unido) and 
the United Nations environment program (UNEP). México.

Das S, Dash HR (2014) Microbial bioremediation: A potential tool for restoration of contami-
nated areas. In: Das S (ed) Microbial biodegradation and bioremediation Elsevier. Amsterdam, 
p 1-21. https://doi.org/10.1007/978-981-16-0602-1_17

Dave PN, Chaturvedi S, Sahu LK (2021) Impact of polychlorinated biphenyls on environment 
and public health. In Handbook of Advanced Approaches Towards Pollution Prevention and 
Control. Elsevier, p 261-280.

De Swart RL, Ross PS, Vedder LJ et al (1994) Impairment of immune function in harbor seals 
feeding on fish from polluted water. Ambio 23:155–159, http://hdl.handle.net/1765/39869

Devi NL (2020) Persistent organic pollutants (POPs): environmental risks, toxicological effects, 
and bioremediation for environmental safety and challenges for future research. In: Saxena G 
and Bharagava RN (eds) Bioremediation of industrial waste for environmental safety. Springer, 
Singapore, p 53-76. https://doi.org/10.1007/978-981-13-1891-7_4

16  Soils Contaminated with Persistent Organic Pollutants (POPs): Current Situations…

https://doi.org/10.1007/s11274-016-2137-x
https://doi.org/10.1007/978-981-13-1891-7_1
https://doi.org/10.1016/B978-0-12-818258-1.00019-4
https://doi.org/10.1016/B978-0-12-818258-1.00019-4
http://www.brsmeas.org/Implementation/MediaResources/PressReleases/2021TripleCOPsconvenedonline/tabid/8915/language/en-US/Default.aspx
http://www.brsmeas.org/Implementation/MediaResources/PressReleases/2021TripleCOPsconvenedonline/tabid/8915/language/en-US/Default.aspx
https://doi.org/10.1017/S0025315400042247
https://doi.org/10.1007/s00128-011-0353-5
https://doi.org/10.1007/s12223-021-00899-5
https://doi.org/10.1007/s12223-021-00899-5
https://doi.org/10.1897/09-140.1
https://doi.org/10.1897/09-140.1
https://doi.org/10.1007/s00128-010-0165-z
https://doi.org/10.1007/s00128-010-0165-z
https://doi.org/10.1007/978-981-16-0602-1_17
http://hdl.handle.net/1765/39869
https://doi.org/10.1007/978-981-13-1891-7_4


446

Djangalina E, Altynova N, Bakhtiyarova S et al (2020) Comprehensive assessment of unutilized 
and obsolete pesticides impact on genetic status and health of population of Almaty region. 
Ecotoxicol Environ Saf 202:1-16. https://doi.org/10.1016/j.ecoenv.2020.110905

DOF (2003) General law for the prevention and integral management of waste (LGPGIR, 
acronym in Spanish). Available via DIALOG: http://www.diputados.gob.mx/LeyesBiblio/
pdf/263_180121.pdf. Accessed 10 Sep 2021.

DOF (2016) Norma Oficial Mexicana NOM-133-SEMARNAT-2015, Protección ambiental-
Bifenilos Policlorados (BPCs)-Especificaciones de manejo. Available via DIALOG https://
www.dof.gob.mx/nota_detalle.php?codigo=5426547&fecha=23/02/2016. Accessed 10 
Sep 2021

Fernández P, Grimalt JO (2003) On the global distribution of persistent organic pollutants. 
CHIMIA Int J Chem 57(9):514-521. https://doi.org/10.2533/000942903777679000

Fiedler H, Abad E, Van Bavel B et al (2013) The need for capacity building and first results for the 
Stockholm Convention Global Monitoring Plan. TrAC Trends Analyt Chem 46:72-84. https://
doi.org/10.1016/j.trac.2013.01.010

Fiedler H, Kallenborn R, De Boer J et al (2019). The Stockholm Convention: A tool for the global 
regulation of persistent organic pollutants. Chem Int 41(2):4-11.

Fu J, Mai B, Sheng G et  al (2003) Persistent organic pollutants in environment of the Pearl 
River Delta, China: an overview. Chemosphere 52(9):1411-1422. https://doi.org/10.1016/
S0045-6535(03)00477-6

Fuentes MS, Sáez JM, Benimeli CS, Amoroso MJ (2011) Lindane biodegradation by defined con-
sortia of indigenous Streptomyces strains. Water Air Soil Pollut 222(1):217-231.

Futughe AE, Purchase D, Jones H (2020) Phytoremediation using native plants. In: Shmaefsky BR 
(ed) Phytoremediation. Springer, Cham 285-327. https://doi.org/10.1007/978-3-030-00099-8_9

Galloway T, Depledge M (2001) Immunotoxicity in invertebrates: measurement and ecotoxico-
logical relevance. Ecotoxicology 10:5-23. https://doi.org/10.1023/A:1008939520263

García CA, Rosado PD, Salas LMJ (2012) Panorama actual de los contaminantes orgánicos per-
sistentes. Biociencias 7(1):81-88.

Garcia LB, Wrobel K, Corrales EAR et al (2021) Mass spectrometry-based identification of bacte-
ria isolated from industrially contaminated site in Salamanca (Mexico) and evaluation of their 
potential for DDT degradation. Folia Microbiologica 66(3):355-369. https://doi.org/10.1007/
s12223-020-00848-8

García-de la Parra LM, Cervantes-Mojica LJ, González-Valdivia C et al (2012) Distribution of pes-
ticides and PCBs in sediments of agricultural drains in the Culiacan Valley, Sinaloa, Mexico, 
Arch Environ Contam Toxicol 63(3):323-336. https://doi.org/10.1007/s00244-012-9780-5

García-Hernández J, Leyva-Morales JB, Bastidas-Bastidas PDJ et al (2021) A comparison of pes-
ticide residues in soils from two highly technified agricultural valleys in northwestern Mexico. 
J Environ Sci Health Part B 56:548-565. https://doi.org/10.1080/03601234.2021.1918977

García-Nieto E, Juárez-Santacruz L, Ortiz-Ortiz E, et al (2019) Ecotoxicological assessment of 
sediment from Texcalac River and agricultural soil of riverside area, in Tlaxcala, Mexico. 
Chem Ecol 35(4):300-318. https://doi.org/10.1080/02757540.2018.1546297

Gaur N, Narasimhulu K, PydiSetty Y (2018) Recent advances in the bio-remediation of persis-
tent organic pollutants and its effect on environment. J Clean Prod 198:1602-1631. https://doi.
org/10.1016/j.jclepro.2018.07.076

Gibbs PE, Bryan GW (1986) Reproductive failure in populations of the dog-whelk, Nucella lapil-
lus, caused by imposex induced by tributyltin from antifouling paints. J Mar Biol Assoc UK 
66:767–777. https://doi.org/10.1017/S0025315400048414

Giri BS, Geed S, Vikrant K et al (2021) Progress in bioremediation of pesticide residues in the 
environment. Environ Eng Res 26(6):77-100. https://doi.org/10.4491/eer.2020.446

González-Mille DJ, Ilizaliturri-Hernández CA, Espinosa-Reyes G et al (2019) DNA damage in 
different wildlife species exposed to persistent organic pollutants (POPs) from the delta of the 
Coatzacoalcos river, Mexico. Ecotoxicol Environ Saf 180:403-411. https://doi.org/10.1016/j.
ecoenv.2019.05.030

M. L. Castrejón-Godínez et al.

https://doi.org/10.1016/j.ecoenv.2020.110905
http://www.diputados.gob.mx/LeyesBiblio/pdf/263_180121.pdf
http://www.diputados.gob.mx/LeyesBiblio/pdf/263_180121.pdf
https://www.dof.gob.mx/nota_detalle.php?codigo=5426547&fecha=23/02/2016
https://www.dof.gob.mx/nota_detalle.php?codigo=5426547&fecha=23/02/2016
https://doi.org/10.2533/000942903777679000
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.trac.2013.01.010
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.trac.2013.01.010
https://doi.org/10.1016/S0045-6535(03)00477-6
https://doi.org/10.1016/S0045-6535(03)00477-6
https://doi.org/10.1007/978-3-030-00099-8_9
https://doi.org/10.1023/A:1008939520263
https://doi.org/10.1007/s12223-020-00848-8
https://doi.org/10.1007/s12223-020-00848-8
https://doi.org/10.1007/s00244-012-9780-5
https://doi.org/10.1080/03601234.2021.1918977
https://doi.org/10.1080/02757540.2018.1546297
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.jclepro.2018.07.076
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.jclepro.2018.07.076
https://doi.org/10.1017/S0025315400048414
https://doi.org/10.4491/eer.2020.446
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.ecoenv.2019.05.030
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.ecoenv.2019.05.030


447

Guo Y, Kannan K (2015) Analytical methods for the measurement of legacy and emerging persis-
tent organic pollutants in complex sample matrices. In: Persistent organic pollutants (POPs): 
Analytical Techniques, Environmental Fate and Biological Effects. Zeng, E. Y. (ed). Elsevier. 
67:1-56. https://doi.org/10.1016/B978-0-444-63299-9.00001-6

Haug, A, Melsom S, Omang S (1974) Estimation of heavy metal pollution in two Norwegian fjord 
areas by analysis of the brown alga Ascophyllum nodosum. Environ Pollut 7:179-192. https://
doi.org/10.1016/0013-9327(74)90065-2

Hernández-Padilla F, Angles M (2021) Earthquake Waste Management, Is It Possible in Developing 
Countries? Case Study: 2017 Mexico City Seism. Sustainability 13(5):2431. https://doi.
org/10.3390/su13052431

Hernández-Ramos AC, Hernández S, Ortíz I (2019) Study on endosulfan-degrading capability 
of Paecilomyces variotii, Paecilomyces lilacinus and Sphingobacterium sp. in liquid cultures. 
Bioremediat J 23(4):251-258. https://doi.org/10.1080/10889868.2019.1671794

Hickey JJ, Anderson DW (1968) Chlorinated hydrocarbons and eggshell changes in raptorial and 
fish-eating birds. Science 162:271-273. https://doi.org/10.1126/science.162.3850.271

Hunt EG, Bischoff AI (1960) Inimical effects on wildlife of periodic DDD applications to Clear 
Lake. Calif. Fish Game 46:91-106.

INECC (2017) Actualización de los documentos de orientación necesarios para la elaboración, 
revisión, y actualización de planes nacionales de aplicación del convenio de Estocolmo sobre 
contaminantes orgánicos persistentes. Instituto Nacional de Ecología y Cambio Climático, 
México D. F.

Islas-García A, Vega-Loyo L, Aguilar-López R et  al (2015) Evaluation of hydrocarbons and 
organochlorine pesticides and their tolerant microorganisms from an agricultural soil to define 
its bioremediation feasibility. J Environ Sci Health Part B 50(2):99-108. https://doi.org/10.108
0/03601234.2015.975605

Jacob J, Cherian J (2013) Review of environmental and human exposure to persistent organic pol-
lutants. 9:1-14. https://doi.org/10.5539/ass.v9n11p107

Jennings AA, Li Z (2015) Residential surface soil guidance applied worldwide to the pesticides 
added to the Stockholm Convention in 2009 and 2011. J Environ Manage 160:226-240. https://
doi.org/10.1016/j.jenvman.2015.06.020

Jia Z, Misra HP (2007) Developmental exposure to pesticides zineb and/or endosulfan renders the 
nigrostriatal dopamine system more susceptible to these environmental chemicals later in life. 
Neurotoxicology 28(4):727-735. https://doi.org/10.1016/j.neuro.2007.04.003

Jimenez-Torres C, Ortiz I, San-Martin P et  al (2016) Biodegradation of malathion, α-and 
β-endosulfan by bacterial strains isolated from agricultural soil in Veracruz, Mexico. J Environ 
Sci Health Part B 51(12):853-859. https://doi.org/10.1080/03601234.2016.1211906

Johnston EL, Roberts DA (2009) Contaminants reduce the richness and evenness of marine com-
munities: a review and meta-analysis. Environ Pollut 157:1745-1752. https://doi.org/10.1016/j.
envpol.2009.02.017

Jones KC (2021) Persistent organic pollutants (POPs) and related chemicals in the global environ-
ment: some personal reflections. Environ Sci Technol 55:9400-9412. https://doi.org/10.1021/
acs.est.0c08093

Jones KC, de Voogt P (1999) Persistent organic pollutants (POPs): State of the science. Environ. 
Pollut 100:209–221. https://doi.org/10.1016/S0269-7491(99)00098-6

Kallenborn R (2006) Persistent organic pollutants (POPs) as environmental risk factors in remote 
high-altitude ecosystems. Ecotoxicol Environ Saf 63:100–107. https://doi.org/10.1016/j.
ecoenv.2005.02.016

Khudhaier SR, Al-Lami, AMA, Abbas RF (2020) A review article-technology of bioremediation. 
Int J Res Appl Sci Biotechnol 7(5):349-353. https://doi.org/10.31033/ijrasb.7.5.46

Kim JT, Choi YJ, Barghi M et al (2020) Occurrence, distribution, and bioaccumulation of new 
and legacy persistent organic pollutants in an ecosystem on King George Island, maritime 
Antarctica. J Hazard Mater 1-13. doi: https://doi.org/10.1016/j.jhazmat.2020.12414

16  Soils Contaminated with Persistent Organic Pollutants (POPs): Current Situations…

https://doi.org/10.1016/B978-0-444-63299-9.00001-6
https://doi.org/10.1016/0013-9327(74)90065-2
https://doi.org/10.1016/0013-9327(74)90065-2
https://doi.org/10.3390/su13052431
https://doi.org/10.3390/su13052431
https://doi.org/10.1080/10889868.2019.1671794
https://doi.org/10.1126/science.162.3850.271
https://doi.org/10.1080/03601234.2015.975605
https://doi.org/10.1080/03601234.2015.975605
https://doi.org/10.5539/ass.v9n11p107
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.jenvman.2015.06.020
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.jenvman.2015.06.020
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.neuro.2007.04.003
https://doi.org/10.1080/03601234.2016.1211906
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.envpol.2009.02.017
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.envpol.2009.02.017
https://doi.org/10.1021/acs.est.0c08093
https://doi.org/10.1021/acs.est.0c08093
https://doi.org/10.1016/S0269-7491(99)00098-6
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.ecoenv.2005.02.016
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.ecoenv.2005.02.016
https://doi.org/10.31033/ijrasb.7.5.46
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.jhazmat.2020.12414


448

Klánová J, Cupr P, Holoubek I et al (2009) Towards the global monitoring of POPs. Contribution 
of the MONET Networks. Masaryk University. https://www.genasis.cz/res/file/publications/
reports/towards-the-global-monitoring-of-pops.pdf

Ławniczak Ł, Woźniak-Karczewska M, Loibner AP, et al (2020) Microbial degradation of hydro-
carbons—basic principles for bioremediation: a review. Molecules 25(4):856. https://doi.
org/10.3390/molecules25040856

Leal SSD, Valenzuela QAI, Gutiérrez CML et al (2014) Residuos de plaguicidas organoclorados 
en suelos agrícolas. Terra Latinoam 32(1):1-11.

León-Santiesteban HH, Wrobel K, Revah S et al (2016) Pentachlorophenol removal by Rhizopus 
oryzae CDBB-H-1877 using sorption and degradation mechanisms. J Chem Technol Biotechnol 
91(1):65-71. https://doi.org/10.1002/jctb.4566

LGPGIR (2021) Ley general para la prevención y gestión integral de los residuos. Diário Oficial 
de la Federación 18-01-2021. Available on line: http://www.diputados.gob.mx/LeyesBiblio/
pdf/263_180121.pdf

Liu J, Xin X, Zhou Q (2018) Phytoremediation of contaminated soils using ornamental plants. 
Environ Rev 26(1):43-54. https://doi.org/10.1139/er-2017-0022

Lorenzo M, Campo J, Picó Y (2018) Analytical challenges to determine emerging persistent 
organic pollutants in aquatic ecosystems. TrAC Trends Analyt Chem 103:137-155. https://doi.
org/10.1016/j.trac.2018.04.003

Luoma SN, Rainbow PS (2008) Metal contamination in aquatic environments: science and lat-
eral management. Cambridge University Press, New  York. https://doi.org/10.1897/1551- 
3793-5.3.492.

Mariussen E, Fonnum F (2006) Neurochemical targets and behavioral effects of organo-
halogen compounds: an update. Crit Rev Toxicol 36(3):253-289. https://doi.
org/10.1080/10408440500534164

Matthiessen P, Gibbs PE (1998) Critical appraisal of the evidence for tributyltin-mediated endo-
crine disruption in mollusks. Environ Toxicol Chem 17:37–43. https://doi.org/10.1002/
etc.5620170106

Mbachu AE, Chukwura EI, Mbachu NA (2020) Role of Microorganisms in the Degradation of 
Organic Pollutants: A Review. Energy Environ Eng 7(1):1-11. https://doi.org/10.13189/
eee.2020.070101

Mendoza-Cantú A, Albores A, Fernández-Linares L et  al (2000) Pentachlorophenol biodeg-
radation and detoxification by the white-rot fungus Phanerochaete chrysosporium. Environ 
Toxicol: Int J 15(2):107-113. https://doi.org/10.1002/(SICI)1522-7278(2000)15:2<107::
AID-TOX6>3.0.CO;2-K

Misra S, Misra KG (2019) Phytoremediation: an alternative tool towards clean and 
green environment. In: Shah S, Venkatramanan V, Prasad R (eds) Sustainable Green 
Technologies for Environmental Management. Springer, Singapore. 87-109. https://doi.
org/10.1007/978-981-13-2772-8_5

Mitra A, Chatterjee C, Mandal FB (2011) Synthetic chemical pesticides and their effects on birds. 
Res J Environ Toxicol 5(2):81-96. doi: https://doi.org/10.3923/rjet.2011.81.96

Montes AM, González-Farias FA, Botello AV (2012) Pollution by organochlorine pesticides in 
Navachiste-Macapule, Sinaloa, Mexico, Environ Monit Assess 184(3):1359-1369. https://doi.
org/10.1007/s10661-011-2046-2

Mussali-Galante P, Tovar-Sánchez E, Valverde M, Rojas E (2014) Genetic structure and diversity 
of animal populations exposed to metal pollution. Rev Environ Contam Toxicol 227:79-106. 
https://doi.org/10.1007/978-3-319-01327-5_3

Mussali-Galante P, Tovar-Sánchez E, Valverde M et al (2013) Biomarkers of exposure for assess-
ing environmental metal pollution: from molecules to ecosystems. Rev Int Contam Ambient 
29(1):117-140.

Neamtu M, Ciumasu IM, Costica N et al (2009) Chemical, biological, and ecotoxicological assess-
ment of pesticides and persistent organic pollutants in the Bahlui River, Romania, Environ Sci 
Pollut 16(1):76-85. https://doi.org/10.1007/s11356-009-0101-0

M. L. Castrejón-Godínez et al.

https://www.genasis.cz/res/file/publications/reports/towards-the-global-monitoring-of-pops.pdf
https://www.genasis.cz/res/file/publications/reports/towards-the-global-monitoring-of-pops.pdf
https://doi.org/10.3390/molecules25040856
https://doi.org/10.3390/molecules25040856
https://doi.org/10.1002/jctb.4566
http://www.diputados.gob.mx/LeyesBiblio/pdf/263_180121.pdf
http://www.diputados.gob.mx/LeyesBiblio/pdf/263_180121.pdf
https://doi.org/10.1139/er-2017-0022
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.trac.2018.04.003
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.trac.2018.04.003
https://doi.org/10.1897/1551-3793-5.3.492
https://doi.org/10.1897/1551-3793-5.3.492
https://doi.org/10.1080/10408440500534164
https://doi.org/10.1080/10408440500534164
https://doi.org/10.1002/etc.5620170106
https://doi.org/10.1002/etc.5620170106
https://doi.org/10.13189/eee.2020.070101
https://doi.org/10.13189/eee.2020.070101
https://doi.org/10.1002/(SICI)1522-7278(2000)15:2<107::AID-TOX6>3.0.CO;2-K
https://doi.org/10.1002/(SICI)1522-7278(2000)15:2<107::AID-TOX6>3.0.CO;2-K
https://doi.org/10.1007/978-981-13-2772-8_5
https://doi.org/10.1007/978-981-13-2772-8_5
https://doi.org/10.3923/rjet.2011.81.96
https://doi.org/10.1007/s10661-011-2046-2
https://doi.org/10.1007/s10661-011-2046-2
https://doi.org/10.1007/978-3-319-01327-5_3
https://doi.org/10.1007/s11356-009-0101-0


449

Núñez-Gastélum JA, Hernández-Carreón S, Delgado-Ríos M et al (2019) Study of organochlo-
rine pesticides and heavy metals in soils of the Juarez valley: an important agricultural region 
between Mexico and the USA.  Environ Sci Pollut Res 26(36):36401-36409. https://doi.
org/10.1007/s11356-019-06724-4

Ontiveros-Cuadras JF, Ruiz-Fernández AC, Sanchez-Cabeza JA et al (2014) Trace element fluxes 
and natural potential risks from 210Pb-dated sediment cores in lacustrine environments 
at the Central Mexican Plateau. Sci Total Environ 468:677-687. https://doi.org/10.1016/j.
scitotenv.2013.08.071

Ontiveros-Cuadras JF, Ruiz-Fernández AC, Sanchez-Cabeza JA, et  al (2019) Recent history of 
persistent organic pollutants (PAHs, PCBs, PBDEs) in sediments from a large tropical lake. J 
Hazard Materials 368:264-273. https://doi.org/10.1016/j.jhazmat.2018.11.010

Orta-García S, Pérez-Vázquez F, González-Vega CI et  al (2014) Concentrations of persistent 
organic pollutants (POPs) in human blood samples from Mexico City, Mexico. Sci Total 
Environ 472:496–501. doi:https://doi.org/10.1016/j.scitotenv.2013.

Orta-García ST, Ochoa-Martinez AC, Carrizalez-Yáñez L et  al (2016) Persistent organic pol-
lutants and heavy metal concentrations in soil from the Metropolitan Area of Monterrey, 
Nuevo Leon, Mexico, Arch Environ Contam Toxicol 70(3):452-463. https://doi.org/10.1007/
s00244-015-0239-3

Patel DK, Kumar S, Gupta N (2021) Flame retardants. analytical aspect of brominated. in: Kumar, 
N. & Shukla, V. (eds). Persistent Organic Pollutants in the Environment: Origin and Role, CRC 
Press, Taylor & Francis Group, p 237-274.

Paul V, Balasubramaniam E, Kazi M (1994) The neurobehavioural toxicity of endosulfan in rats: 
a serotonergic involvement in learning impairment. Eur J Pharmac 270(1):1-7. https://doi.
org/10.1016/0926-6917(94)90074-4

Pearce PA, Brun GL, Witteman, J (1979) Off-target fallout of fenitrothion during 1978 forest 
spraying operations in New Brunswick. Bull Environ Contam Toxicol 23(1):503-508. https://
doi.org/10.1007/BF01769995

Perez-Maldonado IN, Salazar RC, Ilizaliturri-Hernandez CA et al (2014) Assessment of the poly-
chlorinated biphenyls (PCBs) levels in soil samples near an electric capacitor manufacturing 
industry in Morelos, Mexico. J Environ Sci Health Part B 49(11):1244-1250. https://doi.org/1
0.1080/10934529.2014.910037

Perez-Vazquez FJ, Flores-Ramirez R, Ochoa-Martinez AC et al (2015) Concentrations of persis-
tent organic pollutants (POPs) and heavy metals in soil from San Luis Potosí, Mexico, Environ 
Monit Assess 187(1):1-15. https://doi.org/10.1007/s10661-014-4119-5

Phillips DJH (1980) Quantitative aquatic biological indicators. Applied Science Publishers, London.
Phillips DJH, Rainbow PS (1994) Biomonitoring of trace aquatic contaminants. Springer, 

Dordrecht. https://doi.org/10.1007/978-94-011-2122-4
Piazza R, Ruiz-Fernández AC, Frignani M et al (2009) Historical PCB fluxes in the Mexico City 

Metropolitan Zone as evidenced by a sedimentary record from the Espejo de los Lirios lake. 
Chemosphere 75(9):1252-1258. https://doi.org/10.1016/j.chemosphere.2009.01.068

Piazza R, Ruiz-Fernández AC, Frignani M, Zangrando R et al (2008) PCBs and PAHs in surficial 
sediments from aquatic environments of Mexico City and the coastal states of Sonora, Sinaloa, 
Oaxaca and Veracruz (Mexico). Environ Geol 54(7):1537-1545. https://doi.org/10.1007/
s00254-007-0935-z

Raffa CM, Chiampo F (2021) Bioremediation of agricultural soils polluted with pesticides: A 
Review. Bioengineering 8(7):92. https://doi.org/10.1016/j.envres.2021.111757

Rainbow PS (1995) Biomonitoring of heavy metal availability in the marine environment. Mar 
Pollut Bull 31(4-12):183-192. https://doi.org/10.1016/0025-326X(95)00116-5

Ramírez-García R, Gohil N, Singh V (2019) Recent advances, challenges, and opportunities in 
bioremediation of hazardous materials. In Pandey VC and Bauddh K (ed). Phytomanagement 
of Polluted Sites. Elsevier. Amsterdam, p  517-568. https://doi.org/10.1016/B978-0-12-813 
912-7.00021-1

16  Soils Contaminated with Persistent Organic Pollutants (POPs): Current Situations…

https://doi.org/10.1007/s11356-019-06724-4
https://doi.org/10.1007/s11356-019-06724-4
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.scitotenv.2013.08.071
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.scitotenv.2013.08.071
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.jhazmat.2018.11.010
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.scitotenv.2013
https://doi.org/10.1007/s00244-015-0239-3
https://doi.org/10.1007/s00244-015-0239-3
https://doi.org/10.1016/0926-6917(94)90074-4
https://doi.org/10.1016/0926-6917(94)90074-4
https://doi.org/10.1007/BF01769995
https://doi.org/10.1007/BF01769995
https://doi.org/10.1080/10934529.2014.910037
https://doi.org/10.1080/10934529.2014.910037
https://doi.org/10.1007/s10661-014-4119-5
https://doi.org/10.1007/978-94-011-2122-4
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.chemosphere.2009.01.068
https://doi.org/10.1007/s00254-007-0935-z
https://doi.org/10.1007/s00254-007-0935-z
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.envres.2021.111757
https://doi.org/10.1016/0025-326X(95)00116-5
https://doi.org/10.1016/B978-0-12-813912-7.00021-1
https://doi.org/10.1016/B978-0-12-813912-7.00021-1


450

Ratcliffe DA (1967) Decrease in eggshell weight in certain birds of prey. Nature 215:208-210. 
https://doi.org/10.1038/215208a0

Ren X, Zeng G, Tang L et al (2018) Sorption, transport and biodegradation–an insight into bio-
availability of persistent organic pollutants in soil. Sci Total Environ 610:1154-1163. https://
doi.org/10.1016/j.scitotenv.2017.08.089

Robinet TT, Feunteun EE (2002) Sublethal effects of exposure to chemical compounds: a 
cause for the decline in Atlantic eels? Ecotoxicology 11:265–277. https://doi.org/10.102
3/A:1016352305382

Romero TT, Cortinas NC, Gutiérrez AVJ (2009) Diagnóstico nacional de los contaminantes orgáni-
cos persistentes en méxico. secretaría de medio ambiente y recursos naturales. México, D.F.

Ross PS, De Swart RL, Reijnders PJ, Van Loveren H, Vos JG, Osterhaus AD (1995) Contaminant-
related suppression of delayed-type hypersensitivity and antibody responses in harbor seals fed 
herring from the Baltic Sea. Environ Health Perspect 103(2):162-167. https://doi.org/10.1289/
ehp.95103162

Rottem SV (2017) The use of arctic science: pops, Norway, and the Stockholm Convention. Arctic 
Review, 8:246-269. https://doi.org/10.23865/arctic.v8.723

Ruiz-Aguilar GM, Fernández-Sánchez JM, Rodríguez-Vázquez R, Poggi-Varaldo H (2002) 
Degradation by white-rot fungi of high concentrations of PCB extracted from a contaminated 
soil. Adv Environ Res 6(4):559-568. https://doi.org/10.1016/S1093-0191(01)00102-2

Ruiz-Fernández AC, Sprovieri M, Piazza R (2012) 210Pb-derived history of PAH and PCB accu-
mulation in sediments of a tropical inner lagoon (Las Matas, Gulf of Mexico) near a major 
oil refinery. Geochim Cosmochim Acta 82:136-153. https://doi.org/10.1016/j.gca.2011.02.041

Safe SH (1994) Polychlorinated biphenyls (PCBs): environmental impact, biochemical and toxic 
responses, and implications for risk assessment. Crit Rev Toxicol 24(2):87-149. https://doi.
org/10.3109/10408449409049308

Sahoo A, Samanta L, Das A, Patra SK, Chainy GB (1999). Hexachlorocyclohexane-induced behav-
ioural and neurochemical changes in rat. J Appl Toxicol 19(1):13-18. https://doi.org/10.1002/
(SICI)1099-1263(199901/02)19:1%3C13::AID-JAT531%3E3.0.CO;2-E

Sánchez-Osorio JL, Macías-Zamora JV, Ramírez-Álvarez N, Bidleman TF (2017) Organochlorine 
pesticides in residential soils and sediments within two main agricultural areas of northwest 
Mexico: Concentrations, enantiomer compositions and potential sources. Chemosphere 
173:275-287. https://doi.org/10.1016/j.chemosphere.2017.01.010

Santacruz G, Bandala ER, Torres LG (2005) Chlorinated pesticides (2, 4-D and DDT) biodegrada-
tion at high concentrations using immobilized Pseudomonas fluorescens. J Environ Sci Health 
Part B 40(4):571-583. https://doi.org/10.1081/PFC-200061545

Sarker A, Nandi R, Kim JE, Islam T (2021) Remediation of chemical pesticides from contami-
nated sites through potential microorganisms and their functional enzymes: Prospects and chal-
lenges. Environ Techol Innov 23:1-19. https://doi.org/10.1016/j.eti.2021.101777

Schantz SL, Widholm JJ (2001) Cognitive effects of endocrine-disrupting chemicals in animals. 
Environ Health Perspect 109(12):1197-1206. https://doi.org/10.1289/ehp.011091197

Selin H (2010) Global Governance of Hazardous Chemicals. Challenges of Multilevel 
Management. MIT Press.

SEMARNAT (2017) Plan Nacional de Implementación del Convenio de Estocolmo sobre 
Contaminantes Orgánicos Persistentes en México. Secretaría de Medio Ambiente y Recursos 
Naturales. México. Available via DIALOG. http://cristinacortinas.org/sustentabilidad/down-
load/libros/PNI-DE-IMPLEMENTACION-PLAN-NACIONAL-DEL-CONVENIO-DE-
ESTOCOLMO.pdf. Accessed 10 Sep 2021.

SEMARNAT (2021) Secretaría de Medio Ambiente y Recursos Naturales. Base de Datos 
Estadísticos del Sistema Nacional de Información Ambiental y de Recursos Naturales 
(BADESNIARN), Consulta temática, Sitios contaminados. Available via DIALOG. http://dge-
iawf.semarnat.gob.mx:8080/approot/dgeia_mce/html/01_ambiental/sitiosContaminados.html. 
Accessed 10 Sep 2021.

M. L. Castrejón-Godínez et al.

https://doi.org/10.1038/215208a0
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.scitotenv.2017.08.089
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.scitotenv.2017.08.089
https://doi.org/10.1023/A:1016352305382
https://doi.org/10.1023/A:1016352305382
https://doi.org/10.1289/ehp.95103162
https://doi.org/10.1289/ehp.95103162
https://doi.org/10.23865/arctic.v8.723
https://doi.org/10.1016/S1093-0191(01)00102-2
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.gca.2011.02.041
https://doi.org/10.3109/10408449409049308
https://doi.org/10.3109/10408449409049308
https://doi.org/10.1002/(SICI)1099-1263(199901/02)19:1<13::AID-JAT531>3.0.CO;2-E
https://doi.org/10.1002/(SICI)1099-1263(199901/02)19:1<13::AID-JAT531>3.0.CO;2-E
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.chemosphere.2017.01.010
https://doi.org/10.1081/PFC-200061545
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.eti.2021.101777
https://doi.org/10.1289/ehp.011091197
http://cristinacortinas.org/sustentabilidad/download/libros/PNI-DE-IMPLEMENTACION-PLAN-NACIONAL-DEL-CONVENIO-DE-ESTOCOLMO.pdf
http://cristinacortinas.org/sustentabilidad/download/libros/PNI-DE-IMPLEMENTACION-PLAN-NACIONAL-DEL-CONVENIO-DE-ESTOCOLMO.pdf
http://cristinacortinas.org/sustentabilidad/download/libros/PNI-DE-IMPLEMENTACION-PLAN-NACIONAL-DEL-CONVENIO-DE-ESTOCOLMO.pdf
http://dgeiawf.semarnat.gob.mx:8080/approot/dgeia_mce/html/01_ambiental/sitiosContaminados.html
http://dgeiawf.semarnat.gob.mx:8080/approot/dgeia_mce/html/01_ambiental/sitiosContaminados.html


451

Sharkey M, Harrad S, Abdallah MAE et al (2020) Phasing-out of legacy brominated flame retar-
dants: The UNEP Stockholm Convention and other legislative action worldwide. Environ Int 
144:1-12. https://doi.org/10.1016/j.envint.2020.106041

Sharma I (2020) Bioremediation techniques for polluted environment: concept, advantages, limita-
tions, and prospects. In: Murillo-Tovar MA, Saldarriaga-Noreña H, Saeid S (eds) Trace Metals 
in the Environment-New Approaches and Recent Advances. IntechOpen 90453. https://doi.
org/10.5772/intechopen.90453

Sheriff I, Debela SA, Sesay MT et al (2021) Research status and regulatory challenges of per-
sistent organic pollutants in Sierra Leone. Sci Afr 13:1-16. doi: https://doi.org/10.1016/j.
sciaf.2021.e00905

Sibly RM, Newton I, Walker C (2000) Effects of dieldrin on population growth rates of UK spar-
rowhawks. J Appl Ecol 37:540–546. https://doi.org/10.1046/j.1365-2664.2000.00516.x

Singh P, Singh VK, Singh R et al (2020) Bioremediation: a sustainable approach for management 
of environmental contaminants. In: Singh P, Kumar A, Borthakur A (eds) Abatement of envi-
ronmental pollutants. Elsevier. Amsterdam, p  1-23. https://doi.org/10.1016/B978-0-12-818 
095-2.00001-1

Slotkin TA, Seidler FJ (2008) Developmental neurotoxicants target neurodifferentiation into 
the serotonin phenotype: chlorpyrifos, diazinon, dieldrin and divalent nickel. Toxicol Appl 
Pharmaco 233(2):211-219. https://doi.org/10.1016/j.taap.2008.08.020

Slotkin TA, Seidler FJ (2009) Oxidative and excitatory mechanisms of developmental neurotoxic-
ity: transcriptional profiles for chlorpyrifos, diazinon, dieldrin, and divalent nickel in PC12 
cells. Environ Health Perspect 117(4):587-596. https://doi.org/10.1289/ehp.0800251

Smith RM, Cunningham Jr WL, Van Gelder GA et  al (1976) Dieldrin toxicity and successive 
discrimination reversal in squirrel monkeys (Saimiri sciureus). J Toxicol Environ Health A 
1(5):737-747. https://doi.org/10.1080/15287397609529372

Sonune N (2021) Microbes: A Potential Tool for Bioremediation. In: Kumar V, Prasad R, Kumar 
M (eds) Rhizobiont in Bioremediation of Hazardous Waste. Springer, Singapore, p 391-407. 
https://doi.org/10.1007/978-981-16-0602-1_17

Stehr C, Myers M, Burrows DG, Krahn MM, Meador JP, McCAIN BB, Varanasi U (1997) 
Chemical contamination and associated liver diseases in two species of fish from San Francisco 
Bay and Bodega Bay. Ecotoxicology 6:35-65. https://doi.org/10.1023/A:1018654122479

Stockholm Convention (2021) Stockholm Convention - Countries - Status of Ratifications - Parties 
and Signatoires. http://chm.pops.int/Countries/StatusofRatifications/PartiesandSignatoires/
tabid/4500/Default.aspx

Sun RX, Sun Y, Xie XD et al (2020) Bioaccumulation and human health risk assessment of DDT 
and its metabolites (DDTs) in yellowfin tuna (Thunnus albacares) and their prey from the South 
China Sea. Mar Pollut Bull 158:1-9. doi: https://doi.org/10.1016/j.marpolbul.2020.111396.

Tam LM, Chiang W, Huynh KT (2021) Establishing global climate resilience to persistent organic 
pollutants through the private sector: a call to reform institutional standards of the International 
Finance Corporation. J Sci Policy Governance 18(2):1-7. https://doi.org/10.38126/JSPG180210

Tanabe S, Subramanian A (2003) Bioindicators suitable for monitoring POPs in developing coun-
tries. STAP Workshop on the use of bioindicators, biomarkers and analytical methods for the 
analysis of POPs in developing countries. 10-12 December 2003. Tsukuba, Japan.

Tandon S (2021) Microbial remediation of persistent organic pollutants. In: Kumar, N. & Shukla, 
V. (eds). Persistent Organic Pollutants in the Environment: Origin and Role, CRC Press, Taylor 
& Francis Group, p 275-288.

Thakur M, Pathania D (2020) Environmental fate of organic pollutants and effect on human health. 
In: Abatement of Environmental Pollutants Trends and Strategies. Elsevier, p 245-262. https://
doi.org/10.1016/B978-0-12-818095-2.00012-6

Tilson HA, Shaw S, McLamb RL (1987) The effects of lindane, DDT, and chlordecone on 
avoidance responding and seizure activity. Toxicol Appl Pharmacol 88(1):57-65. https://doi.
org/10.1016/0041-008X(87)90269-9

16  Soils Contaminated with Persistent Organic Pollutants (POPs): Current Situations…

https://doi.org/10.1016/j.envint.2020.106041
https://doi.org/10.5772/intechopen.90453
https://doi.org/10.5772/intechopen.90453
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.sciaf.2021.e00905
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.sciaf.2021.e00905
https://doi.org/10.1046/j.1365-2664.2000.00516.x
https://doi.org/10.1016/B978-0-12-818095-2.00001-1
https://doi.org/10.1016/B978-0-12-818095-2.00001-1
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.taap.2008.08.020
https://doi.org/10.1289/ehp.0800251
https://doi.org/10.1080/15287397609529372
https://doi.org/10.1007/978-981-16-0602-1_17
https://doi.org/10.1023/A:1018654122479
http://chm.pops.int/Countries/StatusofRatifications/PartiesandSignatoires/tabid/4500/Default.aspx
http://chm.pops.int/Countries/StatusofRatifications/PartiesandSignatoires/tabid/4500/Default.aspx
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.marpolbul.2020.111396
https://doi.org/10.38126/JSPG180210
https://doi.org/10.1016/B978-0-12-818095-2.00012-6
https://doi.org/10.1016/B978-0-12-818095-2.00012-6
https://doi.org/10.1016/0041-008X(87)90269-9
https://doi.org/10.1016/0041-008X(87)90269-9


452

Tomasini A, Flores V, Cortés D, Barrios-González J (2001) An isolate of Rhizopus nigricans 
capable of tolerating and removing pentachlorophenol. World J Microbiol Biotechnol 
17(2):201-205. https://doi.org/10.1023/A:1016694720608

Topinka MA, Eisenstein EM, Siegel D et al (1984) The effects of dieldrin and chlordimeform on 
learning and memory in the cockroach, Periplaneta americana: a study in behavioral toxicology. 
J Toxicol Environ Health A 13(4-6):705-719. https://doi.org/10.1080/15287398409530533

Torres LG, Hernández M, Pica Y, Albiter V, Bandala ER (2010) Degradation of di-, tri-, tetra-, and 
pentachlorophenol mixtures in an aerobic biofilter. Afr J Biotechnol 9(23):3396-3403.

Tripathi S, Singh VK, Srivastava P, Singh R, Devi RS, Kumar A, Bhadouria R (2020) 
Phytoremediation of organic pollutants: Current status and future directions. In: Singh P, 
Kumar, A, Borthakur A (eds) Abatement of environmental pollutants. Elsevier. Amsterdam, 
p 81-105. https://doi.org/10.1016/B978-0-12-818095-2.00004-7

UNEP (2005) Standardized toolkit for identification and quantification of dioxin and furan 
releases. United Nations Environment Programme. Geneva, Switzerland.

UNEP (2010a) Startup guidance for the 9 new POPs (general information, implications of listing, 
information sources and alternatives). Secretariat of the Stockholm Convention on Persistent 
Organic Pollutants.

UNEP (2010b) The 9 new POPs: risk management evaluations, 2005-2008 (POPRC1-POPRC4). 
Secretariat of the Stockholm Convention on Persistent Organic Pollutants.

UNEP (2011) Convenio de Estocolmo. Los principales logros de estos 10 años. Naciones Unidas 
and PNUMA.

UNEP (2017) The 16 New POPs. An introduction to the chemicals added to the Stockholm con-
vention as persistent organic pollutants by the conference of the parties.

UNEP (2021) Global Monitoring Plan for Persistent Organic Pollutants. Under the Stockholm 
Convention Article 16 on Effectiveness Evaluation. Third Regional Monitoring Report Latin 
America and the Caribbean. http://chm.pops.int/implementation/globalmonitoringplan/moni-
toringreports/tabid/525/default.aspx

Vale C, Fonfra E, Bujons J et al (2003) The organochlorine pesticides γ-hexachlorocyclohexane 
(lindane), α-endosulfan and dieldrin differentially interact with GABAA and glycine-gated 
chloride channels in primary cultures of cerebellar granule cells. Neuroscience 117(2):397-403. 
https://doi.org/10.1016/S0306-4522(02)00875-8

Vasseur P, Cossu-Leguille C (2006) Linking molecular interactions to consequent effects of persis-
tent organic pollutants (POPs) upon populations. Chemosphere 62(7):1033-1042. https://doi.
org/10.1016/j.chemosphere.2005.05.043

Vázquez-Villegas PT, Meza-Gordillo R, Cruz-Salomón A et al (2021) Vermicomposting process 
to endosulfan lactone removal in solid substrate using Eisenia fetida. Processes 9(2):396-412. 
https://doi.org/10.3390/pr9020396

Velasco A, Hernández S, Ramírez M, et al (2014) Detection of residual organochlorine and organo-
phosphorus pesticides in agricultural soil in Rio Verde region of San Luis Potosi, Mexico. J 
Environ Sci Health Part B 49(7):498-504. https://doi.org/10.1080/03601234.2014.896670

Velasco A, Rodríguez J, Castillo R, Ortíz I (2012) Residues of organochlorine and organo-
phosphorus pesticides in sugarcane crop soils and river water. J Environ Sci Health Part B 
47(9):833-841. https://doi.org/10.1080/03601234.2012.693864

Venegas ME, Naranjo AF (2010) Manual sobre el Manejo de Contaminantes Orgánicos 
Persistentes. CEGESTI, p 1-52.

Vishwakarma GS, Bhattacharjee G, Gohil N, Singh V (2020) Current status, challenges and future 
of bioremediation. In Pandey VC and Singh V (eds). Bioremediation of Pollutants. Elsevier. 
Amsterdam, p 403-415. https://doi.org/10.1016/B978-0-12-819025-8.00020-X

Vukasinovic M, Zdravkovic V, Lutovac M et al (2017) The effects of polychlorinated biphenyls on 
human health and the environment. Global J Pathol Microbiol 5:8-14.

Wahlang B (2018) Exposure to persistent organic pollutants: impact on women’s health. Environ 
Health Rev 33(4):331-348. https://doi.org/10.1515/reveh-2018-0018.

M. L. Castrejón-Godínez et al.

https://doi.org/10.1023/A:1016694720608
https://doi.org/10.1080/15287398409530533
https://doi.org/10.1016/B978-0-12-818095-2.00004-7
http://chm.pops.int/implementation/globalmonitoringplan/monitoringreports/tabid/525/default.aspx
http://chm.pops.int/implementation/globalmonitoringplan/monitoringreports/tabid/525/default.aspx
https://doi.org/10.1016/S0306-4522(02)00875-8
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.chemosphere.2005.05.043
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.chemosphere.2005.05.043
https://doi.org/10.3390/pr9020396
https://doi.org/10.1080/03601234.2014.896670
https://doi.org/10.1080/03601234.2012.693864
https://doi.org/10.1016/B978-0-12-819025-8.00020-X
https://doi.org/10.1515/reveh-2018-0018


453

Waliszewski SM, Carvajal O, Gómez-Arroyo S et al (2008) DDT and HCH isomer levels in soils, 
carrot root and carrot leaf samples. Bull Environ Contam Toxicol 81(4):343-347. https://doi.
org/10.1007/s00128-008-9484-8

Wang X, Wang C, Zhu T et  al (2019) Persistent organic pollutants in the polar regions and 
the Tibetan Plateau: A review of current knowledge and future prospects. Environ Pollut 
248:191-208. doi:https://doi.org/10.1016/j.envpol.2019.01.093

Weinberg J (2009) Guía para las ONG sobre los Contaminantes Orgánicos Persistentes. Marco 
para las medidas de protección de la salud humana y el Medio Ambiente de los Contaminantes 
Orgánicos Persistentes. SAICM Global Outreach Campaign, p 1-113

Xu X, Liu W, Tian S et al (2018) Petroleum hydrocarbon-degrading bacteria for the remediation of 
oil pollution under aerobic conditions: a perspective analysis. Front Microbiol 9:1-11. https://
doi.org/10.3389/fmicb.2018.02885

Yarto M, Gavilán A, Barrera J (2003) El Convenio de Estocolmo sobre contaminantes orgánicos 
persistentes y sus implicaciones para México. Gaceta Ecológica (69):7-28.

Zacharia JT (2019) Degradation pathways of persistent organic pollutants (POPs) in the environ-
ment. In Donyinah SK (ed). Persistent Organic Pollutants. Intech Open 7964:17-31. https://doi.
org/10.5772/intechopen.7964

Zapata-Perez O, Ceja-Moreno V, Roca MO et  al (2007) Ecotoxicological effects of POPs on 
ariidae Ariopsis felis (Linnaeus, 1766) from three coastal ecosystems in the Southern Gulf 
of Mexico and Yucatan Peninsula. J Enviro Sci Health Part A 42:1511–1518. https://doi.
org/10.1080/10934520701480961

Zhou Q, Zhang J, Fu J, Shi J, Jiang G (2008) Biomonitoring: an appealing tool for assessment of 
metal pollution in the aquatic ecosystem. Analytica Chimica Acta 606:135-150. https://doi.
org/10.1016/j.aca.2007.11.018

Zouboulis AI, Moussas PA, Psaltou SG (2019) Groundwater and soil pollution: bioremediation. In: 
Nriagu J (ed). Encyclopedia of Environmental Health, Second Edition. Elsevier. Amsterdam, 
p 369-381. https://doi.org/10.1016/B978-0-12-409548-9.11246-1

16  Soils Contaminated with Persistent Organic Pollutants (POPs): Current Situations…

https://doi.org/10.1007/s00128-008-9484-8
https://doi.org/10.1007/s00128-008-9484-8
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.envpol.2019.01.093
https://doi.org/10.3389/fmicb.2018.02885
https://doi.org/10.3389/fmicb.2018.02885
https://doi.org/10.5772/intechopen.7964
https://doi.org/10.5772/intechopen.7964
https://doi.org/10.1080/10934520701480961
https://doi.org/10.1080/10934520701480961
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.aca.2007.11.018
https://doi.org/10.1016/j.aca.2007.11.018
https://doi.org/10.1016/B978-0-12-409548-9.11246-1

	Chapter 16: Soils Contaminated with Persistent Organic Pollutants (POPs): Current Situations, Management, and Bioremediation Techniques: A Mexican Case Study
	16.1 Introduction
	16.2 Persistent Organic Pollutants (POPs)
	16.2.1 What Are POPs
	16.2.2 Sources, Pollution, and Other Environmental Impacts

	16.3 Human Health Threats
	16.4 POPs Environmental Biomonitoring and Ecotoxicology
	16.4.1 At the Individual Level
	16.4.2 At the Population Level
	16.4.3 At the Community Level

	16.5 Soils Polluted by POPs in Mexico
	16.6 International and Mexican Regulation Related to POPs
	16.7 Management Alternatives of POPs in Mexico
	16.8 Bioremediation Alternatives of POPs
	16.9 Conclusions and Future Perspectives
	References




