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1	 �History of the Term Quality 
of Life

The quality of life began to be studied in the 
early 1950s, but it was linked to the work dimen-
sion, initially recognized as Quality of Work 
Life (QWL). The studies began in England and 
were carried out by Eric Trist and his collabora-
tors at the Tavistock Institute, in which they 

intended to analyze the individual-work-organi-
zation relationship. During this research, a 
socio-technical approach to work organization 
was developed, based on the work satisfaction 
and concerning to it [1].

The term quality of life (QOL) was first men-
tioned in 1920 by Pigou in a book on economics 
and well-being, in which he linked the quality of 
life to government support offered to the under-
classes and assessed its impact on the people’s 
lives and finances [2].

Germano [3] emphasizes that until the 1970s, 
the interest in the theme “quality of life” was 
restricted to the human sciences, and it was stud-
ied by philosophers, social scientists, and politi-
cians. From the 1970s, in the context of the 
epidemiological transition and with the growing 
interest in giving “voice” to patients, the term 
“quality of life” is now used in health, usually 
associated with the absence of disease and physi-
cal well-being.

As time goes, quality of life has become the 
focus of study and reflection increasingly, and 
since the 1980s, it began to be viewed in a multi-
dimensional perspective, biological, psychologi-
cal, economic, and cultural, since QOL depends 
on these factors and it is subjective [3].

The growing concern with issues related to the 
quality of life comes from the movement within 
the human and biological sciences, in the sense 

E. A. R. Domingues (*) 
Campinas State University, Campinas, SP, Brazil 

University of Vale do Rio Verde,  
Três Corações, MG, Brazil
e-mail: elainerocha.contato@gmail.com

J. V. da Silva 
Wenceslau Braz School of Nursing, Itajubá, MG, 
Brazil 

University of Vale do Sapucaí,  
Pouso Alegre, MG, Brazil
e-mail: enfjvitorsilva@oi.com.br

M. R. F. de Carvalho 
University of Vale do Rio Verde,  
Três Corações, MG, Brazil 
e-mail: enf_maiume@yahoo.com.br

U. A. de Oliveira Kaizer
Campinas State University, Campinas, SP, Brazil
e-mail: uiara_oliveira@hotmail.com 

T. A. da Silva · T. M. Soares 
University of Vale do Sapucaí-UNIVAS,  
Pouso Alegre, MG, Brazil

http://crossmark.crossref.org/dialog/?doi=10.1007/15695_2017_87&domain=pdf
https://doi.org/10.1007/15695_2017_87
mailto:elainerocha.contato@gmail.com
mailto:enfjvitorsilva@oi.com.br
mailto:enf_maiume@yahoo.com.br
mailto:uiara_oliveira@hotmail.com


176

of valuing parameters broader than the control of 
symptoms, the reduction of mortality, or the 
increase of the life expectancy. Thus, quality of 
life is approached by many authors as a synonym 
of health and, by others, as a more comprehen-
sive concept, in which health conditions would 
be one of the aspects to be considered [4].

According to the WHOQOL, in 1994, the term 
quality of life has many definitions because of its 
subjective nature, and there is no consensus about 
its meaning. There are several currents of thought 
that deal with quality of life and additional issues. 
Due to this wide divergence, most authors adopt 
the World Health Organization, which states qual-
ity of life as “the individual’s perception of their 
position in life, according to the cultural context 
and value system and about its goals, expecta-
tions, standards and concerns” [5].

There is a lack of conceptual consensus on the 
quality of life among the authors, as they attribute 
the reason to the extreme complexity of the term 
and its use in several areas of study [2, 6]. The 
definition of quality of life in the specialized lit-
erature presents itself in different ways. Some 
define in a global way, emphasizing general satis-
faction with life, or divided into sets, generating 
an approximation to the general concept. The 
approaches and the use of the indicators are 
intrinsically linked to the scientific and political 
interests of each study and research area, as well 
as the possibilities of operationalization and eval-
uation [2, 6].

Pereira [7], when conducting a bibliographic 
review, reaches the consensus that, depending on 
the area of interest, the concept is often enforced 
as a synonym for health, happiness, and personal 
satisfaction, living conditions, and lifestyle, 
among others. It states that indicators range from 
income to satisfaction with certain aspects of life. 
In the face of so many complexities, it becomes 
difficult to understand the theme quality of life, 
restricting, then, the operationalization in scien-
tific analysis.

In 1994, the WHOQOL Group developed 
goals, expectations, standards, and concerns. 
Semantically, it compares to an ethical matter, 
from which we must analyze the individual per-
ception of each one.

Etymologically distinguishing the term, qual-
ity derives from “qualis” (Latin) whose meaning 
is the specific manner of something, either con-
sidering itself or relating to another group, being 
able to assume both positive and negative charac-
teristics. However, quality of life, most of the 
time, is characterized as something positive [8].

The quality of life is related to the subjective 
well-being, and it includes biological and psy-
chological components, such as emotional well-
being, abilities and disabilities awareness, 
adequate sleep and rest, vitality, and general sat-
isfaction about one’s life [9]. It is well known that 
there are countless definitions of the term quality 
of life, and there is still no definition that is 
widely accepted. It is very common to observe 
that most definitions are associated with several 
health factors, such as physical and mental well-
being, but new literature has shown that quality 
of life can also be connected to other important 
elements such as friends, job, family, and every-
day situations [9]. It is necessary to emphasize 
the relevance of some life aspects of people when 
it comes to an understanding the term quality of 
life. Kinds of literature emphasize that subjectivi-
ties should be considered, such as freedom, love, 
happiness, and satisfaction [9]. Nowadays, the 
most accepted concepts of quality of life try to 
handle with a multiplicity of dimensions dis-
cussed in the general or holistic approaches [7].

The main example that can be cited is the con-
cept advocated by the World Health Organization 
(WHO), in which quality of life reflects the indi-
viduals’ perception that their needs are being met 
or that opportunities to achieve happiness and 
self-fulfillment, regardless of their state of physi-
cal health or social and economic conditions, are 
being denied [10]. Although there is no consen-
sual definition of quality of life, there is consider-
able agreement among researchers about some 
characteristics of the construct. According to it, 
there are three main features of the construct. 
They are shared by diverse opinion among the 
most different authors: subjectivity, multidimen-
sionality, and bipolarity [10].

It is increasingly identified that the construct 
is subjective. It is not a matter of total subjectiv-
ity, since there are conditions called external to 
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the people who are present in the environment 
and in the working and living conditions that 
interfere with the analysis they make of their 
quality of life.

Concerning multidimensionality, it is a con-
sensus among all researchers that quality of life 
includes at least three dimensions: physical, psy-
chological, and social. When assessing the qual-
ity of life, other dimensions can be evidenced, for 
conceptual, pragmatic, and empirical reasons 
[11]. It can be deduced about bipolarity that the 
construct has positive and negative dimensions, 
which can be applied to several conditions such 
as the performance of social roles, mobility, 
autonomy, pain, fatigue, dependence, and others 
[11]. We can add two other features: complexity 
and mutability. The concept of quality of life 
(QOL) becomes complicated and challenging to 
evaluate because it is multidimensional, bipolar 
and subjective. On the other hand, the evaluation 
of this construct changes with time, person, place 
and cultural and social context. For the same per-
son, changes according to his mood and health. 
These characteristics also increase the difficulty 
of evaluation [11].

2	 �Health-Related Quality 
of Life (HRQOL)

The interest in the QOL concept in the health 
area, stems in part, from the new paradigms that 
have influenced the policies and practices of the 
sector in the past decades. The determinants of 
the health-disease process are multifactorial and 
complex in nature. Thus, health and disease con-
stitute processes understood as a continuum, 
related to economic, sociocultural aspects, to per-
sonal experience and lifestyles. According to this 
paradigm shift, QOL improvement has become 
one of the expected results of both healthcare 
practices and public policies for health promo-
tion and disease prevention [12].

Quality of life in the health area can be identi-
fied in two concepts. Quality of life refers to a 
more generic concept, that is, it has a broader 
conception and it does not make any reference, 
different from the HRQOL that makes references 

to aggravations and dysfunction [2]. The concept 
of quality of life is very broad because it is linked 
to several approaches and problems. In the field 
of technical production, three key areas for ana-
lyzing quality of life stood out [2].

The first scope refers to the difference between 
material and immaterial aspects of quality of life. 
Material issues are those about basic human 
needs (housing conditions, water supply, and the 
health system, that is, the infrastructure aspect). 
Immaterial issues refer to the environment, cul-
tural heritage, and well-being [2]. The second 
scope distinguishes individual and common 
aspects. Individual aspects are related to the eco-
nomic, personal, and family condition, and the 
common ones are linked with basic and health 
services [2]. The third scope brings the difference 
among real aspects of quality of life that are eas-
ily apprehended through the definition of indica-
tors of a quantitative nature and the subjective 
aspects that refer to subjective perception and the 
perception individuals have about quality of life 
[2].

It is possible to observe in the literature that, 
according to the authors mentioned above, the 
health approach is quite broad, and it is possible 
to find unique aspects in this approach that when 
interrelated gives meaning to the term quality of 
life in health. We can notice that there is a con-
sensus to having quality of life; it is necessary 
that some elements be present: physical, emo-
tional aspects, and relationships. All of them 
must be related to well-being.

To establish a more accurate analysis of these 
relationships, we used the World Health 
Organization (WHO) (2006) citation which 
defines that “Health is a large state of physical, 
mental and social well-being, not only lack of 
disease and infirmity.” Based on this definition, it 
is easy to understand that besides the preserva-
tion of physiological capacities, and the organ-
ism’s proper functioning, it is necessary that 
other factors are considered, such as the environ-
ment, social life, and relationships [12].

Several factors must be taken into account 
when relating quality of life and health; subjec-
tive and objective spheres need to be met, as well 
as the culture of the society. The subjective 
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spheres can be understood as personal actions, 
whereas the objective spheres can be understood 
as public programs linked to the population’s 
condition of life improvements [13].

The individual action in their group is intrinsi-
cally linked to their state of health because they 
can define the perception of a positive or negative 
well-being. Human health state can constantly 
vary since it is extremely influenced by several 
factors. We can observe that, when a man is not 
satisfied with the environment he is in, he starts 
feeling uncomfortable because of that situation. 
As a consequence, he gradually feels unwell and 
even unhappy because he is in a place that takes 
his well-being out, and thus that position puts 
him off, jeopardizing one of the first indications 
defined by the WHO, which is that of mental and 
social well-being. Then the interference of the 
environment in the individual’s life affects his 
state of health that, according to several studies, 
is related to the right quality [13].

Lifestyle can also significantly interfere with 
a person’s state of health because life, when not 
based on the consciousness of right and wrong, 
is at risk of compromising and acting unthink-
ably. It is possible to give an example when we 
think about a person who abuses alcohol, the 
lifestyle of alcoholic changes drastically when 
he loses the notion of his attitudes, and the 
dependence of alcohol compromises not only 
health but also relationships with the people who 
surround him [13].

Human biology and the healthcare system orga-
nization are capable of interfering with the indi-
vidual state of health and quality of life [13]. The 
relationship between health and quality of life 
needs to be followed by some elements. They can 
be divided in the following ways: functional 
domains, i.e., physical function, cognitive function, 
involvement in everyday life activities, and subjec-
tive health evaluation, and domains of well-being, 
i.e., body well-being, emotional well-being, self-
care, and global perception of well-being [13].

Almeida [13] explains that a person’s state of 
health can suffer changes due to the several char-
acteristics that are part of it, as observed above, 
and because of these variants, we cannot associ-
ate the state of health/illness of a person only to a 
feature. To understand the health/illness relation-

ship, it is necessary to consider both individual 
actions and public policies. Studies show that 
there is a close connection between quality of life 
and health and socioeconomic aspects. Some 
authors point that this relationship is focused on 
the access possibilities that the population has to 
receive healthcare and that the presence or lack of 
them directly influences their quality of life. It 
does not take much to conclude that a reduced 
healthcare population obviously cannot keep 
healthy and consequently suffers changes in the 
capacity to maintain their quality of life [13].

3	 �Quality of Life in Patients 
with Wounds

The wound is represented by the interruption of 
the corporeal tissue continuity, to a bigger or 
smaller extent, caused by any physical, chemical, 
and mechanical trauma or caused by a clinical 
affection, which activates the organic defense 
[14]. The healing of lesions involves complex 
anatomical and biological processes that, in a 
favorable clinical situation, can occur in accept-
able time. However, when the lesions become 
chronic, the treatment can become quite compli-
cated, causing an important impact on these 
patients’ lives [15].

Wounds present classifications based on the 
characteristics of the lesion, such as etiology, the 
level of tissue involvement, and the time it lasts. 
As for the healing period, the wounds can be 
classified as acute, which are those that heal in 
less than 6 weeks, and chronic, which heal in a 
time superior to that mentioned [16–18].

Some types of wounds have significant social 
and economic impact, due to their enormous 
potential for chronicity and because they present 
high global prevalences, such as venous ulcers, 
pressure injury, injuries caused by diabetic com-
plications, and burns [19–21]. Chronic ulcers are 
a serious and worldwide problem, responsible for 
significant morbidity and mortality rates, besides 
having a considerable economic impact [22].

The high rates of chronic wounds have par-
ticular relevance, given the Brazilian sociodemo-
graphic characteristics, as a longer life expectancy 
and less healthy, which contribute to the onset of 
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chronic diseases [23]. North American statistics 
indicate a prevalence of 14% of patients with 
wounds in the world population. Other studies 
suggest that the indexes may be higher, around 
22.8% for the next few years [24].

The wound characteristics, such as the pres-
ence of exudate, its odor, pruritus, edema, and the 
extent of it, and the difficulty in performing basic 
activities such as bathing and walking are patient 
complaints that result in changes in lifestyle [25–
27]. In the psychological domain, feelings such 
as fear, anger, depression, anxiety, disturbances, 
and social isolation are exaggerated in this popu-
lation, especially in young people [28].

In a study where the authors evaluated the qual-
ity of life in 50 patients with venous ulcer who are 
being treated with compressive therapy by Unna 
boot, data collection was performed at the time of 
the study inclusion and was repeated at 4 months, 
8 months, and 12 months after the first data collec-
tion using the Short Form 36-item (SF-36) ques-
tionnaire. During the inclusion of the patient in the 
study, the average scores of SF-36 were small [28], 
characterizing a fall in quality of life. After 
12 months of Unna boot compressive therapy, the 
average score was 95.38, characterizing improve-
ment in the quality of life of the analyzed patients 
(p = 0.0001). The authors concluded that patients 
with a venous ulcer at the beginning of data collec-
tion presented low quality of life, and after 
8  months of treatment with the Unna boot, an 
improvement in the quality of life was observed.

The signs and symptoms presented by these 
individuals should not only be treated in the 
physical dimension but also emphasize the 
changes that the wound causes in their life. It is 
important to point out that tissue repair of a 
wound does not always mean an improvement in 
the individual’s quality of life. That’s possibly 
due to other comorbidities. That’s why it is essen-
tial to bring up and care for these impacts caused 
by the wound, minimizing the biological, psy-
chosocial, and emotional problems that directly 
affect their quality of life [29].

As soon as these patients demonstrate some 
dependence on managing activities like domicili-
ary, leisure, social, and family, they will have their 
autonomy impaired and automatically become 
dependent on their relatives and friends, and as a 

consequence, they have a decline in self-esteem 
and impairment of self-image and quality of life.

Diseases usually produce changes in the way 
patients live, especially in those who live with 
these conditions for a long period. The impact of 
chronic ulcers on patients’ quality of life (QOL) 
has been the subject of studies since it involves 
research of many health professionals, known as 
health-related quality of life studies (HRQOL), 
and aims to identify critical aspects of the disease 
process in order to propose interventions that 
minimize suffering and its negative impact on 
patients’ lives.

In the literature review, the HRQOL concept 
is dynamic and multidimensional, without con-
sensus among the authors. It is associated with a 
state of emotional, mental, physical, social, and 
functional dimensions related to health and pres-
ents as synonymous with health perception or 
state of health. Therefore, there is no accurate 
measure of QOL; but it is necessary to evaluate 
the patients’ well-being in these dimensions [27, 
28]. HRQOL is also defined as the value given to 
life, weighted by the functional deteriorations, 
perceptions, and social conditions that are 
induced by the disease, complications, treat-
ments, and the political and economic organiza-
tion of the healthcare system. To measure such 
concepts, questionnaires were designed with the 
objective of evaluating QOL, which are classified 
as generic and specific instruments [29, 30].

In relation to the field of application, the mea-
sures can be classified as generic, if we use 
population-based questionnaires without specify-
ing pathologies, being more appropriate to epide-
miological studies, planning, and evaluation of 
the health system, related to the individuals’ 
quality of daily life, subsequent to the experience 
of diseases, injuries, or medical interventions. 
Several instruments include indicators for sub-
jective aspects of living with illnesses and inju-
ries, such as feelings of shame and guilt, which 
have negative consequences on the perception of 
quality of life on the affected individuals and 
their families [31, 32].

Therefore, the availability of a particular 
instrument to evaluate the quality of life in 
patients with wounds will help with the integral 
care of the patient, and this instrument can be 
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used as an indicator of results on the performance 
of the health system [28].

4	 �Freiburg Life Quality 
Assessment-Wound 
(FLQA-wk)

The FLQA-wk, short version, was developed 
based on the Freiburg Questionnaire of Quality 
of Life in venous diseases, specific for venous 
ulcer and composed of 81 items [33]. For the 
development of FLQA-wk, 10 of the items were 
kept unchanged, 10 were modified, 61 questions 
were extracted, and there were 3 specific items of 
wounds [40]. The FLQA-wk instrument is com-
posed of 24 questions, divided into 6 domains: 
physical symptoms (5 questions), daily life (5 
questions), social life (3 questions), psychological 
well-being (4 questions), satisfaction (3 ques-
tions), and treatment (4 questions) [34].

The domain “physical symptoms” refers to the 
physical well-being of the patient, which can be 
influenced by the condition of the wound. These 
are specific issues: pain, discharge, pruritus, and 
bad smell. The “daily life” scale refers to how the 
wounded individual manages his daily life, while 
“social life” mentions the patient’s relationships 
with other people. Psychological well-being lists 
the feelings that the wounded patient can present. 
The “treatment” domain refers to how the patient 
feels about the treatment offered by the health 
team, and the “satisfaction” scale includes how 
satisfied the individual feels about their health, 
treatment, and wound conditions.

The answers of the “daily life,” “social life,” 
“treatment,” and “satisfaction” scales range from 
never (1 point), few times (2 points), moderately 
(3 points), quite a few (4 points), and a lot (5 
points). For the domains of “psychological well-
being” and “physical symptoms,” we have the 
following answers: never (1 point), rarely (2 
points), sometimes (3 points), often (4 points), or 
always (5 points).

The domain “treatment” has a question that 
evaluates the time spent by the individual to take 
care of his wound; the answers are no time (1 
point), less than 10 min (2 points), 1–30 min (3 

points), 30–60  min (4 points), and more than 
60 min (5 points).

The FLQA-wk can be filled by the patients 
themselves, but, if it is necessary, it can be con-
ducted by the researcher through an interview. To 
calculate the score, it is necessary that 75% of the 
items are answered and that at least five of the six 
scales are complete. It evaluates the quality of 
life of people with chronic wounds in the last 
week. The scales are calculated by the average of 
each answer, after recoding the “satisfaction” 
scale. The total score is computed from the aver-
age values of each domain.

The questionnaire also has three visual analog 
scales, graded from 0 (very bad) to 10 (very 
good). The individual evaluates his/her quality of 
life, general health, and wound conditions in the 
last week. This scale helps in the control of values 
of the domains, that is, the values are compared 
with the score of the whole instrument. The higher 
the value of the score, the bigger the interference 
with quality of life. The score varies from 1 (bet-
ter quality of life) to 5 (worse quality of life).

The validation occurred in three distinct studies 
with individuals with acute and chronic wounds. 
The first study is a multicenter, uncontrolled 
research conducted with 175 patients. The research 
consisted of the evaluation of the quality of life of 
patients with acute and chronic wounds treated 
with vacuum therapy. Patients answered the ques-
tionnaire, and physicians filled an instrument on 
wound conditions, both before and after therapy 
[34]. The tests for validation in this research were 
the internal consistency, the convergent validity 
through the correlation of the FLQA-wk items 
with a generic instrument of quality of life, and the 
items of the visual analog scale. The ability to 
detect changes in the quality of life according to 
the patient’s clinical alterations was performed by 
comparing the FLQA-wk with these variables: 
wound area and conditions, generic quality-of-life 
instruments, and global evaluation of quality of 
life of the visual analog scale.

A cross-sectional observational study of 384 
patients with lower limb ulcers undergoing dif-
ferent treatments also evaluated the psychometric 
properties of FLQA-wk. Patients and physicians 
completed the questionnaires only in a moment. 
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The tests performed were internal consistency, 
convergent validity through the correlation of the 
FLQA-wk with visual analog scale items, and 
pain intensity (ranges from 0 to 10) [34].

And finally, a multicenter, randomized 
research verified the efficiency and safety of 
keratinocyte transplantation along with compres-
sive therapy in 198 venous ulcer patients. The 
patients answered the questionnaires on 0 (time 
1), on the 28th (time 2), and 56th (time 3) day of 
therapy. At times 1 and 2, all subjects received 
the treatment; from time 2 to 3, the patients were 
randomized. The tests performed were the inter-
nal consistency, test-retest, and sensitivity 
through the correlation of the FLQA-wk items 
with the success score in the treatment, scored 
from 1 (very successful) to 5 (no success), and 
FLQA-wk before and after treatment [34].

The questionnaire presented proper internal 
consistency in the three studies, with values 
≥0.85. The test-retest and the validity were satis-
factory [34].

5	 �Technique

5.1	 �Cultural Adaptation 
Procedures

The translation and cultural adaptation process 
of the FLQA-wk were carried out according to 
the methodological rules recommended by 
internationally recognized publications [35–39]. 
The following steps were carried out: transla-
tion, synthesis of translations, back translation, 
committee of experts, pretest, and focus group. 
It is pointed out that the author of the question-
naire was previously consulted and the authori-
zation was provided to be adapted and validated 
for the Portuguese language of Brazil.

5.2	 �Translation of the Instrument 
into Portuguese

For the accomplishment of this stage, the first 
translation of the FLQA-wk instrument for the 

Portuguese language of Brazil was carried out by 
two independent, qualified, and bilingual transla-
tors, whose native language is Portuguese. Two 
independent translations were conducted, one of 
the translators was a nurse with knowledge in the 
area of wounds, and the other one was a language 
teacher, who was not from the area and did not 
know the purpose of the work [35, 37] resulting 
in two versions: Translation 1 (T1) and Translation 
2 (T2).

5.3	 �Translation Synthesis

Following the translation stage, the two versions 
(T1 and T2) were synthesized. The analysis of 
the divergences of both versions was carried out 
by the two translators, with the researcher who 
reached a consensus, producing a different trans-
lation, synthesis version (SV).

5.4	 �Back Translation

The synthesis version (SV) of the instrument 
obtained by consensus was again translated into 
the original language of the instrument by two 
other translators who did not participate in the 
first stage of the process. This procedure checked 
the validity to ensure that the translated final ver-
sion is in agreement with the original version of 
the instrument.

The back translation was carried out by 
two bilingual translators who had the same 
mother tongue as the adapted questionnaire 
and had knowledge of Portuguese language. 
Both were not from the health area and didn’t 
know about the concepts and objectives of 
the research, performing the translations 
independently.

The questionnaire was also sent by e-mail to 
the authors to verify the adequacy of their origi-
nal content. It is worth mentioning that the 
authors requested the instrument in the 
Portuguese language version so that one of their 
translators could perform a back translation. At 
the end of this stage, the versions back transla-
tion 1 (BT1) and back translation 2 (BT2) were 
produced.
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Thus, the probability of imperfections 
decreased, having the quality guarantee of the 
cultural adaptation of the instrument chosen for 
this research [35, 39].

5.5	 �Committee of Experts

The committee of experts components are crucial 
to achieve transcultural equivalence of the trans-
lated instrument and should be made up of bilin-
gual people and specialists from the knowledge 
area of the instrument, composed of health pro-
fessionals, language teacher, and methodology 
specialist [35, 37]. This committee should be 
multidisciplinary and informed about the objec-
tives and concepts of the study.

At first, the experts received an invitation let-
ter to participate as a member of the committee of 
experts. After they had accepted, the specialists 
received all versions of the instrument: transla-
tions into Portuguese (T1 and T2), synthesis (SV) 
and back translations (BT1 and BT2), and a ques-
tionnaire for evaluation, which was developed 
specifically for this stage.

Judges reviewed and compared all translated 
versions modifying the format of the instrument 
and changing or deleting the inappropriate items 
for a final translation. The committee’s work 
aims to determine the semantic, linguistic, cul-
tural, and conceptual equivalence between the 
original questionnaire and the Portuguese ver-
sion, to guarantee the understanding and cultural 
equivalence of the final version [35, 38].

Semantic equivalence is related to the mean-
ing of words, considering the vocabulary and 
grammar, and the idiomatic equivalence consid-
ers the use of idioms and colloquial expressions 
referring to both languages. In cultural equiva-
lence, the events mentioned in the items of the 
original questionnaire must be according to the 
Brazilian cultural experience. Conceptual equiv-
alence is the pertinence appreciation of the con-
cepts and the events experienced by the subjects 
that are part of Brazilian culture [35].

To facilitate evaluation by the committee, the 
questionnaire was split into items, that is, each 
question answered one item. The title was the 

first item; the general statement was the second 
item, and so on. The full questionnaire consisted 
of 42 items.

The committee of experts was formed by:

Judge 1: Nurse, university professor with experi-
ence in the care area in wound 	 treatment

Judge 2: Language teacher
Judge 3: Nurse, Ph.D. in nursing, university pro-

fessor with experience in research 
methodology

Judge 4: Nurse, Ph.D. in nursing, with experi-
ence in studies about quality of life and older 
adults

Judge 5: Nurse, master in nursing, university pro-
fessor, with experience in the area of care and 
studies related to wounds and therapeutic 
communication

Judge 6: Nurse, enterostomy therapist, university 
professor, with experience in the care area and 
studies related to wounds, incontinence, and 
stoma

Judge 7: Nurse, master of nursing, university profes-
sor with experience in studies on quality of life

Judge 8: Nurse, master in nursing, university 
professor with experience in research 
methodology

After that, the content of the instrument was 
validated. The content validity verifies the 
degree of extension which the subject of inter-
est is contemplated in the dimensions of the 
instrument [40]. This type of validity refers to a 
careful analysis of an instrument with the 
objective of verifying if the items and subitems 
proposed have a representative within the 
instrument [41, 42].

Independently, the judges carried out the analy-
sis of the items, verifying their clarity, pertinence, 
and comprehensiveness, besides evaluating the 
overall appearance of the instrument. The content 
validity was assessed by calculating the content 
validity index (CVI). This test evaluates the level 
of concordance among judges on certain aspects 
of the adapted questionnaire and its items [42].

The judges scored the items with values ​from 
1 to 4: 1, not equivalent; 2, it is impossible to 
evaluate equivalence without reviewing the item; 
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3, equivalent, but it needs minor changes; and 4, 
absolutely equivalent.

The score was calculated by summing the 
items that were highlighted with “3” and “4” 
dividing the value by the number of judges. The 
items with grades “1” and “2” were reviewed. For 
the research, the level of agreement was set equal 
to or higher than 0.8 [42, 43].

Thus, after the experts’ assessment, we had a 
first translated version (VT1) of the instrument, 
which was used for the pretest.

5.6	 �Retest

The final stage of the adaptation process con-
sisted of the pretest when the questionnaire was 
applied to a sample of subjects with wounds that 
were not part of the final sample of the study. For 
this phase, the authors advocated a total of 30–40 
people [35, 37].

Patients who agreed to participate in the pre-
test received guidance on the informed consent 
form and explanation of the purpose of the 
research. The purpose of this stage was to evalu-
ate participants’ understanding and acceptance of 
the content of the translated version, verifying in 
practice how it will be managed. At the end of 
each completed questionnaire, the participant 
expressed his/her difficulties in understanding 
the questions of the questionnaire.

5.7	 �Focus Group

Due to the difficulties of understanding presented 
by the interviewees during the pretest related to 
the items of the questionnaire, it was decided to 
carry out a focus group with the purpose of 
adjusting the questionnaire to the highlighted 
population, for comprehensibility.

The focus group is a qualitative method that 
aims to obtain data from the discussion focused 
on specific points. In order to do this, there must 
be an interaction between the researcher and the 
research participants. The number of participants 
may vary from 6 to 10, and the members of the 
focal group should have similar characteristics 

and be related to the item to be studied [44]. In 
this study specifically, the focus group was car-
ried out to assist in the adaptation of a quantita-
tive questionnaire which needed to be improved 
to facilitate the understanding of the study popu-
lation. The steps for this group consist of the 
assembly, conduction of the group, and, finally, 
the data analysis. Recruitment was carried out by 
invitation to individuals performing dressing on a 
skin lesion unit.

5.8	 �Evaluation of Measurement 
Properties

The psychometric properties of the FLQA-wk 
questionnaire were evaluated through reliability 
and convergent validity.

5.9	 �Reliability Assessment

The reliability, also called accuracy and reliabil-
ity of the instrument [40, 45], refers to the “degree 
of consistency or precision with which the instru-
ment measures the attribute it proposes to mea-
sure” [40]. The reliability of the questionnaire 
was evaluated using two methods: homogeneity 
(internal consistency) and stability (test-retest).

Internal consistency or homogeneity analyzes 
whether all items in an instrument measure the 
same characteristic [46, 47] or the degree of 
interrelationship between items [45]. It was veri-
fied by calculating Cronbach’s alpha coefficient 
for the total score (Cronbach, 1951), and 
Cronbach’s alpha higher than or equal to 0.70 
was considered interesting [48, 49].

Stability refers to the consistency of the mea-
surements’ repetitions. The use of this method 
requires that the factor to be measured remains 
the same as applied to a sample of subjects at 
two different times, comparing the results 
obtained [41].

Stability was evaluated through the test-retest, 
calculating the intraclass correlation coefficient 
(ICC). The FLQA-wk questionnaire was carried 
out in 71 subjects under the same conditions, 
within a 7-day interval.
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6	 �Validity Assessment 
of FLQA-Wk

Validity is an important measure property to eval-
uate the quality of an instrument [41], and it 
refers to the degree to which the data of an instru-
ment actually measures what it is proposed to 
[39, 40, 46].

The convergence construct validity consists of 
comparing how one dimension of a new instru-
ment correlates with dimensions of another 
instrument that measures the same concept, and it 
is applied concomitantly [39, 41, 50]. The con-
vergent validity was carried out through the cor-
relation of the four domains of Ferrans and 
Powers Quality of Life Index-Wound Version 
(health and functioning, psychological and spiri-
tual, family and socioeconomic) with the domains 
of the FLQA-wk questionnaire. The domains 
Ferrans and Powers Quality of Life Index-Wound 
Version (FPQLI-WV) instruments were chosen, 
taking into account the similarity of the content 
of these domains with the FLQA-wk question-
naire, as shown in Table 1.

Validity was also evaluated by correlating the 
total score of the FLQA-wk questionnaire with 
the patient’s score on the visual analog scale 
(VAS) of quality of life. This scale complements 

the FLQA-wk instrument and scores the individ-
ual’s quality of life from 0 (very poor) to 10 (very 
good) (Table 2).

7	 �Discussion

The evaluation of the quality of life in health, 
mainly in the treatment of wounds, has been 
gaining more space in the clinic, therapeutics, 
and research services, providing the necessary 
assistance to the patient by the professionals [51]. 
Therefore, the application of instruments can be 
considered an objective measure that assists in 
the evaluation of the patient’s well-being, con-
tributing to quality intervention [52].

In this context, the cultural adaptation of any 
instrument is effective but complex and with 
different recommended methods in the literature 
[38]. In this research, this process followed the 
steps of translation, translation synthesis, back 
translation, committee of experts evaluation, pre-
test, and focus group [35].

The content validity was carried out with the 
help of a committee of judges that proved that the 
questionnaire contains relevant questions, and small 
changes were made in some items to facilitate the 
understanding of the highlighted population.

Table 1  Correlations of the FPQLI-WV domains indicated for the achievement of the convergent validity of the 
Freiburg Life Quality Assessment-Wound questionnaire

Questionnaire Domains Freiburg life quality assessment-wound (FLQA-wk)—adapted
Ferrans and powers 
quality of life index-
wound version

Health and 
functioning

X Physical symptoms

Health and 
functioning

X Daily life

Health and 
functioning

X Treatment

Health and 
functioning

X Social life

Psychological/
spiritual

X Psychological well-being

Psychological/
spiritual

X Satisfaction

Socioeconomic X Satisfaction
Family X Psychological well-being
Health and 
functioning

X Total score

Total score X Total score
Total score X Psychological well-being
Total score X Satisfaction
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The committee suggested small changes in items, 
such as synonym substitutions, sentence inversions, 
and some spelling mistakes following semantic, cul-
tural, conceptual, and idiomatic equivalences. 
Considering the agreement rate >0.80, the committee 
of experts suggested small changes in some ques-

tions, which were followed. After these changes, 
Version I was created, which was used in the pretest.

The pretest included 30 subjects with chronic 
wounds of different etiologies. The individuals’ 
average age was 63.0 years old (standard devia-
tion = 12.8), represented by 79.3% female, 41.4% 

Translation
2=T2

Original Instrument

– Nurse, bilingual, mother
tongue Portuguese.
– Experience in the field
– Knowledge of the objectives
and concepts of the work

– Bilingual
– Qualified professionals.
– Mother tongue English.
– Without knowledge of
the objectives and concepts
of the work.

– Professor of Bilingual
Languages, mother tongue
Portuguese
– No experience in the area.
– Without knowledge of the
objectives and concepts of 
the work.

Translation
1=T1

Synthesis of translations=
ST

Expert committee
(8 judges)

Version I

Pretest
n=30

Focus Group

Final version
translated

Backtranslation 1=
BT1

Backtranslation 2=
BT2

Author instrument

FINAL VERSION

Table 2  Flowchart of the transcultural translation process

Cultural Adaptation and Validation of the Freiburg Life Quality Assessment-Wound Module to Brazilian Portuguese



186

married, and 69.0% with incomplete primary 
education. The venous ulcer presented a higher 
frequency with 58.6%. The average wound dura-
tion was 42 months (standard deviation = 63.7) 
and with an average number of 1.5 wounds.

Patients with different levels of schooling 
were selected to allow evaluation of the 
questionnaire in different degrees of difficulty. 
Five patients attended the meeting, the average 
age was 65.4  years, and the educational attain-
ment levels of the participants were two illiter-
ates, two with incomplete elementary education, 
and one with complete higher education.

The instrument was applied by interview, and 
5–10 min was spent for the application. At the end 
of the interview, participants were asked to express 
their opinions on the questionnaire verbally. 
Patients reported that some words made it difficult 
to understand the questions. Due to these difficul-
ties presented by the participants in the compre-
hension of some questions, which could produce 
false results in the analysis of the questionnaire, it 
was decided to carry out a focus group, to adapt 
the instrument to the specific population.

The focus group was started explaining the pur-
pose of the meeting and the importance of each 
participation. The questions of the instrument 
were read separately and in an easy way to facili-
tate the follow-up by all, enabling them to under-
stand what was intended with the focus group.

Conducting the focus group were one modera-
tor and two observers. The moderator was respon-
sible for reading the questionnaire and discussion, 
while the observers analyzed expressions during 
the discussion. The whole session was recorded 
with the permission of the attendees. The discus-
sion lasted 1 h and 10 min, and the questionnaire 
was analyzed and discussed twice. During the 
reading of the instrument to each question, the par-
ticipant was asked about the comprehension of the 
content. According to the reports, associated with 
the nonverbal expressions that indicated doubt, the 
item was discussed and they requested to vote for 
possible changes. After this step, the final trans-
lated version (FTV) was elaborated – which was 
sent to back translation to evaluate the discrepan-
cies between the FTV and the original instrument.

The FVT was sent to one of the authors for 
consideration. Small changes were requested in 

the Portuguese questionnaire so that the cultural 
adaptation of the Freiburg Life Quality 
Assessment-Wound (FLQA-wk) questionnaire, 
abbreviated version, reflected the content of the 
original version. After the changes in the ques-
tionnaire, the final version (FV) was created.

Regarding the medical properties, the reliabil-
ity of the FLQA-wk was evaluated through the 
internal consistency, represented by Cronbach’s 
alpha, and the stability, through the test-retest, 
using the intraclass correlation coefficient (ICC).

The adapted instrument (FLQA-wk), contain-
ing 24 items, presented an excellent internal con-
sistency since it obtained a total Cronbach’s alpha 
of 0.86. In relation to the domains, the Cronbach’s 
alpha was physical symptoms, 0.63; daily life, 
0.83; social life, 0.53; psychological well-being, 
0.70; treatment, 0.68; and satisfaction, 0.86.

Concerning stability evaluation, a high value of 
ICC (0.93) is contacted, which is considered excel-
lent, since the closer to 1, the better the stability of the 
instrument [46]. The adapted questionnaire showed 
temporal stability when applied in different moments 
for the same participants in similar conditions.

The convergent validity was evaluated by car-
rying out the FLQA-wk correlation with the 
Ferrans and Powers Quality of Life Index-Wound 
Version, as well as the quality of life score of the 
visual analog scale. The analysis was carried out 
using Spearman’s correlation coefficient.

Correlations appear as negative or inverse rela-
tionships since the FLQA-wk score indicates that 
the higher the score, the worse the quality of life, 
whereas in the FPQLI-WV, the score is the opposite: 
the higher the score, the better the quality of life.

The correlation of FLQA-wk with the 
FPQLI-WV domains. The treatment domains 
(−0.32), daily life (−031), physical symptoms 
(−0.27), social life (−0.24), and the total score 
(−0.41) of the FLQA-wk presented satisfactory 
to moderate correlation and significant with the 
health and functioning domain of FPQLI-WV.

The psychological well-being domain of 
FLQA-wk had a moderate and significant corre-
lation with the psychological/spiritual domains 
(−0.44), family (−0.38), and the total score 
(−0.40) of FPQLI-WV.

The domain satisfaction showed a moderate 
and significant correlation with the psychological/
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spiritual domains (−0.48), socioeconomic (−0.46), 
and total score (−0.37) of the IQVFP-VF.  The 
total score (0.36) of the FLQA-wk had a moderate 
correlation with the total FPQLI-WV score.

Concerning the visual analog scale, the 
FLQA-wk total score had a moderate and signifi-
cant correlation with the total quality of life score 
(−0.38).

�Conclusions
The cultural adaptation of the Freiburg Life 
Quality Assessment-Wound was performed 
according to the recommended international 
methodology, resulting in a real version. In the 
application, the instrument proved to be easy 
to understand and apply.

The questionnaire was found to be reli-
able, with a Cronbach’s alpha (0.87) and sat-
isfactory temporal stability (0.93). 
Concerning the validity, the adapted 
FLQA-wk questionnaire presented a correla-
tion of satisfactory magnitude to moderate 
magnitude and significant (−0.24 to −0.48; 
p  <  0.0001) with the domains of the 
IQVFP-VF questionnaire.

Therefore, FLQA-wk presented enough 
healing properties when applied in patients with 
chronic wounds in the Brazilian population.
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